
SERVICES OFFERED

DIRECTV - Every live foot-
ball game, every Sunday -
anywhere - on your favor-
ite device. Restrictions ap-
ply. Call IVS - 1-888-641-
5762. (Cal-SCAN)

The difference in winning
and losing market share is
how businesses use their
a d v e r t i s i n g d o l l a r s .
CNPA’s Advertising Ser-
vices’ power to connect to
nearly 13 million of the
state’s readers who are an
engaged audience, makes
our services an indispens-
able marketing solution.
For more info call Cecelia
@ (916) 288-6011 or ce-
celia@cnpa.com.

ANNOUNCEMENTS

RETIRED COUPLE $$$$
for business purpose Real
Estate loans. Credit unim-
portant. V.I.P. Trust Deed
Company www.viploan.
com Call 818 248-0000.
Broker -p r inc ipa l BRE
01041073. (Cal-SCAN)

SERVICES OFFERED

SAVE BIG on HOME IN-
SURANCE! Compare 20
A-rated insurances com-
panies. Get a quote within
minutes. Average savings
of $444/year! Call 1-844-
410-9609! (M-F 8am-8pm
Central) (Cal-SCAN)

ANNOUNCEMENTS

DONATE YOUR CAR,
BOAT OR RV to receive a
major tax deduction. Help
homeless pets. Local, IRS
Recognized. Top Value
Guaranteed. Free Estim-
ate and Pickup. LAPET-
SALIVE.ORG 1-833-772-
2632 (Cal-SCAN)

Eliminate gutter cleaning
forever! LeafFilter, the
most advanced debris-
blocking gutter protection.
Schedule a FREE LeafFil-
ter estimate today. 15% off
Ent ire Purchase. 10%
Senior & Mil i tary Dis-
counts. Call 1-855-424-
7581 (Cal-SCAN)

ANNOUNCEMENTS

Become a Published Au-
thor. We want to Read
Your Book! Dorrance Pub-
lishing-Trusted by Authors
Since 1920 Book manu-
script submissions cur-
rently being reviewed.
Comprehensive Services:
Consultation, Production,
Promotion and Distribu-
tion. Call for Your Free Au-
thor`s Guide 1-877-538-
9554 or visit http://dor-
ranceinfo.com/Cali. (Cal-
SCAN)

The difference in winning
and losing market share is
how businesses use their
advertising dollars. We de-
liver the largest consorti-
um of trusted news pub-
lishers in California and
beyond. For more info on
multi-market solutions call
Cecelia @ (916) 288-6011
or cecelia@cnpa.com.

HEALTH/FITNESS

Attention: Oxygen Users!
Gain freedom with a Port-
able Oxygen Concentrator!
No more heavy tanks and
refills! Guaranteed Lowest
Prices! Call the Oxygen
Concentrator Store: 1-844-
653-7402 (Cal-SCAN)

ANNOUNCEMENTS

Become a Published Au-
thor. We want to Read
Your Book! Dorrance Pub-
lishing-Trusted by Authors
Since 1920 Book manu-
script submissions cur-
rently being reviewed.
Comprehensive Services:
Consultation, Production,
Promotion and Distribu-
tion. Call for Your Free Au-
thor`s Guide 1-877-538-
9554 or visit http://dor-
ranceinfo.com/Cali. (Cal-
SCAN)

HEALTH/FITNESS

ATTENTION DIABETICS!
Save money on your dia-
betic supplies! Convenient
home shipping for monit-
ors, test strips, insulin
pumps, catheters and
more! To learn more, call
now! 1-855-702-3408.
(Cal -SCAN)

Stay in your home longer
with an American Stand-
ard Walk-In Bathtub. Re-
ceive up to $1,500 off, in-
cluding a free toilet, and a
lifetime warranty on the
tub and installation! Call us
at 1-844-252-0740. (Cal-
SCAN)

AUTOS WANTED

DONATE YOUR CAR OR
TRUCK TO HERITAGE
FOR THE BLIND. FREE 3
Day Vacation, Tax Deduct-
ible, Free Towing, All Pa-
perwork Taken Care of.
Call 1-844-491-2884 (Cal-
SCAN)

HEALTH/FITNESS

Lowest Prices on Health
Insurance. We have the
best rates from top com-
panies! Call Now! 888-
989-4807. (Cal-SCAN)



Legals-NE

APN: 936-20-172 TS No:
CA05000085-23-1 TO No:
230101133-CA-VOI NO-
TICE OF TRUSTEE'S
SALE (The above state-
ment is made pursuant to
CA Civil Code Section
2923.3(d)(1). The Sum-
mary will be provided to
Trustor(s) and/or vested
owner(s) only, pursuant to
CA Civil Code Section
2923.3(d)(2).) YOU ARE
IN DEFAULT UNDER A
DEED OF TRUST DATED
October 28, 2016. UN-
LESS YOU TAKE AC-
T I O N T O P R O T E C T
YOUR PROPERTY, IT
MAY BE SOLD AT A PUB-
LIC SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
P R O C E E D I N G S
AGAINST YOU, YOU
SHOULD CONTACT A
LAWYER. On November
13, 2023 at 09:00 AM,
A u c t i o n . c o m R o o m ,
Doubletree by Hilton Hotel
Anaheim - Orange County,
100 The City Drive, Or-
ange, CA 92868, MTC Fin-
ancial Inc. dba Trustee
Corps, as the duly Appoin-
ted Trustee, under and
pursuant to the power of
sale contained in that cer-
tain Deed of Trust Recor-
ded on November 2, 2016
a s I n s t r u m e n t N o .
2016000543818, of offi-
cial records in the Office of
the Recorder of Orange
County, California, ex-
ecuted by JIMMY HUA, A
S I N G L E M A N , a s
Trustor(s), in favor of
MORTGAGE ELECTRON-
IC REGISTRATION SYS-
TEMS, INC., as Benefi-
ciary, as nominee for DBR
L O A N D B A D I R E C T
BANK RATE as Benefi-
ciary, WILL SELL AT PUB-
LIC AUCTION TO THE
HIGHEST BIDDER, in law-
ful money of the United
States, all payable at the
time of sale, that certain
property situated in said
County, California describ-
ing the land therein as: AS
M O R E F U L L Y D E -
SCRIBED IN SAID DEED
OF TRUST The property
heretofore described is be-
ing sold “as is”. The street
address and other com-
mon designation, if any, of
the real proper ty de-
scribed above is purpor-
ted to be: 7909 CERRI-
TOS AVE #24, STANTON,
CA 90680 The under-
signed Trustee disclaims
any liability for any incor-
rectness of the street ad-
dress and other common
designation, if any, shown
herein. Said sale will be
made without covenant or
warranty, express or im-
plied, regarding title, pos-
session, or encumbrances,
to pay the remaining prin-
cipal sum of the Note(s)
secured by said Deed of
Trust, with interest there-
on, as provided in said
Note(s), advances if any,
under the terms of the
Deed of Trust, estimated
fees, charges and ex-
penses of the Trustee and
of the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust.&emsp;
The total amount of the
unpaid balance of the ob-
ligations secured by the
property to be sold and
reasonable est imated
costs, expenses and ad-
vances at the time of the
initial publication of this
Notice of Trustee’s Sale is
e s t i m a t e d t o b e
$320,377.65 (Estimated).
However, prepayment
premiums, accrued in-
terest and advances will
increase this figure prior to
sale. Beneficiary’s bid at
said sale may include all
or part of said amount. In
addition to cash, the Trust-
ee will accept a cashier’s
check drawn on a state or
national bank, a check
drawn by a state or feder-
al credit union or a check
drawn by a state or feder-
al savings and loan asso-
ciation, savings associ-
ation or savings bank spe-
cified in Section 5102 of
the California Financial
Code and authorized to do
business in California, or
other such funds as may
be acceptable to the Trust-
ee. In the event tender
other than cash is accep-
ted, the Trustee may with-
hold the issuance of the
Trustee’s Deed Upon Sale
until funds become avail-
able to the payee or en-
dorsee as a matter of right.
The property offered for
sale excludes all funds
held on account by the
property receiver, if applic-
able. If the Trustee is un-
able to convey title for any
reason, the successful bid-
der’s sole and exclusive
remedy shall be the return
of monies paid to the
Trustee and the success-
ful bidder shall have no
further recourse. Notice to
Potential Bidders If you
are considering bidding on
this property l ien, you
should understand that
there are risks involved in
bidding at a Trustee auc-
tion. You will be bidding on
a lien, not on the property
itself. Placing the highest
bid at a Trustee auction
does not automatically en-
title you to free and clear
ownership of the property.
You should also be aware
that the lien being auc-
tioned off may be a junior
lien. If you are the highest
bidder at the auction, you
are or may be responsible
for paying off all liens seni-
or to the lien being auc-
tioned off, before you can
receive clear title to the
property. You are encour-
aged to investigate the ex-
istence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens that
may exist on this property
by contacting the county
recorder's office or a title
insurance company, either
of which may charge you a
fee for this information. If
you consult either of these
resources, you should be
aware that the same
Lender may hold more
than one mortgage or
Deed of Trust on the prop-
erty. Notice to Property
Owner The sale date
shown on this Notice of
Sale may be postponed
one or more times by the
Mortgagee, Beneficiary,
Trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 2924g of the
California Civil Code. The
law requires that informa-
tion about Trustee Sale
postponements be made
available to you and to the
public, as a courtesy to
those not present at the
sale. If you wish to learn
whether your sale date
has been postponed, and,
if applicable, the resched-
uled time and date for the
sale of this property, you
may call Auction.com at
800.280.2832 for informa-
t i o n r e g a r d i n g t h e
Trustee's Sale or visit the
Internet Website address
www.Auction.com for in-
formation regarding the
sale of this property, using
the file number assigned
to this case, CA05000085-
23-1. Information about
postponements that are
very short in duration or
that occur close in time to
the scheduled sale may
not immediately be reflec-
ted in the telephone in-
formation or on the Inter-
net Website. The best way
to verify postponement in-
formation is to attend the
scheduled sale.&emsp;
Notice to Tenant NOTICE
TO TENANT FOR FORE-
C L O S U R E S A F T E R
JANUARY 1, 2021 You
may have a right to pur-
chase this property after
the trustee auction pursu-
ant to Section 2924m of
the California Civil Code. If
you are an “eligible tenant
buyer,” you can purchase
the property if you match
the last and highest bid
placed at the trustee auc-
tion. If you are an “eligible
bidder,” you may be able
to purchase the property if
you exceed the last and
highest bid placed at the
trustee auction. There are
three steps to exercising
this right of purchase.
First, 48 hours after the
date of the trustee sale,
you can call 800.280.2832,
or visit this internet web-
site www.Auction.com, us-
ing the file number as-
s i g n e d t o t h i s c a s e
CA05000085-23-1 to find
the date on which the
trustee’s sale was held,
the amount of the last and
highest bid, and the ad-
dress of the t rus tee.
Second, you must send a
written notice of intent to
place a bid so that the
trustee receives it no more
than 15 days after the
trustee’s sale. Third, you
must submit a bid so that
the trustee receives it no
more than 45 days after
the trustee’s sale. If you
think you may qualify as
an “eligible tenant buyer”
or “eligible bidder,” you
should consider contact-
ing an attorney or appro-
priate real estate profes-
sional immediately for ad-
vice regarding this poten-
tial right to purchase. Date:
October 11, 2023 MTC
Financial Inc. dba Trustee
C o r p s T S N o .
CA05000085-23-1 17100
Gillette Ave Irvine, CA
92614 Phone: 949-252-
8 3 0 0 T D D : 7 1 1
949.252.8300 By: Loan
Quema, Authorized Sig-
natory SALE INFORMA-
T I O N C A N B E O B -
T A I N E D O N L I N E A T
www.Auction.com FOR
AUTOMATED SALES IN-
FORMATION PLEASE
CALL: Auct ion.com at
8 0 0 . 2 8 0 . 2 8 3 2
NPP0441884 To: THE
E V E N T N E W S
10/18/2023, 10/25/2023,
11/01/2023
E v e n t  N e w s
1 0 / 1 8 , 2 5 , 1 1 / 1 / 2 0 2 3 -
1 3 5 7 9 5
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LAWYER. On November
13, 2023 at 09:00 AM,
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time of sale, that certain
property situated in said
County, California describ-
ing the land therein as: AS
M O R E F U L L Y D E -
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heretofore described is be-
ing sold “as is”. The street
address and other com-
mon designation, if any, of
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TOS AVE #24, STANTON,
CA 90680 The under-
signed Trustee disclaims
any liability for any incor-
rectness of the street ad-
dress and other common
designation, if any, shown
herein. Said sale will be
made without covenant or
warranty, express or im-
plied, regarding title, pos-
session, or encumbrances,
to pay the remaining prin-
cipal sum of the Note(s)
secured by said Deed of
Trust, with interest there-
on, as provided in said
Note(s), advances if any,
under the terms of the
Deed of Trust, estimated
fees, charges and ex-
penses of the Trustee and
of the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust.&emsp;
The total amount of the
unpaid balance of the ob-
ligations secured by the
property to be sold and
reasonable est imated
costs, expenses and ad-
vances at the time of the
initial publication of this
Notice of Trustee’s Sale is
e s t i m a t e d t o b e
$320,377.65 (Estimated).
However, prepayment
premiums, accrued in-
terest and advances will
increase this figure prior to
sale. Beneficiary’s bid at
said sale may include all
or part of said amount. In
addition to cash, the Trust-
ee will accept a cashier’s
check drawn on a state or
national bank, a check
drawn by a state or feder-
al credit union or a check
drawn by a state or feder-
al savings and loan asso-
ciation, savings associ-
ation or savings bank spe-
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Code and authorized to do
business in California, or
other such funds as may
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ted, the Trustee may with-
hold the issuance of the
Trustee’s Deed Upon Sale
until funds become avail-
able to the payee or en-
dorsee as a matter of right.
The property offered for
sale excludes all funds
held on account by the
property receiver, if applic-
able. If the Trustee is un-
able to convey title for any
reason, the successful bid-
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shown on this Notice of
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one or more times by the
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Trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 2924g of the
California Civil Code. The
law requires that informa-
tion about Trustee Sale
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public, as a courtesy to
those not present at the
sale. If you wish to learn
whether your sale date
has been postponed, and,
if applicable, the resched-
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you exceed the last and
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think you may qualify as
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NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER ES-
TATE OF ORVILLE

COLLINS ALLISON aka
ORVILLE C. ALLISON

Case No. 30-2023-
01353721-PR-PW-CMC

To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors, contingent cred-
itors, and persons who
may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate,
or both , o f ORVILLE
COLLINS ALLISON aka
ORVILLE C. ALLISON
A PETITION FOR PRO-
BATE has been filed by
Gary E. Dixon in the Su-
perior Court of California,
County of ORANGE.
THE PETIT ION FOR
PROBATE requests that
Gary E. Dixon be appoin-
ted as personal represent-
ative to administer the es-
tate of the decedent.
THE PETITION requests
the decedent's lost will and
codicils, if any, be admit-
ted to probate. Copies of
the lost will and any codi-
cils are available for exam-
ination in the file kept by
the court.
THE PETITION requests
authority to administer the
estate under the Inde-
pendent Administration of
Estates Act. (This author-
ity will allow the personal
representat ive to take
many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Be-
fore taking certain very im-
portant actions, however,
the personal representat-
ive will be required to give
notice to interested per-
sons unless they have
waived notice or consen-
ted to the p roposed
action.) The independent
administration authority
will be granted unless an
interested person files an
objection to the petition
and shows good cause
why the court should not
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the peti-
tion will be held on Dec.
14, 2023 at 1:30 PM in
Dept. No. CM06 located at
3390 HARBOR BLVD,
COSTA MESA CA 92626.
The court is providing the
convenience to appear for
hearing by video using the
court's designated video
platform. This is a no cost
service to the public. Go to
the Court's website at the
Superior Court of Califor-
nia - County of Orange
(occourts.org) to appear
remotely for Probate hear-
ings and for remote hear-
ing instructions. If you
have difficulty connecting
or are unable to connect to
your remote hearing, call
657-622-8278 for assist-
ance. If you prefer to ap-
pear in-person, you can
appear in the department
on the day/time set for
your hearing.
IF YOU OBJECT to the
granting of the petition,
you should appear at the
hearing and state your ob-
jections or file written ob-
jections with the court be-
fore the hearing. Your ap-
pearance may be in per-
son or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDIT-
OR or a contingent credit-
or of the decedent, you
must file your claim with
the court and mail a copy
to the personal represent-
ative appointed by the
court within the later of
either (1) four months from
the date of first issuance of
letters to a general person-
a l representa t ive , as
defined in section 58(b) of
the Cali fornia Probate
Code, or (2) 60 days from
the date of mailing or per-
sonal delivery to you of a
notice under section 9052
of the California Probate
Code.
Other California statutes
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a credit-
or. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney know-
ledgeable in California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the
file kept by the court. If you
are a person interested in
the estate, you may file
with the court a Request
for Special Notice (form
DE-154) of the filing of an
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any pe-
t i t i on o r accoun t a s
provided in Probate Code
section 1250. A Request
for Special Notice form is
available from the court
clerk.
Attorney for petitioner:
JAMES E SWICK ESQ
SBN 62967
LAW OFFICES OF
JAMES E SWICK
2 7 5 0 B E L L F L O W E R
B L V D
STE 100
LONG BEACH CA 90815
CN100931 COLLINS Oct
18,25, Nov 1, 2023
N e w s  E n t e r p r i s e
1 0 / 1 8 , 2 5 , 1 1 / 1 / 2 0 2 3 -
1 3 5 7 7 3
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pursuant to the power of
sale contained in that cer-
tain Deed of Trust Recor-
ded on November 2, 2016
a s I n s t r u m e n t N o .
2016000543818, of offi-
cial records in the Office of
the Recorder of Orange
County, California, ex-
ecuted by JIMMY HUA, A
S I N G L E M A N , a s
Trustor(s), in favor of
MORTGAGE ELECTRON-
IC REGISTRATION SYS-
TEMS, INC., as Benefi-
ciary, as nominee for DBR
L O A N D B A D I R E C T
BANK RATE as Benefi-
ciary, WILL SELL AT PUB-
LIC AUCTION TO THE
HIGHEST BIDDER, in law-
ful money of the United
States, all payable at the
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dress and other common
designation, if any, shown
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plied, regarding title, pos-
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to pay the remaining prin-
cipal sum of the Note(s)
secured by said Deed of
Trust, with interest there-
on, as provided in said
Note(s), advances if any,
under the terms of the
Deed of Trust, estimated
fees, charges and ex-
penses of the Trustee and
of the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust.&emsp;
The total amount of the
unpaid balance of the ob-
ligations secured by the
property to be sold and
reasonable est imated
costs, expenses and ad-
vances at the time of the
initial publication of this
Notice of Trustee’s Sale is
e s t i m a t e d t o b e
$320,377.65 (Estimated).
However, prepayment
premiums, accrued in-
terest and advances will
increase this figure prior to
sale. Beneficiary’s bid at
said sale may include all
or part of said amount. In
addition to cash, the Trust-
ee will accept a cashier’s
check drawn on a state or
national bank, a check
drawn by a state or feder-
al credit union or a check
drawn by a state or feder-
al savings and loan asso-
ciation, savings associ-
ation or savings bank spe-
cified in Section 5102 of
the California Financial
Code and authorized to do
business in California, or
other such funds as may
be acceptable to the Trust-
ee. In the event tender
other than cash is accep-
ted, the Trustee may with-
hold the issuance of the
Trustee’s Deed Upon Sale
until funds become avail-
able to the payee or en-
dorsee as a matter of right.
The property offered for
sale excludes all funds
held on account by the
property receiver, if applic-
able. If the Trustee is un-
able to convey title for any
reason, the successful bid-
der’s sole and exclusive
remedy shall be the return
of monies paid to the
Trustee and the success-
ful bidder shall have no
further recourse. Notice to
Potential Bidders If you
are considering bidding on
this property l ien, you
should understand that
there are risks involved in
bidding at a Trustee auc-
tion. You will be bidding on
a lien, not on the property
itself. Placing the highest
bid at a Trustee auction
does not automatically en-
title you to free and clear
ownership of the property.
You should also be aware
that the lien being auc-
tioned off may be a junior
lien. If you are the highest
bidder at the auction, you
are or may be responsible
for paying off all liens seni-
or to the lien being auc-
tioned off, before you can
receive clear title to the
property. You are encour-
aged to investigate the ex-
istence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens that
may exist on this property
by contacting the county
recorder's office or a title
insurance company, either
of which may charge you a
fee for this information. If
you consult either of these
resources, you should be
aware that the same
Lender may hold more
than one mortgage or
Deed of Trust on the prop-
erty. Notice to Property
Owner The sale date
shown on this Notice of
Sale may be postponed
one or more times by the
Mortgagee, Beneficiary,
Trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 2924g of the
California Civil Code. The
law requires that informa-
tion about Trustee Sale
postponements be made
available to you and to the
public, as a courtesy to
those not present at the
sale. If you wish to learn
whether your sale date
has been postponed, and,
if applicable, the resched-
uled time and date for the
sale of this property, you
may call Auction.com at
800.280.2832 for informa-
t i o n r e g a r d i n g t h e
Trustee's Sale or visit the
Internet Website address
www.Auction.com for in-
formation regarding the
sale of this property, using
the file number assigned
to this case, CA05000085-
23-1. Information about
postponements that are
very short in duration or
that occur close in time to
the scheduled sale may
not immediately be reflec-
ted in the telephone in-
formation or on the Inter-
net Website. The best way
to verify postponement in-
formation is to attend the
scheduled sale.&emsp;
Notice to Tenant NOTICE
TO TENANT FOR FORE-
C L O S U R E S A F T E R
JANUARY 1, 2021 You
may have a right to pur-
chase this property after
the trustee auction pursu-
ant to Section 2924m of
the California Civil Code. If
you are an “eligible tenant
buyer,” you can purchase
the property if you match
the last and highest bid
placed at the trustee auc-
tion. If you are an “eligible
bidder,” you may be able
to purchase the property if
you exceed the last and
highest bid placed at the
trustee auction. There are
three steps to exercising
this right of purchase.
First, 48 hours after the
date of the trustee sale,
you can call 800.280.2832,
or visit this internet web-
site www.Auction.com, us-
ing the file number as-
s i g n e d t o t h i s c a s e
CA05000085-23-1 to find
the date on which the
trustee’s sale was held,
the amount of the last and
highest bid, and the ad-
dress of the t rus tee .
Second, you must send a
written notice of intent to
place a bid so that the
trustee receives it no more
than 15 days after the
trustee’s sale. Third, you
must submit a bid so that
the trustee receives it no
more than 45 days after
the trustee’s sale. If you
think you may qualify as
an “eligible tenant buyer”
or “eligible bidder,” you
should consider contact-
ing an attorney or appro-
priate real estate profes-
sional immediately for ad-
vice regarding this poten-
tial right to purchase. Date:
October 11, 2023 MTC
Financial Inc. dba Trustee
C o r p s T S N o .
CA05000085-23-1 17100
Gillette Ave Irvine, CA
92614 Phone: 949-252-
8 3 0 0 T D D : 7 1 1
949.252.8300 By: Loan
Quema, Authorized Sig-
natory SALE INFORMA-
T I O N C A N B E O B -
T A I N E D O N L I N E A T
www.Auction.com FOR
AUTOMATED SALES IN-
FORMATION PLEASE
CALL: Auct ion.com at
8 0 0 . 2 8 0 . 2 8 3 2
NPP0441884 To: THE
E V E N T N E W S
10/18/2023, 10/25/2023,
11/01/2023
E v e n t  N e w s
1 0 / 1 8 , 2 5 , 1 1 / 1 / 2 0 2 3 -
1 3 5 7 9 5

Legals-NE

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
OF BULK SALE
(UCC Sec. 6105)

Escrow No. 10513-AK
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIV-
EN that a bulk sale is
about to be made. The
name(s), business ad-
dress(es) to the Seller(s)
are: SUBHASH PATEL-
7111 TALBERT AVE.,
HUNTINGTON BEACH,
CA 92648
Doing Business as: ONE
FINE BLEND
All other business name(s)
and address(es) used by
the Seller(s) within three
years, as stated by the
Seller(s), is/are: NONE
The name(s) and busi-
ness address o f the
Buyer(s) is /are: AVNI
PANDYA-7111 TALBERT
A V E . , H U N T I N G T O N
B E A C H , C A 9 2 6 4 8
The assets to be sold are
described in general as:
FURNITURE, FIXTURES,
AND EQUIPMENT, COV-
ENANT NOT TO COM-
P E T E , L E A S E , A N D
LEASEHOLD IMPROVE-
MENT and are located at:
7111 TALBERT AVE.,
HUNTINGTON BEACH,
CA 92648
The bulk sale is intended
to be consummated at the
off ice of: DETAIL ES-
C R O W , I N C , 1 3 7 3 7
ARTESIA BLVD. #105
CERRITOS, CA 90703
and the anticipated sale
date is NOVEMBER 3,
2023
The bulk sale is subject to
California Uniform Com-
mercia l Code Sect ion
6106.2.
[If the sale is subject to
Sec. 6106.2, the following
i n f o r m a t i o n m u s t b e
provided.] The name and
address of the person with
whom claims may be filed
is: DETAIL ESCROW,
INC, 13737 ARTESIA
BLVD #105 , CERRITOS,
CA 90703 and the last
date for filing claims shall
be NOVEMBER 2, 2023,
which is the business day
before the sale date spe-
cified above.
Dated: SEPTEMBER 19,
2023
BUYER: AVNI PANDYA
O R D - 1 9 2 9 2 3 9 T H E
E V E N T 1 0 / 1 8 / 2 3
Event News 10/18/2023-
135768

NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER ES-
TATE OF ORVILLE

COLLINS ALLISON aka
ORVILLE C. ALLISON

Case No. 30-2023-
01353721-PR-PW-CMC

To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors, contingent cred-
itors, and persons who
may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate,
or both , o f ORVILLE
COLLINS ALLISON aka
ORVILLE C. ALLISON
A PETITION FOR PRO-
BATE has been filed by
Gary E. Dixon in the Su-
perior Court of California,
County of ORANGE.
THE PETIT ION FOR
PROBATE requests that
Gary E. Dixon be appoin-
ted as personal represent-
ative to administer the es-
tate of the decedent.
THE PETITION requests
the decedent's lost will and
codicils, if any, be admit-
ted to probate. Copies of
the lost will and any codi-
cils are available for exam-
ination in the file kept by
the court.
THE PETITION requests
authority to administer the
estate under the Inde-
pendent Administration of
Estates Act. (This author-
ity will allow the personal
representat ive to take
many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Be-
fore taking certain very im-
portant actions, however,
the personal representat-
ive will be required to give
notice to interested per-
sons unless they have
waived notice or consen-
ted to the p roposed
action.) The independent
administration authority
will be granted unless an
interested person files an
objection to the petition
and shows good cause
why the court should not
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the peti-
tion will be held on Dec.
14, 2023 at 1:30 PM in
Dept. No. CM06 located at
3390 HARBOR BLVD,
COSTA MESA CA 92626.
The court is providing the
convenience to appear for
hearing by video using the
court's designated video
platform. This is a no cost
service to the public. Go to
the Court's website at the
Superior Court of Califor-
nia - County of Orange
(occourts.org) to appear
remotely for Probate hear-
ings and for remote hear-
ing instructions. If you
have difficulty connecting
or are unable to connect to
your remote hearing, call
657-622-8278 for assist-
ance. If you prefer to ap-
pear in-person, you can
appear in the department
on the day/time set for
your hearing.
IF YOU OBJECT to the
granting of the petition,
you should appear at the
hearing and state your ob-
jections or file written ob-
jections with the court be-
fore the hearing. Your ap-
pearance may be in per-
son or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDIT-
OR or a contingent credit-
or of the decedent, you
must file your claim with
the court and mail a copy
to the personal represent-
ative appointed by the
court within the later of
either (1) four months from
the date of first issuance of
letters to a general person-
a l representa t ive , as
defined in section 58(b) of
the Cali fornia Probate
Code, or (2) 60 days from
the date of mailing or per-
sonal delivery to you of a
notice under section 9052
of the California Probate
Code.
Other California statutes
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a credit-
or. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney know-
ledgeable in California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the
file kept by the court. If you
are a person interested in
the estate, you may file
with the court a Request
for Special Notice (form
DE-154) of the filing of an
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any pe-
t i t i on o r accoun t as
provided in Probate Code
section 1250. A Request
for Special Notice form is
available from the court
clerk.
Attorney for petitioner:
JAMES E SWICK ESQ
SBN 62967
LAW OFFICES OF
JAMES E SWICK
2 7 5 0 B E L L F L O W E R
B L V D
STE 100
LONG BEACH CA 90815
CN100931 COLLINS Oct
18,25, Nov 1, 2023
N e w s  E n t e r p r i s e
1 0 / 1 8 , 2 5 , 1 1 / 1 / 2 0 2 3 -
1 3 5 7 7 3

Legals-NE

NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER ES-

TATE OF:
JOSEPH DOMINIC DEN-

ICOLA AKA JOSEPH
DENICOLA AKA JOE

DENICOLA
CASE NO. 30-2023-

01351509-PR-LA-CMC
To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors, contingent cred-
itors, and persons who
may otherwise be inter-
ested in the WILL or es-
tate, or both of JOSEPH
DOMINIC DENICOLA
AKA JOSEPH DENICOLA
AKA JOE DENICOLA.
A PETITION FOR PRO-
BATE has been filed by
MATTHEW RYAN DENIC-
OLA in the Superior Court
of California, County of
ORANGE.
THE PETIT ION FOR
PROBATE requests that
MATTHEW RYAN DENIC-
OLA be appointed as per-
sonal representative to ad-
minister the estate of the
decedent.
THE PETITION requests
authority to administer the
estate under the Inde-
pendent Administration of
Estates Act. (This author-
ity will allow the personal
representat ive to take
many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Be-
fore taking certain very im-
portant actions, however,
the personal representat-
ive will be required to give
notice to interested per-
sons unless they have
waived notice or consen-
ted to the p roposed
action.) The independent
administration authority
will be granted unless an
interested person files an
objection to the petition
and shows good cause
why the court should not
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the peti-
tion will be held in this
court as follows: 11/29/23
at 1:30PM in Dept. CM05
located at 3390 HARBOR
BLVD, COSTA MESA, CA
92626
NOTICE IN PRO BATE
CASES
The court is providing the
convenience to appear for
hearing by video using the
court's designated video
platform. This is a no cost
service to the public. Go to
the Court's website at The
Superior Court of Califor-
nia - County of Orange
(occourts.org) to appear
remotely for Probate hear-
ings and for remote hear-
ing instructions. If you
have difficulty connecting
or are unable to connect to
your remote hearing, call
657-622-8278 for assist-
ance. If you prefer to ap-
pear in-person, you can
appear in the department
on the day/time set for
your hearing.
IF YOU OBJECT to the
granting of the petition,
you should appear at the
hearing and state your ob-
jections or file written ob-
jections with the court be-
fore the hearing. Your ap-
pearance may be in per-
son or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDIT-
OR or a contingent credit-
or of the decedent, you
must file your claim with
the court and mail a copy
to the personal represent-
ative appointed by the
court within the later of
either (1) four months from
the date of first issuance of
letters to a general person-
a l representa t ive , as
defined in section 58(b) of
the Cali fornia Probate
Code, or (2) 60 days from
the date of mailing or per-
sonal delivery to you of a
notice under section 9052
of the California Probate
Code.
Other California statutes
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a credit-
or. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney know-
ledgeable in California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the
file kept by the court. If you
are a person interested in
the estate, you may file
with the court a Request
for Special Notice (form
DE-154) of the filing of an
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any pe-
t i t i on o r accoun t a s
provided in Probate Code
section 1250. A Request
for Special Notice form is
available from the court
clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
ROBERT L . COHEN,
ESQ. - SBN 150913, LAW
OFFICES OF ROBERT L.
COHEN, INC.
8081 ORANGETHORPE
AVE.
BUENA PARK CA 90621
Telephone (714) 522-8880
10/11, 10/18, 10/25/23
CNS-3745056#
E v e n t  N e w s
10/11,18,25/2023-135476

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
OF BULK SALE
(UCC Sec. 6105)

Escrow No. 10513-AK
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIV-
EN that a bulk sale is
about to be made. The
name(s), business ad-
dress(es) to the Seller(s)
are: SUBHASH PATEL-
7111 TALBERT AVE.,
HUNTINGTON BEACH,
CA 92648
Doing Business as: ONE
FINE BLEND
All other business name(s)
and address(es) used by
the Seller(s) within three
years, as stated by the
Seller(s), is/are: NONE
The name(s) and busi-
ness address o f the
Buyer(s) is /are: AVNI
PANDYA-7111 TALBERT
A V E . , H U N T I N G T O N
B E A C H , C A 9 2 6 4 8
The assets to be sold are
described in general as:
FURNITURE, FIXTURES,
AND EQUIPMENT, COV-
ENANT NOT TO COM-
P E T E , L E A S E , A N D
LEASEHOLD IMPROVE-
MENT and are located at:
7111 TALBERT AVE.,
HUNTINGTON BEACH,
CA 92648
The bulk sale is intended
to be consummated at the
off ice of: DETAIL ES-
C R O W , I N C , 1 3 7 3 7
ARTESIA BLVD. #105
CERRITOS, CA 90703
and the anticipated sale
date is NOVEMBER 3,
2023
The bulk sale is subject to
California Uniform Com-
mercia l Code Sect ion
6106.2.
[If the sale is subject to
Sec. 6106.2, the following
i n f o r m a t i o n m u s t b e
provided.] The name and
address of the person with
whom claims may be filed
is: DETAIL ESCROW,
INC, 13737 ARTESIA
BLVD #105 , CERRITOS,
CA 90703 and the last
date for filing claims shall
be NOVEMBER 2, 2023,
which is the business day
before the sale date spe-
cified above.
Dated: SEPTEMBER 19,
2023
BUYER: AVNI PANDYA
O R D - 1 9 2 9 2 3 9 T H E
E V E N T 1 0 / 1 8 / 2 3
Event News 10/18/2023-
135768

Legals-NE

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
30-2023-01347272-CU-

PT-CJC
TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Pet i t ioner:
O M A R F R A N C I S C O
ZUNIGA SANCHEZ filed
for a petition with this court
for a decree changing
names as follows: OMAR
FRANCISCO ZUNIGA
S A N C H E Z t o O M A R
FRANCISCO SANCHEZ.
THE COURT ORDERS
that all persons interested
in this matter shall appear
before this court at the
hearing indicated below to
show cause, if any, why
the petition for change of
name should not be gran-
ted. Any person objecting
to the name changes de-
scribed above must file a
written objection that in-
cludes the reasons for the
objection at least two court
days before the matter is
scheduled to be heard and
must appear at the hear-
ing to show cause why the
petit ion should not be
granted. If no written ob-
jection is timely filed, the
court may grant the peti-
tion without a hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
10/31/2023 8:30 a.m.,
Dept. D100 REMOTE
Central Justice Center
700 Civic Center Drive

West
Santa Ana, CA 92701

(To appear remote ly ,
check in advance of the
hearing for information
about how to do so on the
court's website. To find
your court's website, go to
www.courts.ca.gov/find-
my-court.htm)
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following newspa-
per of general circulation,
printed in this county:
News Enterprise
DATE: 09/08/2023
Judge
Judge of the
Superior Court

Event News Enterprise
9/27,10/4,11,18/23-

135043

NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER ES-

TATE OF:
JOSEPH DOMINIC DEN-

ICOLA AKA JOSEPH
DENICOLA AKA JOE

DENICOLA
CASE NO. 30-2023-

01351509-PR-LA-CMC
To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors, contingent cred-
itors, and persons who
may otherwise be inter-
ested in the WILL or es-
tate, or both of JOSEPH
DOMINIC DENICOLA
AKA JOSEPH DENICOLA
AKA JOE DENICOLA.
A PETITION FOR PRO-
BATE has been filed by
MATTHEW RYAN DENIC-
OLA in the Superior Court
of California, County of
ORANGE.
THE PETIT ION FO R
PROBATE requests that
MATTHEW RYAN DENIC-
OLA be appointed as per-
sonal representative to ad-
minister the estate of the
decedent.
THE PETITION requests
authority to administer the
estate under the Inde-
pendent Administration of
Estates Act. (This author-
ity will allow the personal
representat ive to take
many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Be-
fore taking certain very im-
portant actions, however,
the personal representat-
ive will be required to give
notice to interested per-
sons unless they have
waived notice or consen-
ted to the p roposed
action.) The independent
administration authority
will be granted unless an
interested person files an
objection to the petition
and shows good cause
why the court should not
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the peti-
tion will be held in this
court as follows: 11/29/23
at 1:30PM in Dept. CM05
located at 3390 HARBOR
BLVD, COSTA MESA, CA
92626
NOTICE IN PROBATE
CASES
The court is providing the
convenience to appear for
hearing by video using the
court's designated video
platform. This is a no cost
service to the public. Go to
the Court's website at The
Superior Court of Califor-
nia - County of Orange
(occourts.org) to appear
remotely for Probate hear-
ings and for remote hear-
ing instructions. If you
have difficulty connecting
or are unable to connect to
your remote hearing, call
657-622-8278 for assist-
ance. If you prefer to ap-
pear in-person, you can
appear in the department
on the day/time set for
your hearing.
IF YOU OBJECT to the
granting of the petition,
you should appear at the
hearing and state your ob-
jections or file written ob-
jections with the court be-
fore the hearing. Your ap-
pearance may be in per-
son or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDIT-
OR or a contingent credit-
or of the decedent, you
must file your claim with
the court and mail a copy
to the personal represent-
ative appointed by the
court within the later of
either (1) four months from
the date of first issuance of
letters to a general person-
a l representa t ive , as
defined in section 58(b) of
the Cali fornia Probate
Code, or (2) 60 days from
the date of mailing or per-
sonal delivery to you of a
notice under section 9052
of the California Probate
Code.
Other California statutes
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a credit-
or. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney know-
ledgeable in California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the
file kept by the court. If you
are a person interested in
the estate, you may file
with the court a Request
for Special Notice (form
DE-154) of the filing of an
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any pe-
t i t i on o r accoun t as
provided in Probate Code
section 1250. A Request
for Special Notice form is
available from the court
clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
ROBERT L . COHEN,
ESQ. - SBN 150913, LAW
OFFICES OF ROBERT L.
COHEN, INC.
8081 ORANGETHORPE
AVE.
BUENA PARK CA 90621
Telephone (714) 522-8880
10/11, 10/18, 10/25/23
CNS-3745056#
E v e n t  N e w s
10/11,18,25/2023-135476

Legals-NE

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
30-2023-01347848

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Pet i t ioner:
NOYA JASPER-RUNE
KLAUS filed for a petition
with this court for a de-
cree changing names as
follows: NOYA JASPER-
RUNE KLAUS to SPEN-
CER RUNE KLAUS. THE
COURT ORDERS that all
persons interested in this
matter shall appear before
this court at the hearing in-
dicated below to show
cause, if any, why the peti-
tion for change of name
should not be granted. Any
person objecting to the
name changes described
above must file a written
objection that includes the
reasons for the objection
at least two court days be-
fore the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and must
appear at the hearing to
show cause why the peti-
tion should not be granted.
If no written objection is
timely filed, the court may
grant the petition without a
hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
11/14/2023 8:30 a.m.,
Dept. D100 REMOTE
Central Justice Center
700 Civic Center Drive

West
Santa Ana, CA 92701

(To appear remote ly ,
check in advance of the
hearing for information
about how to do so on the
court's website. To find
your court's website, go to
www.courts.ca.gov/find-
my-court.htm)
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following newspa-
per of general circulation,
printed in this county:
Event Newspapers
DATE: 09/11/2023
Judge Layne Melzer
Judge of the
Superior Court

Event News
9/27,10/4,11,18/23-

134987

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
30-2023-01347272-CU-

PT-CJC
TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Pet i t ioner:
O M A R F R A N C I S C O
ZUNIGA SANCHEZ filed
for a petition with this court
for a decree changing
names as follows: OMAR
FRANCISCO ZUNIGA
S A N C H E Z t o O M A R
FRANCISCO SANCHEZ.
THE COURT ORDERS
that all persons interested
in this matter shall appear
before this court at the
hearing indicated below to
show cause, if any, why
the petition for change of
name should not be gran-
ted. Any person objecting
to the name changes de-
scribed above must file a
written objection that in-
cludes the reasons for the
objection at least two court
days before the matter is
scheduled to be heard and
must appear at the hear-
ing to show cause why the
petit ion should not be
granted. If no written ob-
jection is timely filed, the
court may grant the peti-
tion without a hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
10/31/2023 8:30 a.m.,
Dept. D100 REMOTE
Central Justice Center
700 Civic Center Drive

West
Santa Ana, CA 92701

(To appear remote ly ,
check in advance of the
hearing for information
about how to do so on the
court's website. To find
your court's website, go to
www.courts.ca.gov/find-
my-court.htm)
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following newspa-
per of general circulation,
printed in this county:
News Enterprise
DATE: 09/08/2023
Judge
Judge of the
Superior Court

Event News Enterprise
9/27,10/4,11,18/23-

135043

PERSONALS

The difference in winning
and losing market share is
how businesses use their
advertising dollars. Mark
Twain said, “Many a small
thing has been made large
by the right kind of advert-
ising”. So why spend your
hard-earned dollars on so-
cial media where you
already have an audi-
ence? For more info call
Cecelia @ (916) 288-6011
or cecelia@cnpa.com.
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SERVICES OFFERED

The difference in winning
and losing market share is
how businesses use their
a d v e r t i s i n g d o l l a r s .
CNPA’s Advertising Ser-
vices’ power to connect to
nearly 13 million of the
state’s readers who are an
engaged audience, makes
our services an indispens-
able marketing solution.
For more info call Cecelia
@ (916) 288-6011 or ce-
celia@cnpa.com.
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CITY OF LA PALMA
NOTICE INVITING BIDS
VARIOUS MEDIAN IS-

LANDS PROJECT
(CITY PROJECT NO. ST-

371)
NOTICE INVITING BIDS:
Sealed proposals will be
received online via the
Ci ty ’ s e -Procurement
P o r t a l ( “ P o r t a l ” ) a t
https://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, office of the City En-
gineer, Community Ser-
vices Office, La Palma,
California, until 1:30  PM
on Thursday, November
30, 2023 for furnishing of
all labor, materials and
equipment for VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No. ST-371 (the “Project”).
The  Bids  shall  be  sub-
mitted to the City Engin-
eer  through  the  Open-
Gov.com  platform. All
prospective bidders are re-
sponsible for registering
on OpenGov and check-
ing the City’s website for
the issuance of any project
addenda prior to the bid
opening for inclusion as
part of the bid proposal.
Due to the posting of the
documents on the city
website, OpenGov wil l
maintain a plan holder list.
For project information,
please contact the office of
the City Engineer at (714)
690-3310. Sealed  bids
will  NOT  be  accepted.
The  BIDS  for  VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No.  ST-371,  SHALL  BE
SUBMITTED  THROUGH
OpenGov.
D E S C R I P T I O N O F
WORK: The work in-
cludes rehabilitation of the
La Palma Avenue Median
Islands from the west city
limits to the east city limits;
Walker Avenue Median Is-
lands from Orangethorpe
Avenue southerly; and
Moody Street from Cres-
cent Ave to Houston Ave
including the removal of
existing landscaping/irriga-
tion, tree removals, hard-
scape removals and re-
placement, installation of
new drip irrigation system,
planting of new trees along
w i t h n e w
landscaping/hardscaping
in the medians islands.
Also, included are new
median islands on Moody
Street from Malaga Aven-
ue to La Luna Avenue with
complete irrigation and
landscaping per the con-
tract plans and specifica-
tions.
This project is NOT sub-
ject to a project labor, sta-
bilization, collective bar-
gaining or community work
force agreements
The City received Feder-
al Funding through HUD
for  this  project.  There-
fore,  Federal  Davis  Ba-
con  wage  rates  are  ap-
pl ied  to  the  project.
However,  If  the  State
Prevailing  Wages  are
higher than the Federal
Wage Rates,  the higher
are to be applied the that
specific classification.
A  MANDATORY  AND
SECTIO N  3  PRE-BID
MEETING,  will  be  held
on Tuesday October 24,
2023  at  2:30  pm  at  the
City  of  Palma  Com-
munity Services Offices,
7821  Walker  Street,  La
Palma, CA 90623. In or-
der to receive considera-
tion for the Section 3 bid
preference,  a  bidder
must complete, sign and
submit  the  following
forms with their bid pro-
posal: 1) Section 3 Busi-
ness Certification Form,
and (b) Section 3 Resid-
ent Certification form(s).
A  reasonable  bid  must
be with the Zone of Con-
sideration at the time of
bid  evaluation. All con-
tractors are required to
have a representative at-
tend and sign in at the pre-
bid meeting. Failure to
comply with this attend-
ance and sign in require-
ments will result in the
Contactor’s proposal be-
ing found non-responsive
to the required proced-
ures.
Prevailing  Wage  State-
ment:
This contract will be fun-
ded in whole or in part with
Federal housing and com-
munity development funds.
Federal Labor Standard
Provisions, including pre-
vailing wage requirements
of Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts will be enforced.
A copy of the Federal
Wage Decision applicable
to this project is included
in the Bid Documents in
Appendix “B”. This project
is a public work in the
State of California, funded
in whole or in part with
public funds. Therefore,
the higher of the two ap-
plicable prevailing wage
rates federal or state, will
be enforced. The Contract-
or’s duty to pay State pre-
vai l ing wages can be
found under Labor Code
Section 1770 et seq. Labor
Code Section 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties for failure to pay pre-
vailing wages and to em-
ploy apprentices, includ-
ing forfeitures and de-
barment. State Wage De-
cision is on file at the City
Clerk’s office and is also
a v a i l a b l e O n l i n e a t
h t tp : / /d i r . ca .gov /d is r / .
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Section 1777.5, 1777.6
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title
8, California Administra-
tion Code, Section 200 et
seq. to ensure compliance
and complete understand-
ing of the law regarding
apprentices.
Fair  Employment  Prac-
tices/Equal Opportunity
Acts:
In the performance of this
Agreement, Contractor
shall comply with all ap-
plicable provisions of the
California Fair Employ-
ment Practices Act (Cali-
fornia Government Code
Section §§ C – 32 B-3
12940 et seq.), the applic-
able equal employment
provisions of the Civi l
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000e et seq.),
and the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990 (42
U.S.C. §§ 12101, et seq.).
Labor  Standards  and
Civil  Rights:
Contractor agrees to com-
ply with the requirements
of the Secretary of Labor
and the latest amend-
ments to: Executive Or-
ders 11246 and 11375, as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(41 C.F.R. chapter 60); the
Copeland “Anti-Kickback”
Act (18 U.S.C. § 847) as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(29 C.F.R. part 3); Section
3 of the Housing and Urb-
an Development Act of
1968 (12 U.S.C. §§ 1701
et seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000); Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community Devel-
opment Act of 1974 (42
U.S.C. §§ 5301 et seq.);
the Age Discrimination Act
of 1975 (42 U.S.C. §§
6101 et seq.); and Section
504 of the Rehabilitation
Act of 1973 (29 U.S.C. §§
701 et seq.). Contractor
agrees to comply with the
requirements of all other
applicable federal, State
and local laws and regula-
tions.
State Labor Standards &
Wage Requirements:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor
and all subcontractors
agree to follow the State
Labor standards. State
Labor standards provi-
sions, including prevailing
wage requirements, will be
enforced such that the
general rate of per diem
wages (prevailing wage)
shall be paid for each
craft, classification, or type
of worker needed to ex-
ecute the contract to all
workers employed in the
execution of the contract.
All contractors and sub-
contractors must furnish
electronic certified payroll
records directly to the
Labor Commissioner (aka
Division of Labor Stand-
ards Enforcement) as fur-
ther described in Article
VIII of the Agreement. The
State General Prevailing
Wage Determination is as
established by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations (available at
http://www.dir.ca.gov/DLS
R/PWD/index.htm). The
prevailing rate of per diem
wages are on file at the
City.
Section 3 Statement:
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t a n d a l l
Bidders/Proposers must
commit to achieving estab-
lished requirements, in-
cluding benchmarks, for
Section 3 workers and
Targeted Section 3 work-
ers to be considered a re-
sponsive bidder/proposer
and eligible for a contract
award. Section 3 Require-
ments, Clause, and Pro-
gram Forms can be loc-
ated in Appendix “A” of
this document.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an  Development  Act  of
1968,  as  amended,  12
U.S.C 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low and very low-
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The parties to this con-
tract  agree  to  comply
with  HUD’s  regulations
in  24  CFR  part  135,
which  implement  Sec-
tion 3. As evidenced by
their  execution  of  this
contract,  the  parties  to
this contract certify that
they  are  under  no  con-
tractual or other impedi-
ment that would prevent
them  from  complying
with the part 135 regula-
tions.
The Contractor agrees to
send  to  each  labor  or-
ganization or represent-
ative  of  workers  with
which  the  Contractor
has a collective bargain-
ing  agreement  or  other
understanding, if any, a
notice advising the labor
organization or workers’
representative  of  the
Contractor’s  commit-
ments  under  this  Sec-
tion  3  clause,  and  will
post  copies  of  the  no-
t ice  in  conspicuous
places  at  the  work  site
where  both  employees
and applicants for train-
ing and employment po-
sitions  can  see  the  no-
tice.  The  notices  shall
describe  the  Section  3
preference,  shall  set
forth  minimum  number
and job titles subject to
hire,  availability  of  ap-
prenticeships and train-
ing positions, the quali-
fications  of  each;  and
the name and location of
person(s) taking applica-
tions for each of the pos-
itions;  and  the  anticip-
ated date the work shall
begin.
The Contractor agrees to
include  this  Section  3
clause in every sub-con-
tract  subject  to  compli-
ance with regulation sin
24  CFR  part  135,  and
agrees to take appropri-
ate  action,  as  provided
in  the  applicable  provi-
sion of the sub-contract-
or  in  this  Section  3
clause,  upon  a  finding
that  the  sub-contractor
is in violation of the reg-
ulation  in  24  CFR  part
135. The Contractor will
not  sub-contract  with
a n y  s u b - c o n t r a c t o r
where  the  Contractor
has notice or knowledge
that  the  sub-contractor
has been found in viola-
tion of the regulation in
24 CFR part 135.
The Contractor will certi-
fy  that  any  vacant  em-
ployment  positions,  in-
cluding  training  posi-
tions,  that  are  filled  (1)
after  the  Contractor  is
selected  but  before  the
contract  is  executed,
and (2) with persons oth-
er  than  those  to  whom
the  regulations  of  24
CFR part 135 require em-
ployment  opportunities
to be directed, were not
filled  to  circumvent  the
Contractor’s  obligation
under  24  CFR part  135.
Noncompl iance  wi th
HUD’s regulations in 24
CFR part 135 may result
in  sanctions,  termina-
tion of  this contract  for
default,  and  debarment
or  suspension  from fu-
ture  HUD assisted con-
tracts.
With  respect  to  work
performed  in  connec-
t ion  wi th  Sect ion  3
covered Indian Housing
Assistance, Section 7(b)
of  the  Indian  Self-De-
termination and Educa-
tion Assistance Act  (25
U.S.C.  450e)  also  ap-
plies  to  the  work  to  be
performed  under  this
contract. Section 7(b) re-
q u i r e s  t h a t  t o  t h e
greatest  extent  feasible
(i) preference and oppor-
tunities for training and
employment shall be giv-
en  to  Indians,  and  (ii)
preference is the award
of  contracts  and  sub-
contracts shall be given
to  Indian  organizations
and  Indian-owned  Eco-
n o m i c  E n t e r p r i s e s .
Parties  to  this  contract
that  are  subject  to  the
provisions of  Section 3
and section 7(b) agree to
comply with Section 3 to
the  maximum  extent
feasib le ,  but  not  in
derogation  of  compli-
ance  with  section  7(b).
Federal  Forms  to  be
Submitted  with  Bid:
The forms contained in
Appendix C, including
Section 3 forms, must be
completed, and included
with the bid submittal.
Award of Contract:
The following are condi-
tions to the award of the
contract:
i. for any bid submitted on
or after March 1, 2015,
each contractor and sub-
contractor listed on the bid
must be registered with
the Department of Industri-
al Relations pursuant to
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1725.5, subject to the lim-
ited exceptions set forth in
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1771.1(a) (regarding the
submission of a bid as au-
thorized by Business &
Professions Code Section
7029.1 or Public Contract
Code Section 10164 or
20103.5, provided the con-
tractor is registered to per-
form public work pursuant
to Section 1725.5 at the
time the contract is awar-
ded); and
ii. ii. for any contract awar-
ded on or after April 1,
2015, no contractor or
subcontractor may be
awarded this contract un-
less the contractor and
each subcontractor listed
on the bid is registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations pursu-
ant to Section 1725.5.
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Sections 1777.5, 1777.6,
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title 8
of the California Code of
Regulations, Section 200,
et seq., to ensure compli-
ance and complete under-
standing of the law regard-
ing apprentices.
Federal  Labor  Stand-
ards  Provision:
Refer to the HUD-4010
forms are located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Current  Federal  DOL
Wage  Decision:
Refer to the Federal Wage
Decision, located in Ap-
pendix “D” of this docu-
ment.
Federal EEO and Affirm-
ative  Action  Require-
ments:
Refer to the Federal Equal
Employment Opportunity
and Affirmative Action Re-
quirements located in Ap-
pendix “c” of this docu-
ment.
Contracting with Small &
Minority Firms, Women’s
Business Enterprise:
Refer to the Contracting
wi th Smal l Bus iness ,
Minority Firms, Women's
Business Enterprise, and
Labor Surplus Area Firms,
Federal Contract Provi-
sion, located in Appendix
“C” of this document.
Compliance  with  Clean
Air  and  Water  Acts:
Refer to the Compliance
with Clean Air and Water
Acts, Federal Contract
Provision, located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Conflict of Interest:
In  the  procurement  of
supplies,  equipment,
construction,  and  ser-
vice  of  sub-recipients,
the  conflict-of-interest
provision  in  24  CFR
85.36,  OMB  Circular  A-
110 and 24 CFR 570.611
shall  apply. No employ-
ee, officer or agent of the
sub-recipient shall parti-
cipate  in  the  selection,
award, or administration
of a contract supported
by  federal  funds  in  a
conflict  of  interest,  real
or apparent, would be in-
volved.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an Development  Action
of 1968, as amended, 12
U.S.C. 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall, to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low- and very-low
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The  Bidder/Proposer  is
required to complete and
submit  the  Declaration
of Intent to Comply with
Section 3 Requirements
–  Required  Contract
Forms  and  Certif ica-
tions, certifying that they
intend  to  comply  with
the  requirement  of  the
Secretary  of  Labor  and
the  latest  amendments
to:  Executive  Orders
11246 and 11375, as sup-
plemented  in  Depart-
ment  of  Labor  regula-
tions  (41  CFR  chapter
60); the Copeland “Anti-
Kickback: Act (18 U.S.C.
s847)  as  supplemented
in  Department  of  Labor
regulations (29 CFR part
3);  Sections  3  of  the
Housing and Urban De-
velopment  Act  of  1968
(12  U.S.C.  s  1701  et
seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights  Act  of  1964  (42
U.S.C.  s2000);  Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community De-
velopment  Act  of  1974
(42  U.S.C.  s  5301  et
seq.); the Age Discrimin-
ation  Act  of  1975  (42
U.S.C.  s701  et  seq.).
Contractor  agrees  to
comply with the require-
ments of all other applic-
able  federal,  state  and
local  laws  and  regula-
tions.
Prospective bidders/pro-
posers  shall  carefully
read  the  information
within  this  bid  docu-
ment including the Sec-
tion  3  Provisions  for
H o u s i n g  a n d  C o m -
munity Development As-
sistance  and  Publ ic
Housing Assistance, as
amended. Proposals that
fail  to  comply  with  the
requirement of Section 3
will  be considered non-
respons ive  and  ex -
cluded from further con-
sideration.
To comply with SB 854,
beginning January 1, 2015
the following applies:
A. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be listed
on a bid proposal for pub-
lic works project (submit-
ted on or after March 1,
2015) unless registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations (DIR)
pursuant to Labor Code
section 1725.5 [with lim-
ited exceptions from this
requirement for bid pur-
poses only under Labor
Code section 1771.1(a)].
B. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be awar-
ded a contract for public
works on a public works
project awarded on or after
April 1, 2015, unless re-
gistered with the DIR.
C. The project is subject to
compliance monitoring and
enforcement by the DIR.
D. Require the prime con-
tractor to post job site no-
tices prescribed by regula-
tion (regulation not cre-
ated yet) or the City must
post the notices itself.
The Contractor shall fill
in the Department of In-
dustrial  Relations (DIR)
Contractor  Registration
Number  Form provided
in  Appendix  “C”  and
submit it with the sealed
Bid.
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Bids must be prepared on
the approved Proposal
forms or copies thereof in
conformance with the In-
structions to Bidders and
submitted in a sealed en-
velope plainly marked on
the outside as follows:
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
RFI’S/QUESTIONS: The
deadline to submit All
RFI’s/Questions shall be
s u b m i t t e d p r i o r t o
Thursday, November 09,
2023  at  1:30  pm  to  the
OpenGov  website. Late
submittal shall not be con-
sidered.
SUBSTITUTIONS: All re-
q u e s t e d “ o r e q u a l ”
products shall be submit-
ted prior to the bid date for
review and evaluation with
a subsequent determina-
tion by the City if the “or
equal” product is satisfact-
ory for consideration and
be allowed to submitted
with the bid. The  dead-
line to submit “or equal”
items shall be Thursday,
November  09,  2023  at
1:30 pm to the OpenGov
website.  Late  “or  equal
submittals shall be rejec-
ted.
COMPLETION OF WORK:
The City is scheduling the
award of contract for Janu-
ary 9, 2023 On January
10, 2023 the City will is-
sue the Notice to Contract
Award requesting the con-
tractor to submit contracts,
bonds and insurance certi-
ficates and submitted to
the City within fifteen (15)
calendar days.
In order to accommodate
weed abatement proced-
ures. The City will issue a
Weed Abatement Proced-
ure Notice to Proceed for a
duration of twenty-working
(20) days. When this is
complete, the City will is-
sue the construction No-
tice to Proceed for a dura-
tion of one hundred and
twenty (120) working days
(Monday – Friday), as stip-
ulated in the written No-
tice to Proceed issued by
the City Engineer. Failure
to complete the Work with-
in the time set forth herein
will result in the imposition
of liquidated damages for
each day of delay, in the
amount set forth in Sec-
tion 39 of the General Pro-
visions.
OBTAINING PLANS AND
SPECIFICATIONS: Plans,
Specifications, and any
project addenda are avail-
able for download the new
City platform OpenGov, ht-
tps://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, and on the city’s
website, www.cityoflap-
alma.org. All prospective
bidders are responsible for
registering on OpenGov
and checking the City’s
website for the issuance of
any project addenda prior
to the bid opening for in-
clusion as part of the bid
proposal. Due to the post-
ing of the documents on
the city website, OpenGov
will maintain a plan holder
list. For project informa-
tion, please contact the of-
fice of the City Engineer at
(714) 690-3310.
BONDS: Pursuant to the
Instructions to Bidders,
each proposal shall be ac-
companied by cash or by a
cashier's or certified check
or by a bid bond in the
amount of ten  percent
(10%) of the amount of the
bid price payable to the
City of La Palma as a
guarantee that the bidder,
if his or her proposal is ac-
cepted, will promptly ex-
ecute the contract, secure
payment of workers’ com-
pensation insurance and
furnish a satisfactory faith-
ful performance bond in
the amount of one  hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price and a
labor and material bond
in the amount of one hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price.
SUBSTITUTION OF SE-
CURITIES: The Contract-
or may substitute securit-
ies for any monies with-
held by the City to ensure
performance under the
contract in compliance
with the requirements of
Public Contract Code Sec-
tion 22300 and the "Sub-
stitution of Securities" pro-
visions of the General Pro-
visions.
WAGE RATES: As re-
quired by Section 1773 of
the California Labor Code,
the Director of the Depart-
ment of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia has determined the
general prevailing rates of
wages in the locality in
which Work is scheduled
to be performed. Copies of
the wage rate determina-
tions, entitled PREVAIL-
ING WAGE SCALE, are
mainta ined at the La
Palma City Hall, 7822
Walker Street, La Palma,
California, and are avail-
able to any interested
party upon request. The
Contractor shall post a
copy of this document at
each job site. The Con-
tractor and any subcon-
tractor under it shall pay
not less than the specified
prevailing rates of wages
to all workers employed in
the execution of the Con-
tract.
C O N T R A C T O R ' S L I -
CENSE: In accordance
with the provisions of Cali-
fornia Publ ic Contract
Code Section 3300, the
City requires that the bid-
der possess the following
c l a s s i f i c a t i o n o f
contractor’s license at the
time that the bid proposal
is submitted: Class A, or
Specialty. If the license
classif ication specif ied
hereinabove is that of a
“specialty contractor” as
defined in Section 7058 of
the California Business
and Professions Code, the
specialty contractor awar-
ded the Contract for this
Work shall itself construct
a majority of the Work, in
accordance with the provi-
sions of California Busi-
ness and Professions
Code Section 7059. Each
bidder shall clearly write or
type their contractor’s li-
cense number on the out-
side of the bidding envel-
ope.
CONTRACTORS REGIS-
TRATION: In accordance
with the provisions of
L a b o r C o d e s e c t i o n
1771.1, a contractor or
subcontractor shall not be
qualified to (a) bid on or be
listed in a bid proposal or
(b) engage in the perform-
ance of this Work, unless
currently registered and
qualified to perform the
Work pursuant to Labor
Code Section 1725.5.
COMPLIANCE MONITOR-
ING AND ENFORCE-
MENT: Contractor’s per-
formance of the Work de-
scribed in this Notice Invit-
ing Bids is subject to com-
pliance monitoring and en-
forcement by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations.
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY:
The City hereby notifies all
bidders that it will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of sex,
race, color, or national ori-
gin in consideration for an
award.
C ITY 'S RIGHTS RE-
SERVED: The City of La
Palma reserves the right to
reject any and all propos-
als or bids, including the
bid of a bidder who has
been delinquent or unfaith-
ful in any former contract
with the City of La Palma,
or to waive any irregularit-
ies or informalities in any
bids or in the bidding,
should it deem this neces-
sary for the public good.
No bidder may withdraw
his or her bid for a period
of sixty (60) days after the
date from the opening
thereof.
This  is  a  federally  as-
sisted construction con-
tract .  Federal  Labor
Standards  Provisions,
including  prevai l ing
wage  requirements  of
the Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts (DBRA) will be
enforced. In the event of
a conflict  between Fed-
eral  and  State  wage
rates,  the  higher  of  the
two will  prevail.
The Contractor’s duty to
pay  State  prevai l ing
wages can be found un-
der Labor Code Section
1770  et  seq.  and  Labor
Code Sections 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties  for  failure  to  pay
prevailing  wages  and
employee  apprentices
including forfeitures and
debarment.
The  current  Federal
Wage  Decision  is  con-
tained  herein,  in  Ap-
pendix “B”, and may be
updated  via  addendum
to this bid package with-
in ten (10) days prior to
bid opening and can be
f o u n d  a t
http://www.wdol.gov/wd
ol/scafiles/davisbacon/c
a/html.  The  applicable
Federal  Wage  Decision
will be incorporated into
the  contract.  The  State
wage rates are available
o n l i n e  a t
http://www/dir.ca.gov/DL
S R / P W D / i n d e x . h t m .
Lower State wage rates
for  work classifications
not specifically included
in the Federal Wage De-
cision  are  not  accept-
able.  The  Contractor
may  request  an  Addi-
tional Classification and
Rate  if  work  classifica-
tion cannot be located in
the  Federal  Wage  De-
cision.
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t  a n d  a l l
Bidder/Proposers  must
commit to achieving es-
tablished requirements,
including  benchmarks,
for  Section  3  workers
and Targeted Section 3
workers  to  be  con-
sidered  a  Section  3  re-
sponsive  bidder/pro-
poser and eligible for  a
contract  award.
Assignment:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of Part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Contractor's License:
When federal funds are
being used, at the time of
“Award of the Contract”,
the Prime Contractor must
have a valid California
State Contractor's License
with a classification of “A
or  Specialty” in accord-
ance with provisions of
Chapter 9, Division 111,
Sections 7000 through
7145 of the Business and
Professions Code of the
State of California and the
Prime Contractor shall
warrant that it and all sub-
contractors are properly li-
censed, which includes
each entity having a local
business license. When
federal funds are not be-
ing used, a bid by a con-
tractor who is not properly
l icensed must be con-
sidered nonresponsive,
will be rejected by the City,
and the unlicensed con-
tractor may be subject to
discipline by the state.
Contractor  Eligibil ity
Check:
Prior to awarding a con-
tract, the City will verify the
contractor's (1) status with
the California Department
of Industrial Relations at
http://www.cslb.ca.gov and
https://efiling.dir.ca.gov
and (2 ) e l i g ib i l i t y a t
http://www.dir.ca.gov/dlse/
debar.html and with the
online excluded parties list
at the federal System For
A w a r d M a n a g e m e n t
( S A M ) w e b s i t e
h t t ps : / /www.sam.gov .
Affirmative Action:
All bidders are on notice
that the City will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of reli-
gious creed, sex, race, col-
or, national origin in con-
sideration for an award.
Moreover, no contractor
receiving the award may
discriminate nor permit
others he may hire to en-
gage in, discrimination in
the employment of per-
sons because of their
race, religious creed, col-
or, or national origin, an-
cestry, physical disability,
mental disability, medical
condition, genetic informa-
tion, marital status, sex,
gender, gender identity,
gender expression, age,
sexual orientation, or milit-
ary or veteran status, ex-
cept as provided in Gov-
ernment Code Section
12940.
DATED: October 18, 2023
CITY OF LA PALMA,
CALIFORNIA
By:__________________
___________
Andy Ramirez
Public Works and Com-
munity Services Director

News Enterprise
10/18/2023-135860
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CITY OF LA PALMA
NOTICE INVITING BIDS
VARIOUS MEDIAN IS-

LANDS PROJECT
(CITY PROJECT NO. ST-

371)
NOTICE INVITING BIDS:
Sealed proposals will be
received online via the
Ci ty ’ s e -Procurement
P o r t a l ( “ P o r t a l ” ) a t
https://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, office of the City En-
gineer, Community Ser-
vices Office, La Palma,
California, until 1:30  PM
on Thursday, November
30, 2023 for furnishing of
all labor, materials and
equipment for VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No. ST-371 (the “Project”).
The  Bids  shall  be  sub-
mitted to the City Engin-
eer  through  the  Open-
Gov.com  platform. All
prospective bidders are re-
sponsible for registering
on OpenGov and check-
ing the City’s website for
the issuance of any project
addenda prior to the bid
opening for inclusion as
part of the bid proposal.
Due to the posting of the
documents on the city
website, OpenGov wil l
maintain a plan holder list.
For project information,
please contact the office of
the City Engineer at (714)
690-3310. Sealed  bids
will  NOT  be  accepted.
The  BIDS  for  VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No.  ST-371,  SHALL  BE
SUBMITTED  THROUGH
OpenGov.
D E S C R I P T I O N O F
WORK: The work in-
cludes rehabilitation of the
La Palma Avenue Median
Islands from the west city
limits to the east city limits;
Walker Avenue Median Is-
lands from Orangethorpe
Avenue southerly; and
Moody Street from Cres-
cent Ave to Houston Ave
including the removal of
existing landscaping/irriga-
tion, tree removals, hard-
scape removals and re-
placement, installation of
new drip irrigation system,
planting of new trees along
w i t h n e w
landscaping/hardscaping
in the medians islands.
Also, included are new
median islands on Moody
Street from Malaga Aven-
ue to La Luna Avenue with
complete irrigation and
landscaping per the con-
tract plans and specifica-
tions.
This project is NOT sub-
ject to a project labor, sta-
bilization, collective bar-
gaining or community work
force agreements
The City received Feder-
al Funding through HUD
for  this  project.  There-
fore,  Federal  Davis  Ba-
con  wage  rates  are  ap-
pl ied  to  the  project.
However,  If  the  State
Prevailing  Wages  are
higher than the Federal
Wage Rates,  the higher
are to be applied the that
specific classification.
A  MANDATORY  AND
SECTIO N  3  PRE-BID
MEETING,  will  be  held
on Tuesday October 24,
2023  at  2:30  pm  at  the
City  of  Palma  Com-
munity Services Offices,
7821  Walker  Street,  La
Palma, CA 90623. In or-
der to receive considera-
tion for the Section 3 bid
preference,  a  bidder
must complete, sign and
submit  the  following
forms with their bid pro-
posal: 1) Section 3 Busi-
ness Certification Form,
and (b) Section 3 Resid-
ent Certification form(s).
A  reasonable  bid  must
be with the Zone of Con-
sideration at the time of
bid  evaluation. All con-
tractors are required to
have a representative at-
tend and sign in at the pre-
bid meeting. Failure to
comply with this attend-
ance and sign in require-
ments will result in the
Contactor’s proposal be-
ing found non-responsive
to the required proced-
ures.
Prevailing  Wage  State-
ment:
This contract will be fun-
ded in whole or in part with
Federal housing and com-
munity development funds.
Federal Labor Standard
Provisions, including pre-
vailing wage requirements
of Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts will be enforced.
A copy of the Federal
Wage Decision applicable
to this project is included
in the Bid Documents in
Appendix “B”. This project
is a public work in the
State of California, funded
in whole or in part with
public funds. Therefore,
the higher of the two ap-
plicable prevailing wage
rates federal or state, will
be enforced. The Contract-
or’s duty to pay State pre-
vai l ing wages can be
found under Labor Code
Section 1770 et seq. Labor
Code Section 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties for failure to pay pre-
vailing wages and to em-
ploy apprentices, includ-
ing forfeitures and de-
barment. State Wage De-
cision is on file at the City
Clerk’s office and is also
a v a i l a b l e O n l i n e a t
h t tp : / /d i r . ca .gov /d is r / .
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Section 1777.5, 1777.6
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title
8, California Administra-
tion Code, Section 200 et
seq. to ensure compliance
and complete understand-
ing of the law regarding
apprentices.
Fair  Employment  Prac-
tices/Equal Opportunity
Acts:
In the performance of this
Agreement, Contractor
shall comply with all ap-
plicable provisions of the
California Fair Employ-
ment Practices Act (Cali-
fornia Government Code
Section §§ C – 32 B-3
12940 et seq.), the applic-
able equal employment
provisions of the Civi l
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000e et seq.),
and the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990 (42
U.S.C. §§ 12101, et seq.).
Labor  Standards  and
Civil  Rights:
Contractor agrees to com-
ply with the requirements
of the Secretary of Labor
and the latest amend-
ments to: Executive Or-
ders 11246 and 11375, as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(41 C.F.R. chapter 60); the
Copeland “Anti-Kickback”
Act (18 U.S.C. § 847) as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(29 C.F.R. part 3); Section
3 of the Housing and Urb-
an Development Act of
1968 (12 U.S.C. §§ 1701
et seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000); Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community Devel-
opment Act of 1974 (42
U.S.C. §§ 5301 et seq.);
the Age Discrimination Act
of 1975 (42 U.S.C. §§
6101 et seq.); and Section
504 of the Rehabilitation
Act of 1973 (29 U.S.C. §§
701 et seq.). Contractor
agrees to comply with the
requirements of all other
applicable federal, State
and local laws and regula-
tions.
State Labor Standards &
Wage Requirements:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor
and all subcontractors
agree to follow the State
Labor standards. State
Labor standards provi-
sions, including prevailing
wage requirements, will be
enforced such that the
general rate of per diem
wages (prevailing wage)
shall be paid for each
craft, classification, or type
of worker needed to ex-
ecute the contract to all
workers employed in the
execution of the contract.
All contractors and sub-
contractors must furnish
electronic certified payroll
records directly to the
Labor Commissioner (aka
Division of Labor Stand-
ards Enforcement) as fur-
ther described in Article
VIII of the Agreement. The
State General Prevailing
Wage Determination is as
established by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations (available at
http://www.dir.ca.gov/DLS
R/PWD/index.htm). The
prevailing rate of per diem
wages are on file at the
City.
Section 3 Statement:
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t a n d a l l
Bidders/Proposers must
commit to achieving estab-
lished requirements, in-
cluding benchmarks, for
Section 3 workers and
Targeted Section 3 work-
ers to be considered a re-
sponsive bidder/proposer
and eligible for a contract
award. Section 3 Require-
ments, Clause, and Pro-
gram Forms can be loc-
ated in Appendix “A” of
this document.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an  Development  Act  of
1968,  as  amended,  12
U.S.C 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low and very low-
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The parties to this con-
tract  agree  to  comply
with  HUD’s  regulations
in  24  CFR  part  135,
which  implement  Sec-
tion 3. As evidenced by
their  execution  of  this
contract,  the  parties  to
this contract certify that
they  are  under  no  con-
tractual or other impedi-
ment that would prevent
them  from  complying
with the part 135 regula-
tions.
The Contractor agrees to
send  to  each  labor  or-
ganization or represent-
ative  of  workers  with
which  the  Contractor
has a collective bargain-
ing  agreement  or  other
understanding, if any, a
notice advising the labor
organization or workers’
representative  of  the
Contractor’s  commit-
ments  under  this  Sec-
tion  3  clause,  and  will
post  copies  of  the  no-
t ice  in  conspicuous
places  at  the  work  site
where  both  employees
and applicants for train-
ing and employment po-
sitions  can  see  the  no-
tice.  The  notices  shall
describe  the  Section  3
preference,  shall  set
forth  minimum  number
and job titles subject to
hire,  availability  of  ap-
prenticeships and train-
ing positions, the quali-
fications  of  each;  and
the name and location of
person(s) taking applica-
tions for each of the pos-
itions;  and  the  anticip-
ated date the work shall
begin.
The Contractor agrees to
include  this  Section  3
clause in every sub-con-
tract  subject  to  compli-
ance with regulation sin
24  CFR  part  135,  and
agrees to take appropri-
ate  action,  as  provided
in  the  applicable  provi-
sion of the sub-contract-
or  in  this  Section  3
clause,  upon  a  finding
that  the  sub-contractor
is in violation of the reg-
ulation  in  24  CFR  part
135. The Contractor will
not  sub-contract  with
a n y  s u b - c o n t r a c t o r
where  the  Contractor
has notice or knowledge
that  the  sub-contractor
has been found in viola-
tion of the regulation in
24 CFR part 135.
The Contractor will certi-
fy  that  any  vacant  em-
ployment  positions,  in-
cluding  training  posi-
tions,  that  are  filled  (1)
after  the  Contractor  is
selected  but  before  the
contract  is  executed,
and (2) with persons oth-
er  than  those  to  whom
the  regulations  of  24
CFR part 135 require em-
ployment  opportunities
to be directed, were not
filled  to  circumvent  the
Contractor’s  obligation
under  24  CFR part  135.
Noncompl iance  wi th
HUD’s regulations in 24
CFR part 135 may result
in  sanctions,  termina-
tion of  this contract  for
default,  and  debarment
or  suspension  from fu-
ture  HUD assisted con-
tracts.
With  respect  to  work
performed  in  connec-
t ion  wi th  Sect ion  3
covered Indian Housing
Assistance, Section 7(b)
of  the  Indian  Self-De-
termination and Educa-
tion Assistance Act  (25
U.S.C.  450e)  also  ap-
plies  to  the  work  to  be
performed  under  this
contract. Section 7(b) re-
q u i r e s  t h a t  t o  t h e
greatest  extent  feasible
(i) preference and oppor-
tunities for training and
employment shall be giv-
en  to  Indians,  and  (ii)
preference is the award
of  contracts  and  sub-
contracts shall be given
to  Indian  organizations
and  Indian-owned  Eco-
n o m i c  E n t e r p r i s e s .
Parties  to  this  contract
that  are  subject  to  the
provisions of  Section 3
and section 7(b) agree to
comply with Section 3 to
the  maximum  extent
feasib le ,  but  not  in
derogation  of  compli-
ance  with  section  7(b).
Federal  Forms  to  be
Submitted  with  Bid:
The forms contained in
Appendix C, including
Section 3 forms, must be
completed, and included
with the bid submittal.
Award of Contract:
The following are condi-
tions to the award of the
contract:
i. for any bid submitted on
or after March 1, 2015,
each contractor and sub-
contractor listed on the bid
must be registered with
the Department of Industri-
al Relations pursuant to
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1725.5, subject to the lim-
ited exceptions set forth in
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1771.1(a) (regarding the
submission of a bid as au-
thorized by Business &
Professions Code Section
7029.1 or Public Contract
Code Section 10164 or
20103.5, provided the con-
tractor is registered to per-
form public work pursuant
to Section 1725.5 at the
time the contract is awar-
ded); and
ii. ii. for any contract awar-
ded on or after April 1,
2015, no contractor or
subcontractor may be
awarded this contract un-
less the contractor and
each subcontractor listed
on the bid is registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations pursu-
ant to Section 1725.5.
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Sections 1777.5, 1777.6,
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title 8
of the California Code of
Regulations, Section 200,
et seq., to ensure compli-
ance and complete under-
standing of the law regard-
ing apprentices.
Federal  Labor  Stand-
ards  Provision:
Refer to the HUD-4010
forms are located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Current  Federal  DOL
Wage  Decision:
Refer to the Federal Wage
Decision, located in Ap-
pendix “D” of this docu-
ment.
Federal EEO and Affirm-
ative  Action  Require-
ments:
Refer to the Federal Equal
Employment Opportunity
and Affirmative Action Re-
quirements located in Ap-
pendix “c” of this docu-
ment.
Contracting with Small &
Minority Firms, Women’s
Business Enterprise:
Refer to the Contracting
wi th Smal l Bus iness ,
Minority Firms, Women's
Business Enterprise, and
Labor Surplus Area Firms,
Federal Contract Provi-
sion, located in Appendix
“C” of this document.
Compliance  with  Clean
Air  and  Water  Acts:
Refer to the Compliance
with Clean Air and Water
Acts, Federal Contract
Provision, located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Conflict of Interest:
In  the  procurement  of
supplies,  equipment,
construction,  and  ser-
vice  of  sub-recipients,
the  conflict-of-interest
provision  in  24  CFR
85.36,  OMB  Circular  A-
110 and 24 CFR 570.611
shall  apply. No employ-
ee, officer or agent of the
sub-recipient shall parti-
cipate  in  the  selection,
award, or administration
of a contract supported
by  federal  funds  in  a
conflict  of  interest,  real
or apparent, would be in-
volved.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an Development  Action
of 1968, as amended, 12
U.S.C. 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall, to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low- and very-low
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The  Bidder/Proposer  is
required to complete and
submit  the  Declaration
of Intent to Comply with
Section 3 Requirements
–  Required  Contract
Forms  and  Certif ica-
tions, certifying that they
intend  to  comply  with
the  requirement  of  the
Secretary  of  Labor  and
the  latest  amendments
to:  Executive  Orders
11246 and 11375, as sup-
plemented  in  Depart-
ment  of  Labor  regula-
tions  (41  CFR  chapter
60); the Copeland “Anti-
Kickback: Act (18 U.S.C.
s847)  as  supplemented
in  Department  of  Labor
regulations (29 CFR part
3);  Sections  3  of  the
Housing and Urban De-
velopment  Act  of  1968
(12  U.S.C.  s  1701  et
seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights  Act  of  1964  (42
U.S.C.  s2000);  Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community De-
velopment  Act  of  1974
(42  U.S.C.  s  5301  et
seq.); the Age Discrimin-
ation  Act  of  1975  (42
U.S.C.  s701  et  seq.).
Contractor  agrees  to
comply with the require-
ments of all other applic-
able  federal,  state  and
local  laws  and  regula-
tions.
Prospective bidders/pro-
posers  shall  carefully
read  the  information
within  this  bid  docu-
ment including the Sec-
tion  3  Provisions  for
H o u s i n g  a n d  C o m -
munity Development As-
sistance  and  Publ ic
Housing Assistance, as
amended. Proposals that
fail  to  comply  with  the
requirement of Section 3
will  be considered non-
respons ive  and  ex -
cluded from further con-
sideration.
To comply with SB 854,
beginning January 1, 2015
the following applies:
A. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be listed
on a bid proposal for pub-
lic works project (submit-
ted on or after March 1,
2015) unless registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations (DIR)
pursuant to Labor Code
section 1725.5 [with lim-
ited exceptions from this
requirement for bid pur-
poses only under Labor
Code section 1771.1(a)].
B. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be awar-
ded a contract for public
works on a public works
project awarded on or after
April 1, 2015, unless re-
gistered with the DIR.
C. The project is subject to
compliance monitoring and
enforcement by the DIR.
D. Require the prime con-
tractor to post job site no-
tices prescribed by regula-
tion (regulation not cre-
ated yet) or the City must
post the notices itself.
The Contractor shall fill
in the Department of In-
dustrial  Relations (DIR)
Contractor  Registration
Number  Form provided
in  Appendix  “C”  and
submit it with the sealed
Bid.
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Bids must be prepared on
the approved Proposal
forms or copies thereof in
conformance with the In-
structions to Bidders and
submitted in a sealed en-
velope plainly marked on
the outside as follows:
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sec t ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
RFI’S/QUESTIONS: The
deadline to submit All
RFI’s/Questions shall be
s u b m i t t e d p r i o r t o
Thursday, November 09,
2023  at  1:30  pm  to  the
OpenGov  website. Late
submittal shall not be con-
sidered.
SUBSTITUTIONS: All re-
q u e s t e d “ o r e q u a l ”
products shall be submit-
ted prior to the bid date for
review and evaluation with
a subsequent determina-
tion by the City if the “or
equal” product is satisfact-
ory for consideration and
be allowed to submitted
with the bid. The  dead-
line to submit “or equal”
items shall be Thursday,
November  09,  2023  at
1:30 pm to the OpenGov
website.  Late  “or  equal
submittals shall be rejec-
ted.
COMPLETION OF WORK:
The City is scheduling the
award of contract for Janu-
ary 9, 2023 On January
10, 2023 the City will is-
sue the Notice to Contract
Award requesting the con-
tractor to submit contracts,
bonds and insurance certi-
ficates and submitted to
the City within fifteen (15)
calendar days.
In order to accommodate
weed abatement proced-
ures. The City will issue a
Weed Abatement Proced-
ure Notice to Proceed for a
duration of twenty-working
(20) days. When this is
complete, the City will is-
sue the construction No-
tice to Proceed for a dura-
tion of one hundred and
twenty (120) working days
(Monday – Friday), as stip-
ulated in the written No-
tice to Proceed issued by
the City Engineer. Failure
to complete the Work with-
in the time set forth herein
will result in the imposition
of liquidated damages for
each day of delay, in the
amount set forth in Sec-
tion 39 of the General Pro-
visions.
OBTAINING PLANS AND
SPECIFICATIONS: Plans,
Specifications, and any
project addenda are avail-
able for download the new
City platform OpenGov, ht-
tps://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, and on the city’s
website, www.cityoflap-
alma.org. All prospective
bidders are responsible for
registering on OpenGov
and checking the City’s
website for the issuance of
any project addenda prior
to the bid opening for in-
clusion as part of the bid
proposal. Due to the post-
ing of the documents on
the city website, OpenGov
will maintain a plan holder
list. For project informa-
tion, please contact the of-
fice of the City Engineer at
(714) 690-3310.
BONDS: Pursuant to the
Instructions to Bidders,
each proposal shall be ac-
companied by cash or by a
cashier's or certified check
or by a bid bond in the
amount of ten  percent
(10%) of the amount of the
bid price payable to the
City of La Palma as a
guarantee that the bidder,
if his or her proposal is ac-
cepted, will promptly ex-
ecute the contract, secure
payment of workers’ com-
pensation insurance and
furnish a satisfactory faith-
ful performance bond in
the amount of one  hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price and a
labor and material bond
in the amount of one hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price.
SUBSTITUTION OF SE-
CURITIES: The Contract-
or may substitute securit-
ies for any monies with-
held by the City to ensure
performance under the
contract in compliance
with the requirements of
Public Contract Code Sec-
tion 22300 and the "Sub-
stitution of Securities" pro-
visions of the General Pro-
visions.
WAGE RATES: As re-
quired by Section 1773 of
the California Labor Code,
the Director of the Depart-
ment of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia has determined the
general prevailing rates of
wages in the locality in
which Work is scheduled
to be performed. Copies of
the wage rate determina-
tions, entitled PREVAIL-
ING WAGE SCALE, are
mainta ined at the La
Palma City Hall, 7822
Walker Street, La Palma,
California, and are avail-
able to any interested
party upon request. The
Contractor shall post a
copy of this document at
each job site. The Con-
tractor and any subcon-
tractor under it shall pay
not less than the specified
prevailing rates of wages
to all workers employed in
the execution of the Con-
tract.
C O N T R A C T O R ' S L I -
CENSE: In accordance
with the provisions of Cali-
fornia Publ ic Contract
Code Section 3300, the
City requires that the bid-
der possess the following
c l a s s i f i c a t i o n o f
contractor’s license at the
time that the bid proposal
is submitted: Class A, or
Specialty. If the license
classif ication specif ied
hereinabove is that of a
“specialty contractor” as
defined in Section 7058 of
the California Business
and Professions Code, the
specialty contractor awar-
ded the Contract for this
Work shall itself construct
a majority of the Work, in
accordance with the provi-
sions of California Busi-
ness and Professions
Code Section 7059. Each
bidder shall clearly write or
type their contractor’s li-
cense number on the out-
side of the bidding envel-
ope.
CONTRACTORS REGIS-
TRATION: In accordance
with the provisions of
L a b o r C o d e s e c t i o n
1771.1, a contractor or
subcontractor shall not be
qualified to (a) bid on or be
listed in a bid proposal or
(b) engage in the perform-
ance of this Work, unless
currently registered and
qualified to perform the
Work pursuant to Labor
Code Section 1725.5.
COMPLIANCE MONITOR-
ING AND ENFORCE-
MENT: Contractor’s per-
formance of the Work de-
scribed in this Notice Invit-
ing Bids is subject to com-
pliance monitoring and en-
forcement by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations.
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY:
The City hereby notifies all
bidders that it will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of sex,
race, color, or national ori-
gin in consideration for an
award.
C ITY 'S RIGHTS RE-
SERVED: The City of La
Palma reserves the right to
reject any and all propos-
als or bids, including the
bid of a bidder who has
been delinquent or unfaith-
ful in any former contract
with the City of La Palma,
or to waive any irregularit-
ies or informalities in any
bids or in the bidding,
should it deem this neces-
sary for the public good.
No bidder may withdraw
his or her bid for a period
of sixty (60) days after the
date from the opening
thereof.
This  is  a  federally  as-
sisted construction con-
tract .  Federal  Labor
Standards  Provisions,
including  prevai l ing
wage  requirements  of
the Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts (DBRA) will be
enforced. In the event of
a conflict  between Fed-
eral  and  State  wage
rates,  the  higher  of  the
two will  prevail.
The Contractor’s duty to
pay  State  prevai l ing
wages can be found un-
der Labor Code Section
1770  et  seq.  and  Labor
Code Sections 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties  for  failure  to  pay
prevailing  wages  and
employee  apprentices
including forfeitures and
debarment.
The  current  Federal
Wage  Decision  is  con-
tained  herein,  in  Ap-
pendix “B”, and may be
updated  via  addendum
to this bid package with-
in ten (10) days prior to
bid opening and can be
f o u n d  a t
http://www.wdol.gov/wd
ol/scafiles/davisbacon/c
a/html.  The  applicable
Federal  Wage  Decision
will be incorporated into
the  contract.  The  State
wage rates are available
o n l i n e  a t
http://www/dir.ca.gov/DL
S R / P W D / i n d e x . h t m .
Lower State wage rates
for  work classifications
not specifically included
in the Federal Wage De-
cision  are  not  accept-
able.  The  Contractor
may  request  an  Addi-
tional Classification and
Rate  if  work  classifica-
tion cannot be located in
the  Federal  Wage  De-
cision.
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t  a n d  a l l
Bidder/Proposers  must
commit to achieving es-
tablished requirements,
including  benchmarks,
for  Section  3  workers
and Targeted Section 3
workers  to  be  con-
sidered  a  Section  3  re-
sponsive  bidder/pro-
poser and eligible for  a
contract  award.
Assignment:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of Part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Contractor's License:
When federal funds are
being used, at the time of
“Award of the Contract”,
the Prime Contractor must
have a valid California
State Contractor's License
with a classification of “A
or  Specialty” in accord-
ance with provisions of
Chapter 9, Division 111,
Sections 7000 through
7145 of the Business and
Professions Code of the
State of California and the
Prime Contractor shall
warrant that it and all sub-
contractors are properly li-
censed, which includes
each entity having a local
business license. When
federal funds are not be-
ing used, a bid by a con-
tractor who is not properly
l icensed must be con-
sidered nonresponsive,
will be rejected by the City,
and the unlicensed con-
tractor may be subject to
discipline by the state.
Contractor  Eligibil ity
Check:
Prior to awarding a con-
tract, the City will verify the
contractor's (1) status with
the California Department
of Industrial Relations at
http://www.cslb.ca.gov and
https://efiling.dir.ca.gov
and (2 ) e l i g ib i l i t y a t
http://www.dir.ca.gov/dlse/
debar.html and with the
online excluded parties list
at the federal System For
A w a r d M a n a g e m e n t
( S A M ) w e b s i t e
h t t ps : / /www.sam.gov .
Affirmative Action:
All bidders are on notice
that the City will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of reli-
gious creed, sex, race, col-
or, national origin in con-
sideration for an award.
Moreover, no contractor
receiving the award may
discriminate nor permit
others he may hire to en-
gage in, discrimination in
the employment of per-
sons because of their
race, religious creed, col-
or, or national origin, an-
cestry, physical disability,
mental disability, medical
condition, genetic informa-
tion, marital status, sex,
gender, gender identity,
gender expression, age,
sexual orientation, or milit-
ary or veteran status, ex-
cept as provided in Gov-
ernment Code Section
12940.
DATED: October 18, 2023
CITY OF LA PALMA,
CALIFORNIA
By:__________________
___________
Andy Ramirez
Public Works and Com-
munity Services Director

News Enterprise
10/18/2023-135860
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CITY OF LA PALMA
NOTICE INVITING BIDS
VARIOUS MEDIAN IS-

LANDS PROJECT
(CITY PROJECT NO. ST-

371)
NOTICE INVITING BIDS:
Sealed proposals will be
received online via the
Ci ty ’ s e -Procurement
P o r t a l ( “ P o r t a l ” ) a t
https://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, office of the City En-
gineer, Community Ser-
vices Office, La Palma,
California, until 1:30  PM
on Thursday, November
30, 2023 for furnishing of
all labor, materials and
equipment for VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No. ST-371 (the “Project”).
The  Bids  shall  be  sub-
mitted to the City Engin-
eer  through  the  Open-
Gov.com  platform. All
prospective bidders are re-
sponsible for registering
on OpenGov and check-
ing the City’s website for
the issuance of any project
addenda prior to the bid
opening for inclusion as
part of the bid proposal.
Due to the posting of the
documents on the city
website, OpenGov wil l
maintain a plan holder list.
For project information,
please contact the office of
the City Engineer at (714)
690-3310. Sealed  bids
will  NOT  be  accepted.
The  BIDS  for  VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No.  ST-371,  SHALL  BE
SUBMITTED  THROUGH
OpenGov.
D E S C R I P T I O N O F
WORK: The work in-
cludes rehabilitation of the
La Palma Avenue Median
Islands from the west city
limits to the east city limits;
Walker Avenue Median Is-
lands from Orangethorpe
Avenue southerly; and
Moody Street from Cres-
cent Ave to Houston Ave
including the removal of
existing landscaping/irriga-
tion, tree removals, hard-
scape removals and re-
placement, installation of
new drip irrigation system,
planting of new trees along
w i t h n e w
landscaping/hardscaping
in the medians islands.
Also, included are new
median islands on Moody
Street from Malaga Aven-
ue to La Luna Avenue with
complete irrigation and
landscaping per the con-
tract plans and specifica-
tions.
This project is NOT sub-
ject to a project labor, sta-
bilization, collective bar-
gaining or community work
force agreements
The City received Feder-
al Funding through HUD
for  this  project.  There-
fore,  Federal  Davis  Ba-
con  wage  rates  are  ap-
pl ied  to  the  project.
However,  If  the  State
Prevailing  Wages  are
higher than the Federal
Wage Rates,  the higher
are to be applied the that
specific classification.
A  MANDATORY  AND
SECTIO N  3  PRE-BID
MEETING,  will  be  held
on Tuesday October 24,
2023  at  2:30  pm  at  the
City  of  Palma  Com-
munity Services Offices,
7821  Walker  Street,  La
Palma, CA 90623. In or-
der to receive considera-
tion for the Section 3 bid
preference,  a  bidder
must complete, sign and
submit  the  following
forms with their bid pro-
posal: 1) Section 3 Busi-
ness Certification Form,
and (b) Section 3 Resid-
ent Certification form(s).
A  reasonable  bid  must
be with the Zone of Con-
sideration at the time of
bid  evaluation. All con-
tractors are required to
have a representative at-
tend and sign in at the pre-
bid meeting. Failure to
comply with this attend-
ance and sign in require-
ments will result in the
Contactor’s proposal be-
ing found non-responsive
to the required proced-
ures.
Prevailing  Wage  State-
ment:
This contract will be fun-
ded in whole or in part with
Federal housing and com-
munity development funds.
Federal Labor Standard
Provisions, including pre-
vailing wage requirements
of Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts will be enforced.
A copy of the Federal
Wage Decision applicable
to this project is included
in the Bid Documents in
Appendix “B”. This project
is a public work in the
State of California, funded
in whole or in part with
public funds. Therefore,
the higher of the two ap-
plicable prevailing wage
rates federal or state, will
be enforced. The Contract-
or’s duty to pay State pre-
vai l ing wages can be
found under Labor Code
Section 1770 et seq. Labor
Code Section 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties for failure to pay pre-
vailing wages and to em-
ploy apprentices, includ-
ing forfeitures and de-
barment. State Wage De-
cision is on file at the City
Clerk’s office and is also
a v a i l a b l e O n l i n e a t
h t tp : / /d i r . ca .gov /d is r / .
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Section 1777.5, 1777.6
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title
8, California Administra-
tion Code, Section 200 et
seq. to ensure compliance
and complete understand-
ing of the law regarding
apprentices.
Fair  Employment  Prac-
tices/Equal Opportunity
Acts:
In the performance of this
Agreement, Contractor
shall comply with all ap-
plicable provisions of the
California Fair Employ-
ment Practices Act (Cali-
fornia Government Code
Section §§ C – 32 B-3
12940 et seq.), the applic-
able equal employment
provisions of the Civi l
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000e et seq.),
and the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990 (42
U.S.C. §§ 12101, et seq.).
Labor  Standards  and
Civil  Rights:
Contractor agrees to com-
ply with the requirements
of the Secretary of Labor
and the latest amend-
ments to: Executive Or-
ders 11246 and 11375, as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(41 C.F.R. chapter 60); the
Copeland “Anti-Kickback”
Act (18 U.S.C. § 847) as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(29 C.F.R. part 3); Section
3 of the Housing and Urb-
an Development Act of
1968 (12 U.S.C. §§ 1701
et seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000); Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community Devel-
opment Act of 1974 (42
U.S.C. §§ 5301 et seq.);
the Age Discrimination Act
of 1975 (42 U.S.C. §§
6101 et seq.); and Section
504 of the Rehabilitation
Act of 1973 (29 U.S.C. §§
701 et seq.). Contractor
agrees to comply with the
requirements of all other
applicable federal, State
and local laws and regula-
tions.
State Labor Standards &
Wage Requirements:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor
and all subcontractors
agree to follow the State
Labor standards. State
Labor standards provi-
sions, including prevailing
wage requirements, will be
enforced such that the
general rate of per diem
wages (prevailing wage)
shall be paid for each
craft, classification, or type
of worker needed to ex-
ecute the contract to all
workers employed in the
execution of the contract.
All contractors and sub-
contractors must furnish
electronic certified payroll
records directly to the
Labor Commissioner (aka
Division of Labor Stand-
ards Enforcement) as fur-
ther described in Article
VIII of the Agreement. The
State General Prevailing
Wage Determination is as
established by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations (available at
http://www.dir.ca.gov/DLS
R/PWD/index.htm). The
prevailing rate of per diem
wages are on file at the
City.
Section 3 Statement:
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t a n d a l l
Bidders/Proposers must
commit to achieving estab-
lished requirements, in-
cluding benchmarks, for
Section 3 workers and
Targeted Section 3 work-
ers to be considered a re-
sponsive bidder/proposer
and eligible for a contract
award. Section 3 Require-
ments, Clause, and Pro-
gram Forms can be loc-
ated in Appendix “A” of
this document.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an  Development  Act  of
1968,  as  amended,  12
U.S.C 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low and very low-
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The parties to this con-
tract  agree  to  comply
with  HUD’s  regulations
in  24  CFR  part  135,
which  implement  Sec-
tion 3. As evidenced by
their  execution  of  this
contract,  the  parties  to
this contract certify that
they  are  under  no  con-
tractual or other impedi-
ment that would prevent
them  from  complying
with the part 135 regula-
tions.
The Contractor agrees to
send  to  each  labor  or-
ganization or represent-
ative  of  workers  with
which  the  Contractor
has a collective bargain-
ing  agreement  or  other
understanding, if any, a
notice advising the labor
organization or workers’
representative  of  the
Contractor’s  commit-
ments  under  this  Sec-
tion  3  clause,  and  will
post  copies  of  the  no-
t ice  in  conspicuous
places  at  the  work  site
where  both  employees
and applicants for train-
ing and employment po-
sitions  can  see  the  no-
tice.  The  notices  shall
describe  the  Section  3
preference,  shall  set
forth  minimum  number
and job titles subject to
hire,  availability  of  ap-
prenticeships and train-
ing positions, the quali-
fications  of  each;  and
the name and location of
person(s) taking applica-
tions for each of the pos-
itions;  and  the  anticip-
ated date the work shall
begin.
The Contractor agrees to
include  this  Section  3
clause in every sub-con-
tract  subject  to  compli-
ance with regulation sin
24  CFR  part  135,  and
agrees to take appropri-
ate  action,  as  provided
in  the  applicable  provi-
sion of the sub-contract-
or  in  this  Section  3
clause,  upon  a  finding
that  the  sub-contractor
is in violation of the reg-
ulation  in  24  CFR  part
135. The Contractor will
not  sub-contract  with
a n y  s u b - c o n t r a c t o r
where  the  Contractor
has notice or knowledge
that  the  sub-contractor
has been found in viola-
tion of the regulation in
24 CFR part 135.
The Contractor will certi-
fy  that  any  vacant  em-
ployment  positions,  in-
cluding  training  posi-
tions,  that  are  filled  (1)
after  the  Contractor  is
selected  but  before  the
contract  is  executed,
and (2) with persons oth-
er  than  those  to  whom
the  regulations  of  24
CFR part 135 require em-
ployment  opportunities
to be directed, were not
filled  to  circumvent  the
Contractor’s  obligation
under  24  CFR part  135.
Noncompl iance  wi th
HUD’s regulations in 24
CFR part 135 may result
in  sanctions,  termina-
tion of  this contract  for
default,  and  debarment
or  suspension  from fu-
ture  HUD assisted con-
tracts.
With  respect  to  work
performed  in  connec-
t ion  wi th  Sect ion  3
covered Indian Housing
Assistance, Section 7(b)
of  the  Indian  Self-De-
termination and Educa-
tion Assistance Act  (25
U.S.C.  450e)  also  ap-
plies  to  the  work  to  be
performed  under  this
contract. Section 7(b) re-
q u i r e s  t h a t  t o  t h e
greatest  extent  feasible
(i) preference and oppor-
tunities for training and
employment shall be giv-
en  to  Indians,  and  (ii)
preference is the award
of  contracts  and  sub-
contracts shall be given
to  Indian  organizations
and  Indian-owned  Eco-
n o m i c  E n t e r p r i s e s .
Parties  to  this  contract
that  are  subject  to  the
provisions of  Section 3
and section 7(b) agree to
comply with Section 3 to
the  maximum  extent
feasib le ,  but  not  in
derogation  of  compli-
ance  with  section  7(b).
Federal  Forms  to  be
Submitted  with  Bid:
The forms contained in
Appendix C, including
Section 3 forms, must be
completed, and included
with the bid submittal.
Award of Contract:
The following are condi-
tions to the award of the
contract:
i. for any bid submitted on
or after March 1, 2015,
each contractor and sub-
contractor listed on the bid
must be registered with
the Department of Industri-
al Relations pursuant to
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1725.5, subject to the lim-
ited exceptions set forth in
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1771.1(a) (regarding the
submission of a bid as au-
thorized by Business &
Professions Code Section
7029.1 or Public Contract
Code Section 10164 or
20103.5, provided the con-
tractor is registered to per-
form public work pursuant
to Section 1725.5 at the
time the contract is awar-
ded); and
ii. ii. for any contract awar-
ded on or after April 1,
2015, no contractor or
subcontractor may be
awarded this contract un-
less the contractor and
each subcontractor listed
on the bid is registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations pursu-
ant to Section 1725.5.
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Sections 1777.5, 1777.6,
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title 8
of the California Code of
Regulations, Section 200,
et seq., to ensure compli-
ance and complete under-
standing of the law regard-
ing apprentices.
Federal  Labor  Stand-
ards  Provision:
Refer to the HUD-4010
forms are located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Current  Federal  DOL
Wage  Decision:
Refer to the Federal Wage
Decision, located in Ap-
pendix “D” of this docu-
ment.
Federal EEO and Affirm-
ative  Action  Require-
ments:
Refer to the Federal Equal
Employment Opportunity
and Affirmative Action Re-
quirements located in Ap-
pendix “c” of this docu-
ment.
Contracting with Small &
Minority Firms, Women’s
Business Enterprise:
Refer to the Contracting
wi th Smal l Bus iness ,
Minority Firms, Women's
Business Enterprise, and
Labor Surplus Area Firms,
Federal Contract Provi-
sion, located in Appendix
“C” of this document.
Compliance  with  Clean
Air  and  Water  Acts:
Refer to the Compliance
with Clean Air and Water
Acts, Federal Contract
Provision, located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Conflict of Interest:
In  the  procurement  of
supplies,  equipment,
construction,  and  ser-
vice  of  sub-recipients,
the  conflict-of-interest
provision  in  24  CFR
85.36,  OMB  Circular  A-
110 and 24 CFR 570.611
shall  apply. No employ-
ee, officer or agent of the
sub-recipient shall parti-
cipate  in  the  selection,
award, or administration
of a contract supported
by  federal  funds  in  a
conflict  of  interest,  real
or apparent, would be in-
volved.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an Development  Action
of 1968, as amended, 12
U.S.C. 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall, to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low- and very-low
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The  Bidder/Proposer  is
required to complete and
submit  the  Declaration
of Intent to Comply with
Section 3 Requirements
–  Required  Contract
Forms  and  Certif ica-
tions, certifying that they
intend  to  comply  with
the  requirement  of  the
Secretary  of  Labor  and
the  latest  amendments
to:  Executive  Orders
11246 and 11375, as sup-
plemented  in  Depart-
ment  of  Labor  regula-
tions  (41  CFR  chapter
60); the Copeland “Anti-
Kickback: Act (18 U.S.C.
s847)  as  supplemented
in  Department  of  Labor
regulations (29 CFR part
3);  Sections  3  of  the
Housing and Urban De-
velopment  Act  of  1968
(12  U.S.C.  s  1701  et
seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights  Act  of  1964  (42
U.S.C.  s2000);  Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community De-
velopment  Act  of  1974
(42  U.S.C.  s  5301  et
seq.); the Age Discrimin-
ation  Act  of  1975  (42
U.S.C.  s701  et  seq.).
Contractor  agrees  to
comply with the require-
ments of all other applic-
able  federal,  state  and
local  laws  and  regula-
tions.
Prospective bidders/pro-
posers  shall  carefully
read  the  information
within  this  bid  docu-
ment including the Sec-
tion  3  Provisions  for
H o u s i n g  a n d  C o m -
munity Development As-
sistance  and  Publ ic
Housing Assistance, as
amended. Proposals that
fail  to  comply  with  the
requirement of Section 3
will  be considered non-
respons ive  and  ex -
cluded from further con-
sideration.
To comply with SB 854,
beginning January 1, 2015
the following applies:
A. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be listed
on a bid proposal for pub-
lic works project (submit-
ted on or after March 1,
2015) unless registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations (DIR)
pursuant to Labor Code
section 1725.5 [with lim-
ited exceptions from this
requirement for bid pur-
poses only under Labor
Code section 1771.1(a)].
B. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be awar-
ded a contract for public
works on a public works
project awarded on or after
April 1, 2015, unless re-
gistered with the DIR.
C. The project is subject to
compliance monitoring and
enforcement by the DIR.
D. Require the prime con-
tractor to post job site no-
tices prescribed by regula-
tion (regulation not cre-
ated yet) or the City must
post the notices itself.
The Contractor shall fill
in the Department of In-
dustrial  Relations (DIR)
Contractor  Registration
Number  Form provided
in  Appendix  “C”  and
submit it with the sealed
Bid.
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Bids must be prepared on
the approved Proposal
forms or copies thereof in
conformance with the In-
structions to Bidders and
submitted in a sealed en-
velope plainly marked on
the outside as follows:
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
RFI’S/QUESTIONS: The
deadline to submit All
RFI’s/Questions shall be
s u b m i t t e d p r i o r t o
Thursday, November 09,
2023  at  1:30  pm  to  the
OpenGov  website. Late
submittal shall not be con-
sidered.
SUBSTITUTIONS: All re-
q u e s t e d “ o r e q u a l ”
products shall be submit-
ted prior to the bid date for
review and evaluation with
a subsequent determina-
tion by the City if the “or
equal” product is satisfact-
ory for consideration and
be allowed to submitted
with the bid. The  dead-
line to submit “or equal”
items shall be Thursday,
November  09,  2023  at
1:30 pm to the OpenGov
website.  Late  “or  equal
submittals shall be rejec-
ted.
COMPLETION OF WORK:
The City is scheduling the
award of contract for Janu-
ary 9, 2023 On January
10, 2023 the City will is-
sue the Notice to Contract
Award requesting the con-
tractor to submit contracts,
bonds and insurance certi-
ficates and submitted to
the City within fifteen (15)
calendar days.
In order to accommodate
weed abatement proced-
ures. The City will issue a
Weed Abatement Proced-
ure Notice to Proceed for a
duration of twenty-working
(20) days. When this is
complete, the City will is-
sue the construction No-
tice to Proceed for a dura-
tion of one hundred and
twenty (120) working days
(Monday – Friday), as stip-
ulated in the written No-
tice to Proceed issued by
the City Engineer. Failure
to complete the Work with-
in the time set forth herein
will result in the imposition
of liquidated damages for
each day of delay, in the
amount set forth in Sec-
tion 39 of the General Pro-
visions.
OBTAINING PLANS AND
SPECIFICATIONS: Plans,
Specifications, and any
project addenda are avail-
able for download the new
City platform OpenGov, ht-
tps://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, and on the city’s
website, www.cityoflap-
alma.org. All prospective
bidders are responsible for
registering on OpenGov
and checking the City’s
website for the issuance of
any project addenda prior
to the bid opening for in-
clusion as part of the bid
proposal. Due to the post-
ing of the documents on
the city website, OpenGov
will maintain a plan holder
list. For project informa-
tion, please contact the of-
fice of the City Engineer at
(714) 690-3310.
BONDS: Pursuant to the
Instructions to Bidders,
each proposal shall be ac-
companied by cash or by a
cashier's or certified check
or by a bid bond in the
amount of ten  percent
(10%) of the amount of the
bid price payable to the
City of La Palma as a
guarantee that the bidder,
if his or her proposal is ac-
cepted, will promptly ex-
ecute the contract, secure
payment of workers’ com-
pensation insurance and
furnish a satisfactory faith-
ful performance bond in
the amount of one  hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price and a
labor and material bond
in the amount of one hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price.
SUBSTITUTION OF SE-
CURITIES: The Contract-
or may substitute securit-
ies for any monies with-
held by the City to ensure
performance under the
contract in compliance
with the requirements of
Public Contract Code Sec-
tion 22300 and the "Sub-
stitution of Securities" pro-
visions of the General Pro-
visions.
WAGE RATES: As re-
quired by Section 1773 of
the California Labor Code,
the Director of the Depart-
ment of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia has determined the
general prevailing rates of
wages in the locality in
which Work is scheduled
to be performed. Copies of
the wage rate determina-
tions, entitled PREVAIL-
ING WAGE SCALE, are
mainta ined at the La
Palma City Hall, 7822
Walker Street, La Palma,
California, and are avail-
able to any interested
party upon request. The
Contractor shall post a
copy of this document at
each job site. The Con-
tractor and any subcon-
tractor under it shall pay
not less than the specified
prevailing rates of wages
to all workers employed in
the execution of the Con-
tract.
C O N T R A C T O R ' S L I -
CENSE: In accordance
with the provisions of Cali-
fornia Publ ic Contract
Code Section 3300, the
City requires that the bid-
der possess the following
c l a s s i f i c a t i o n o f
contractor’s license at the
time that the bid proposal
is submitted: Class A, or
Specialty. If the license
classif ication specif ied
hereinabove is that of a
“specialty contractor” as
defined in Section 7058 of
the California Business
and Professions Code, the
specialty contractor awar-
ded the Contract for this
Work shall itself construct
a majority of the Work, in
accordance with the provi-
sions of California Busi-
ness and Professions
Code Section 7059. Each
bidder shall clearly write or
type their contractor’s li-
cense number on the out-
side of the bidding envel-
ope.
CONTRACTORS REGIS-
TRATION: In accordance
with the provisions of
L a b o r C o d e s e c t i o n
1771.1, a contractor or
subcontractor shall not be
qualified to (a) bid on or be
listed in a bid proposal or
(b) engage in the perform-
ance of this Work, unless
currently registered and
qualified to perform the
Work pursuant to Labor
Code Section 1725.5.
COMPLIANCE MONITOR-
ING AND ENFORCE-
MENT: Contractor’s per-
formance of the Work de-
scribed in this Notice Invit-
ing Bids is subject to com-
pliance monitoring and en-
forcement by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations.
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY:
The City hereby notifies all
bidders that it will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of sex,
race, color, or national ori-
gin in consideration for an
award.
C ITY 'S RIGHTS RE-
SERVED: The City of La
Palma reserves the right to
reject any and all propos-
als or bids, including the
bid of a bidder who has
been delinquent or unfaith-
ful in any former contract
with the City of La Palma,
or to waive any irregularit-
ies or informalities in any
bids or in the bidding,
should it deem this neces-
sary for the public good.
No bidder may withdraw
his or her bid for a period
of sixty (60) days after the
date from the opening
thereof.
This  is  a  federally  as-
sisted construction con-
tract .  Federal  Labor
Standards  Provisions,
including  prevai l ing
wage  requirements  of
the Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts (DBRA) will be
enforced. In the event of
a conflict  between Fed-
eral  and  State  wage
rates,  the  higher  of  the
two will  prevail.
The Contractor’s duty to
pay  State  prevai l ing
wages can be found un-
der Labor Code Section
1770  et  seq.  and  Labor
Code Sections 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties  for  failure  to  pay
prevailing  wages  and
employee  apprentices
including forfeitures and
debarment.
The  current  Federal
Wage  Decision  is  con-
tained  herein,  in  Ap-
pendix “B”, and may be
updated  via  addendum
to this bid package with-
in ten (10) days prior to
bid opening and can be
f o u n d  a t
http://www.wdol.gov/wd
ol/scafiles/davisbacon/c
a/html.  The  applicable
Federal  Wage  Decision
will be incorporated into
the  contract.  The  State
wage rates are available
o n l i n e  a t
http://www/dir.ca.gov/DL
S R / P W D / i n d e x . h t m .
Lower State wage rates
for  work classifications
not specifically included
in the Federal Wage De-
cision  are  not  accept-
able.  The  Contractor
may  request  an  Addi-
tional Classification and
Rate  if  work  classifica-
tion cannot be located in
the  Federal  Wage  De-
cision.
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t  a n d  a l l
Bidder/Proposers  must
commit to achieving es-
tablished requirements,
including  benchmarks,
for  Section  3  workers
and Targeted Section 3
workers  to  be  con-
sidered  a  Section  3  re-
sponsive  bidder/pro-
poser and eligible for  a
contract  award.
Assignment:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of Part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Contractor's License:
When federal funds are
being used, at the time of
“Award of the Contract”,
the Prime Contractor must
have a valid California
State Contractor's License
with a classification of “A
or  Specialty” in accord-
ance with provisions of
Chapter 9, Division 111,
Sections 7000 through
7145 of the Business and
Professions Code of the
State of California and the
Prime Contractor shall
warrant that it and all sub-
contractors are properly li-
censed, which includes
each entity having a local
business license. When
federal funds are not be-
ing used, a bid by a con-
tractor who is not properly
l icensed must be con-
sidered nonresponsive,
will be rejected by the City,
and the unlicensed con-
tractor may be subject to
discipline by the state.
Contractor  Eligibil ity
Check:
Prior to awarding a con-
tract, the City will verify the
contractor's (1) status with
the California Department
of Industrial Relations at
http://www.cslb.ca.gov and
https://efiling.dir.ca.gov
and (2 ) e l i g ib i l i t y a t
http://www.dir.ca.gov/dlse/
debar.html and with the
online excluded parties list
at the federal System For
A w a r d M a n a g e m e n t
( S A M ) w e b s i t e
h t t ps : / /www.sam.gov .
Affirmative Action:
All bidders are on notice
that the City will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of reli-
gious creed, sex, race, col-
or, national origin in con-
sideration for an award.
Moreover, no contractor
receiving the award may
discriminate nor permit
others he may hire to en-
gage in, discrimination in
the employment of per-
sons because of their
race, religious creed, col-
or, or national origin, an-
cestry, physical disability,
mental disability, medical
condition, genetic informa-
tion, marital status, sex,
gender, gender identity,
gender expression, age,
sexual orientation, or milit-
ary or veteran status, ex-
cept as provided in Gov-
ernment Code Section
12940.
DATED: October 18, 2023
CITY OF LA PALMA,
CALIFORNIA
By:__________________
___________
Andy Ramirez
Public Works and Com-
munity Services Director

News Enterprise
10/18/2023-135860
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CITY OF LA PALMA
NOTICE INVITING BIDS
VARIOUS MEDIAN IS-

LANDS PROJECT
(CITY PROJECT NO. ST-

371)
NOTICE INVITING BIDS:
Sealed proposals will be
received online via the
Ci ty ’ s e -Procurement
P o r t a l ( “ P o r t a l ” ) a t
https://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, office of the City En-
gineer, Community Ser-
vices Office, La Palma,
California, until 1:30  PM
on Thursday, November
30, 2023 for furnishing of
all labor, materials and
equipment for VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No. ST-371 (the “Project”).
The  Bids  shall  be  sub-
mitted to the City Engin-
eer  through  the  Open-
Gov.com  platform. All
prospective bidders are re-
sponsible for registering
on OpenGov and check-
ing the City’s website for
the issuance of any project
addenda prior to the bid
opening for inclusion as
part of the bid proposal.
Due to the posting of the
documents on the city
website, OpenGov wil l
maintain a plan holder list.
For project information,
please contact the office of
the City Engineer at (714)
690-3310. Sealed  bids
will  NOT  be  accepted.
The  BIDS  for  VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No.  ST-371,  SHALL  BE
SUBMITTED  THROUGH
OpenGov.
D E S C R I P T I O N O F
WORK: The work in-
cludes rehabilitation of the
La Palma Avenue Median
Islands from the west city
limits to the east city limits;
Walker Avenue Median Is-
lands from Orangethorpe
Avenue southerly; and
Moody Street from Cres-
cent Ave to Houston Ave
including the removal of
existing landscaping/irriga-
tion, tree removals, hard-
scape removals and re-
placement, installation of
new drip irrigation system,
planting of new trees along
w i t h n e w
landscaping/hardscaping
in the medians islands.
Also, included are new
median islands on Moody
Street from Malaga Aven-
ue to La Luna Avenue with
complete irrigation and
landscaping per the con-
tract plans and specifica-
tions.
This project is NOT sub-
ject to a project labor, sta-
bilization, collective bar-
gaining or community work
force agreements
The City received Feder-
al Funding through HUD
for  this  project.  There-
fore,  Federal  Davis  Ba-
con  wage  rates  are  ap-
pl ied  to  the  project .
However,  If  the  State
Prevailing  Wages  are
higher than the Federal
Wage Rates,  the higher
are to be applied the that
specific classification.
A  MANDATORY  AND
SECTION  3  PRE-BID
MEETING,  will  be  held
on Tuesday October 24,
2023  at  2:30  pm  at  the
City  of  Palma  Com-
munity Services Offices,
7821  Walker  Street,  La
Palma, CA 90623. In or-
der to receive considera-
tion for the Section 3 bid
preference,  a  bidder
must complete, sign and
submit  the  following
forms with their bid pro-
posal: 1) Section 3 Busi-
ness Certification Form,
and (b) Section 3 Resid-
ent Certification form(s).
A  reasonable  bid  must
be with the Zone of Con-
sideration at the time of
bid  evaluation. All con-
tractors are required to
have a representative at-
tend and sign in at the pre-
bid meeting. Failure to
comply with this attend-
ance and sign in require-
ments will result in the
Contactor’s proposal be-
ing found non-responsive
to the required proced-
ures.
Prevailing  Wage  State-
ment:
This contract will be fun-
ded in whole or in part with
Federal housing and com-
munity development funds.
Federal Labor Standard
Provisions, including pre-
vailing wage requirements
of Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts will be enforced.
A copy of the Federal
Wage Decision applicable
to this project is included
in the Bid Documents in
Appendix “B”. This project
is a public work in the
State of California, funded
in whole or in part with
public funds. Therefore,
the higher of the two ap-
plicable prevailing wage
rates federal or state, will
be enforced. The Contract-
or’s duty to pay State pre-
vai l ing wages can be
found under Labor Code
Section 1770 et seq. Labor
Code Section 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties for failure to pay pre-
vailing wages and to em-
ploy apprentices, includ-
ing forfeitures and de-
barment. State Wage De-
cision is on file at the City
Clerk’s office and is also
a v a i l a b l e O n l i n e a t
h t tp : / /d i r . ca .gov /d is r / .
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Section 1777.5, 1777.6
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title
8, California Administra-
tion Code, Section 200 et
seq. to ensure compliance
and complete understand-
ing of the law regarding
apprentices.
Fair  Employment  Prac-
tices/Equal Opportunity
Acts:
In the performance of this
Agreement, Contractor
shall comply with all ap-
plicable provisions of the
California Fair Employ-
ment Practices Act (Cali-
fornia Government Code
Section §§ C – 32 B-3
12940 et seq.), the applic-
able equal employment
provisions of the Civi l
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000e et seq.),
and the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990 (42
U.S.C. §§ 12101, et seq.).
Labor  Standards  and
Civil  Rights:
Contractor agrees to com-
ply with the requirements
of the Secretary of Labor
and the latest amend-
ments to: Executive Or-
ders 11246 and 11375, as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(41 C.F.R. chapter 60); the
Copeland “Anti-Kickback”
Act (18 U.S.C. § 847) as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(29 C.F.R. part 3); Section
3 of the Housing and Urb-
an Development Act of
1968 (12 U.S.C. §§ 1701
et seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000); Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community Devel-
opment Act of 1974 (42
U.S.C. §§ 5301 et seq.);
the Age Discrimination Act
of 1975 (42 U.S.C. §§
6101 et seq.); and Section
504 of the Rehabilitation
Act of 1973 (29 U.S.C. §§
701 et seq.). Contractor
agrees to comply with the
requirements of all other
applicable federal, State
and local laws and regula-
tions.
State Labor Standards &
Wage Requirements:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor
and all subcontractors
agree to follow the State
Labor standards. State
Labor standards provi-
sions, including prevailing
wage requirements, will be
enforced such that the
general rate of per diem
wages (prevailing wage)
shall be paid for each
craft, classification, or type
of worker needed to ex-
ecute the contract to all
workers employed in the
execution of the contract.
All contractors and sub-
contractors must furnish
electronic certified payroll
records directly to the
Labor Commissioner (aka
Division of Labor Stand-
ards Enforcement) as fur-
ther described in Article
VIII of the Agreement. The
State General Prevailing
Wage Determination is as
established by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations (available at
http://www.dir.ca.gov/DLS
R/PWD/index.htm). The
prevailing rate of per diem
wages are on file at the
City.
Section 3 Statement:
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t a n d a l l
Bidders/Proposers must
commit to achieving estab-
lished requirements, in-
cluding benchmarks, for
Section 3 workers and
Targeted Section 3 work-
ers to be considered a re-
sponsive bidder/proposer
and eligible for a contract
award. Section 3 Require-
ments, Clause, and Pro-
gram Forms can be loc-
ated in Appendix “A” of
this document.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an  Development  Act  of
1968,  as  amended,  12
U.S.C 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low and very low-
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The parties to this con-
tract  agree  to  comply
with  HUD’s  regulations
in  24  CFR  part  135,
which  implement  Sec-
tion 3. As evidenced by
their  execution  of  this
contract,  the  parties  to
this contract certify that
they  are  under  no  con-
tractual or other impedi-
ment that would prevent
them  from  complying
with the part 135 regula-
tions.
The Contractor agrees to
send  to  each  labor  or-
ganization or represent-
ative  of  workers  with
which  the  Contractor
has a collective bargain-
ing  agreement  or  other
understanding, if any, a
notice advising the labor
organization or workers’
representative  of  the
Contractor’s  commit-
ments  under  this  Sec-
tion  3  clause,  and  will
post  copies  of  the  no-
t ice  in  conspicuous
places  at  the  work  site
where  both  employees
and applicants for train-
ing and employment po-
sitions  can  see  the  no-
tice.  The  notices  shall
describe  the  Section  3
preference,  shall  set
forth  minimum  number
and job titles subject to
hire,  availability  of  ap-
prenticeships and train-
ing positions, the quali-
fications  of  each;  and
the name and location of
person(s) taking applica-
tions for each of the pos-
itions;  and  the  anticip-
ated date the work shall
begin.
The Contractor agrees to
include  this  Section  3
clause in every sub-con-
tract  subject  to  compli-
ance with regulation sin
24  CFR  part  135,  and
agrees to take appropri-
ate  action,  as  provided
in  the  applicable  provi-
sion of the sub-contract-
or  in  this  Section  3
clause,  upon  a  finding
that  the  sub-contractor
is in violation of the reg-
ulation  in  24  CFR  part
135. The Contractor will
not  sub-contract  with
a n y  s u b - c o n t r a c t o r
where  the  Contractor
has notice or knowledge
that  the  sub-contractor
has been found in viola-
tion of the regulation in
24 CFR part 135.
The Contractor will certi-
fy  that  any  vacant  em-
ployment  positions,  in-
cluding  training  posi-
tions,  that  are  filled  (1)
after  the  Contractor  is
selected  but  before  the
contract  is  executed,
and (2) with persons oth-
er  than  those  to  whom
the  regulations  of  24
CFR part 135 require em-
ployment  opportunities
to be directed, were not
filled  to  circumvent  the
Contractor’s  obligation
under  24  CFR part  135.
Noncompl iance  wi th
HUD’s regulations in 24
CFR part 135 may result
in  sanctions,  termina-
tion of  this contract  for
default,  and  debarment
or  suspension  from fu-
ture  HUD assisted con-
tracts.
With  respect  to  work
performed  in  connec-
t ion  wi th  Sect ion  3
covered Indian Housing
Assistance, Section 7(b)
of  the  Indian  Self-De-
termination and Educa-
tion Assistance Act  (25
U.S.C.  450e)  also  ap-
plies  to  the  work  to  be
performed  under  this
contract. Section 7(b) re-
q u i r e s  t h a t  t o  t h e
greatest  extent  feasible
(i) preference and oppor-
tunities for training and
employment shall be giv-
en  to  Indians,  and  (ii)
preference is the award
of  contracts  and  sub-
contracts shall be given
to  Indian  organizations
and  Indian-owned  Eco-
n o m i c  E n t e r p r i s e s .
Parties  to  this  contract
that  are  subject  to  the
provisions of  Section 3
and section 7(b) agree to
comply with Section 3 to
the  maximum  extent
feasib le ,  but  not  in
derogation  of  compli-
ance  with  section  7(b).
Federal  Forms  to  be
Submitted  with  Bid:
The forms contained in
Appendix C, including
Section 3 forms, must be
completed, and included
with the bid submittal.
Award of Contract:
The following are condi-
tions to the award of the
contract:
i. for any bid submitted on
or after March 1, 2015,
each contractor and sub-
contractor listed on the bid
must be registered with
the Department of Industri-
al Relations pursuant to
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1725.5, subject to the lim-
ited exceptions set forth in
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1771.1(a) (regarding the
submission of a bid as au-
thorized by Business &
Professions Code Section
7029.1 or Public Contract
Code Section 10164 or
20103.5, provided the con-
tractor is registered to per-
form public work pursuant
to Section 1725.5 at the
time the contract is awar-
ded); and
ii. ii. for any contract awar-
ded on or after April 1,
2015, no contractor or
subcontractor may be
awarded this contract un-
less the contractor and
each subcontractor listed
on the bid is registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations pursu-
ant to Section 1725.5.
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Sections 1777.5, 1777.6,
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title 8
of the California Code of
Regulations, Section 200,
et seq., to ensure compli-
ance and complete under-
standing of the law regard-
ing apprentices.
Federal  Labor  Stand-
ards  Provision:
Refer to the HUD-4010
forms are located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Current  Federal  DOL
Wage  Decision:
Refer to the Federal Wage
Decision, located in Ap-
pendix “D” of this docu-
ment.
Federal EEO and Affirm-
ative  Action  Require-
ments:
Refer to the Federal Equal
Employment Opportunity
and Affirmative Action Re-
quirements located in Ap-
pendix “c” of this docu-
ment.
Contracting with Small &
Minority Firms, Women’s
Business Enterprise:
Refer to the Contracting
wi th Smal l Bus iness ,
Minority Firms, Women's
Business Enterprise, and
Labor Surplus Area Firms,
Federal Contract Provi-
sion, located in Appendix
“C” of this document.
Compliance  with  Clean
Air  and  Water  Acts:
Refer to the Compliance
with Clean Air and Water
Acts, Federal Contract
Provision, located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Conflict of Interest:
In  the  procurement  of
supplies,  equipment,
construction,  and  ser-
vice  of  sub-recipients,
the  conflict-of-interest
provision  in  24  CFR
85.36,  OMB  Circular  A-
110 and 24 CFR 570.611
shall  apply. No employ-
ee, officer or agent of the
sub-recipient shall parti-
cipate  in  the  selection,
award, or administration
of a contract supported
by  federal  funds  in  a
conflict  of  interest,  real
or apparent, would be in-
volved.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an Development  Action
of 1968, as amended, 12
U.S.C. 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall, to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low- and very-low
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The  Bidder/Proposer  is
required to complete and
submit  the  Declaration
of Intent to Comply with
Section 3 Requirements
–  Required  Contract
Forms  and  Certif ica-
tions, certifying that they
intend  to  comply  with
the  requirement  of  the
Secretary  of  Labor  and
the  latest  amendments
to:  Executive  Orders
11246 and 11375, as sup-
plemented  in  Depart-
ment  of  Labor  regula-
tions  (41  CFR  chapter
60); the Copeland “Anti-
Kickback: Act (18 U.S.C.
s847)  as  supplemented
in  Department  of  Labor
regulations (29 CFR part
3);  Sections  3  of  the
Housing and Urban De-
velopment  Act  of  1968
(12  U.S.C.  s  1701  et
seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights  Act  of  1964  (42
U.S.C.  s2000);  Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community De-
velopment  Act  of  1974
(42  U.S.C.  s  5301  et
seq.); the Age Discrimin-
ation  Act  of  1975  (42
U.S.C.  s701  et  seq.).
Contractor  agrees  to
comply with the require-
ments of all other applic-
able  federal,  state  and
local  laws  and  regula-
tions.
Prospective bidders/pro-
posers  shall  carefully
read  the  information
within  this  bid  docu-
ment including the Sec-
tion  3  Provisions  for
H o u s i n g  a n d  C o m -
munity Development As-
sistance  and  Publ ic
Housing Assistance, as
amended. Proposals that
fail  to  comply  with  the
requirement of Section 3
will  be considered non-
respons ive  and  ex -
cluded from further con-
sideration.
To comply with SB 854,
beginning January 1, 2015
the following applies:
A. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be listed
on a bid proposal for pub-
lic works project (submit-
ted on or after March 1,
2015) unless registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations (DIR)
pursuant to Labor Code
section 1725.5 [with lim-
ited exceptions from this
requirement for bid pur-
poses only under Labor
Code section 1771.1(a)].
B. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be awar-
ded a contract for public
works on a public works
project awarded on or after
April 1, 2015, unless re-
gistered with the DIR.
C. The project is subject to
compliance monitoring and
enforcement by the DIR.
D. Require the prime con-
tractor to post job site no-
tices prescribed by regula-
tion (regulation not cre-
ated yet) or the City must
post the notices itself.
The Contractor shall fill
in the Department of In-
dustrial  Relations (DIR)
Contractor  Registration
Number  Form provided
in  Appendix  “C”  and
submit it with the sealed
Bid.
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Bids must be prepared on
the approved Proposal
forms or copies thereof in
conformance with the In-
structions to Bidders and
submitted in a sealed en-
velope plainly marked on
the outside as follows:
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
RFI’S/QUESTIONS: The
deadline to submit All
RFI’s/Questions shall be
s u b m i t t e d p r i o r t o
Thursday, November 09,
2023  at  1:30  pm  to  the
OpenGov  website. Late
submittal shall not be con-
sidered.
SUBSTITUTIONS: All re-
q u e s t e d “ o r e q u a l ”
products shall be submit-
ted prior to the bid date for
review and evaluation with
a subsequent determina-
tion by the City if the “or
equal” product is satisfact-
ory for consideration and
be allowed to submitted
with the bid. The  dead-
line to submit “or equal”
items shall be Thursday,
November  09,  2023  at
1:30 pm to the OpenGov
website.  Late  “or  equal
submittals shall be rejec-
ted.
COMPLETION OF WORK:
The City is scheduling the
award of contract for Janu-
ary 9, 2023 On January
10, 2023 the City will is-
sue the Notice to Contract
Award requesting the con-
tractor to submit contracts,
bonds and insurance certi-
ficates and submitted to
the City within fifteen (15)
calendar days.
In order to accommodate
weed abatement proced-
ures. The City will issue a
Weed Abatement Proced-
ure Notice to Proceed for a
duration of twenty-working
(20) days. When this is
complete, the City will is-
sue the construction No-
tice to Proceed for a dura-
tion of one hundred and
twenty (120) working days
(Monday – Friday), as stip-
ulated in the written No-
tice to Proceed issued by
the City Engineer. Failure
to complete the Work with-
in the time set forth herein
will result in the imposition
of liquidated damages for
each day of delay, in the
amount set forth in Sec-
tion 39 of the General Pro-
visions.
OBTAINING PLANS AND
SPECIFICATIONS: Plans,
Specifications, and any
project addenda are avail-
able for download the new
City platform OpenGov, ht-
tps://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, and on the city’s
website, www.cityoflap-
alma.org. All prospective
bidders are responsible for
registering on OpenGov
and checking the City’s
website for the issuance of
any project addenda prior
to the bid opening for in-
clusion as part of the bid
proposal. Due to the post-
ing of the documents on
the city website, OpenGov
will maintain a plan holder
list. For project informa-
tion, please contact the of-
fice of the City Engineer at
(714) 690-3310.
BONDS: Pursuant to the
Instructions to Bidders,
each proposal shall be ac-
companied by cash or by a
cashier's or certified check
or by a bid bond in the
amount of ten  percent
(10%) of the amount of the
bid price payable to the
City of La Palma as a
guarantee that the bidder,
if his or her proposal is ac-
cepted, will promptly ex-
ecute the contract, secure
payment of workers’ com-
pensation insurance and
furnish a satisfactory faith-
ful performance bond in
the amount of one  hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price and a
labor and material bond
in the amount of one hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price.
SUBSTITUTION OF SE-
CURITIES: The Contract-
or may substitute securit-
ies for any monies with-
held by the City to ensure
performance under the
contract in compliance
with the requirements of
Public Contract Code Sec-
tion 22300 and the "Sub-
stitution of Securities" pro-
visions of the General Pro-
visions.
WAGE RATES: As re-
quired by Section 1773 of
the California Labor Code,
the Director of the Depart-
ment of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia has determined the
general prevailing rates of
wages in the locality in
which Work is scheduled
to be performed. Copies of
the wage rate determina-
tions, entitled PREVAIL-
ING WAGE SCALE, are
mainta ined at the La
Palma City Hall, 7822
Walker Street, La Palma,
California, and are avail-
able to any interested
party upon request. The
Contractor shall post a
copy of this document at
each job site. The Con-
tractor and any subcon-
tractor under it shall pay
not less than the specified
prevailing rates of wages
to all workers employed in
the execution of the Con-
tract.
C O N T R A C T O R ' S L I -
CENSE: In accordance
with the provisions of Cali-
fornia Publ ic Contract
Code Section 3300, the
City requires that the bid-
der possess the following
c l a s s i f i c a t i o n o f
contractor’s license at the
time that the bid proposal
is submitted: Class A, or
Specialty. If the license
classif ication specif ied
hereinabove is that of a
“specialty contractor” as
defined in Section 7058 of
the California Business
and Professions Code, the
specialty contractor awar-
ded the Contract for this
Work shall itself construct
a majority of the Work, in
accordance with the provi-
sions of California Busi-
ness and Professions
Code Section 7059. Each
bidder shall clearly write or
type their contractor’s li-
cense number on the out-
side of the bidding envel-
ope.
CONTRACTORS REGIS-
TRATION: In accordance
with the provisions of
L a b o r C o d e s e c t i o n
1771.1, a contractor or
subcontractor shall not be
qualified to (a) bid on or be
listed in a bid proposal or
(b) engage in the perform-
ance of this Work, unless
currently registered and
qualified to perform the
Work pursuant to Labor
Code Section 1725.5.
COMPLIANCE MONITOR-
ING AND ENFORCE-
MENT: Contractor’s per-
formance of the Work de-
scribed in this Notice Invit-
ing Bids is subject to com-
pliance monitoring and en-
forcement by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations.
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY:
The City hereby notifies all
bidders that it will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of sex,
race, color, or national ori-
gin in consideration for an
award.
C ITY 'S RIGHTS RE-
SERVED: The City of La
Palma reserves the right to
reject any and all propos-
als or bids, including the
bid of a bidder who has
been delinquent or unfaith-
ful in any former contract
with the City of La Palma,
or to waive any irregularit-
ies or informalities in any
bids or in the bidding,
should it deem this neces-
sary for the public good.
No bidder may withdraw
his or her bid for a period
of sixty (60) days after the
date from the opening
thereof.
This  is  a  federally  as-
sisted construction con-
tract .  Federal  Labor
Standards  Provisions,
including  prevai l ing
wage  requirements  of
the Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts (DBRA) will be
enforced. In the event of
a conflict  between Fed-
eral  and  State  wage
rates,  the  higher  of  the
two will  prevail.
The Contractor’s duty to
pay  State  prevai l ing
wages can be found un-
der Labor Code Section
1770  et  seq.  and  Labor
Code Sections 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties  for  failure  to  pay
prevailing  wages  and
employee  apprentices
including forfeitures and
debarment.
The  current  Federal
Wage  Decision  is  con-
tained  herein,  in  Ap-
pendix “B”, and may be
updated  via  addendum
to this bid package with-
in ten (10) days prior to
bid opening and can be
f o u n d  a t
http://www.wdol.gov/wd
ol/scafiles/davisbacon/c
a/html.  The  applicable
Federal  Wage  Decision
will be incorporated into
the  contract.  The  State
wage rates are available
o n l i n e  a t
http://www/dir.ca.gov/DL
S R / P W D / i n d e x . h t m .
Lower State wage rates
for  work classifications
not specifically included
in the Federal Wage De-
cision  are  not  accept-
able.  The  Contractor
may  request  an  Addi-
tional Classification and
Rate  if  work  classifica-
tion cannot be located in
the  Federal  Wage  De-
cision.
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t  a n d  a l l
Bidder/Proposers  must
commit to achieving es-
tablished requirements,
including  benchmarks,
for  Section  3  workers
and Targeted Section 3
workers  to  be  con-
sidered  a  Section  3  re-
sponsive  bidder/pro-
poser and eligible for  a
contract  award.
Assignment:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of Part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Contractor's License:
When federal funds are
being used, at the time of
“Award of the Contract”,
the Prime Contractor must
have a valid California
State Contractor's License
with a classification of “A
or  Specialty” in accord-
ance with provisions of
Chapter 9, Division 111,
Sections 7000 through
7145 of the Business and
Professions Code of the
State of California and the
Prime Contractor shall
warrant that it and all sub-
contractors are properly li-
censed, which includes
each entity having a local
business license. When
federal funds are not be-
ing used, a bid by a con-
tractor who is not properly
l icensed must be con-
sidered nonresponsive,
will be rejected by the City,
and the unlicensed con-
tractor may be subject to
discipline by the state.
Contractor  Eligibil ity
Check:
Prior to awarding a con-
tract, the City will verify the
contractor's (1) status with
the California Department
of Industrial Relations at
http://www.cslb.ca.gov and
https://efiling.dir.ca.gov
and (2 ) e l i g ib i l i t y a t
http://www.dir.ca.gov/dlse/
debar.html and with the
online excluded parties list
at the federal System For
A w a r d M a n a g e m e n t
( S A M ) w e b s i t e
h t t ps : / /www.sam.gov .
Affirmative Action:
All bidders are on notice
that the City will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of reli-
gious creed, sex, race, col-
or, national origin in con-
sideration for an award.
Moreover, no contractor
receiving the award may
discriminate nor permit
others he may hire to en-
gage in, discrimination in
the employment of per-
sons because of their
race, religious creed, col-
or, or national origin, an-
cestry, physical disability,
mental disability, medical
condition, genetic informa-
tion, marital status, sex,
gender, gender identity,
gender expression, age,
sexual orientation, or milit-
ary or veteran status, ex-
cept as provided in Gov-
ernment Code Section
12940.
DATED: October 18, 2023
CITY OF LA PALMA,
CALIFORNIA
By:__________________
___________
Andy Ramirez
Public Works and Com-
munity Services Director

News Enterprise
10/18/2023-135860

Legals-NE

AMENDED ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
30-2023-01348335

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Petitioner: XIA
YUAN CAO filed for a peti-
tion with this court for a
decree changing names
as fol lows: XIA YUAN
CAO to LYDIA SING LAW.
THE COURT ORDERS
that all persons interested
in this matter shall appear
before this court at the
hearing indicated below to
show cause, if any, why
the petition for change of
name should not be gran-
ted. Any person objecting
to the name changes de-
scribed above must file a
written objection that in-
cludes the reasons for the
objection at least two court
days before the matter is
scheduled to be heard and
must appear at the hear-
ing to show cause why the
petit ion should not be
granted. If no written ob-
jection is timely filed, the
court may grant the peti-
tion without a hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
10/24/2023 8:30 a.m.,
Dept. D100 REMOTE
Central Justice Center
700 Civic Center Drive

West
Santa Ana, CA 92701

(To appear remote ly ,
check in advance of the
hearing for information
about how to do so on the
court's website. To find
your court's website, go to
www.courts.ca.gov/find-
my-court.htm)
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following newspa-
per of general circulation,
printed in this county:
Event News Enterprise
DATE: 09/20/2023
Judge Layne H. Melzer
Judge of the
Superior Court

Event News Enterprise
9/27,10/4,11,18/23-

135053

CITY OF LA PALMA
NOTICE INVITING BIDS
VARIOUS MEDIAN IS-

LANDS PROJECT
(CITY PROJECT NO. ST-

371)
NOTICE INVITING BIDS:
Sealed proposals will be
received online via the
Ci ty ’ s e -Procurement
P o r t a l ( “ P o r t a l ” ) a t
https://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, office of the City En-
gineer, Community Ser-
vices Office, La Palma,
California, until 1:30  PM
on Thursday, November
30, 2023 for furnishing of
all labor, materials and
equipment for VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No. ST-371 (the “Project”).
The  Bids  shall  be  sub-
mitted to the City Engin-
eer  through  the  Open-
Gov.com  platform. All
prospective bidders are re-
sponsible for registering
on OpenGov and check-
ing the City’s website for
the issuance of any project
addenda prior to the bid
opening for inclusion as
part of the bid proposal.
Due to the posting of the
documents on the city
website, OpenGov wil l
maintain a plan holder list.
For project information,
please contact the office of
the City Engineer at (714)
690-3310. Sealed  bids
will  NOT  be  accepted.
The  BIDS  for  VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No.  ST-371,  SHALL  BE
SUBMITTED  THROUGH
OpenGov.
D E S C R I P T I O N O F
WORK: The work in-
cludes rehabilitation of the
La Palma Avenue Median
Islands from the west city
limits to the east city limits;
Walker Avenue Median Is-
lands from Orangethorpe
Avenue southerly; and
Moody Street from Cres-
cent Ave to Houston Ave
including the removal of
existing landscaping/irriga-
tion, tree removals, hard-
scape removals and re-
placement, installation of
new drip irrigation system,
planting of new trees along
w i t h n e w
landscaping/hardscaping
in the medians islands.
Also, included are new
median islands on Moody
Street from Malaga Aven-
ue to La Luna Avenue with
complete irrigation and
landscaping per the con-
tract plans and specifica-
tions.
This project is NOT sub-
ject to a project labor, sta-
bilization, collective bar-
gaining or community work
force agreements
The City received Feder-
al Funding through HUD
for  this  project.  There-
fore,  Federal  Davis  Ba-
con  wage  rates  are  ap-
pl ied  to  the  project.
However,  If  the  State
Prevail ing  Wages  are
higher than the Federal
Wage Rates,  the higher
are to be applied the that
specific classification.
A  MANDATORY  AND
SECTION  3  PRE-BID
MEETING,  will  be  held
on Tuesday October 24,
2023  at  2:30  pm  at  the
City  of  Palma  Com-
munity Services Offices,
7821  Walker  Street,  La
Palma, CA 90623. In or-
der to receive considera-
tion for the Section 3 bid
preference,  a  bidder
must complete, sign and
submit  the  fol lowing
forms with their bid pro-
posal: 1) Section 3 Busi-
ness Certification Form,
and (b) Section 3 Resid-
ent Certification form(s).
A  reasonable  bid  must
be with the Zone of Con-
sideration at the time of
bid  evaluation. All con-
tractors are required to
have a representative at-
tend and sign in at the pre-
bid meeting. Failure to
comply with this attend-
ance and sign in require-
ments will result in the
Contactor’s proposal be-
ing found non-responsive
to the required proced-
ures.
Prevailing  Wage  State-
ment:
This contract will be fun-
ded in whole or in part with
Federal housing and com-
munity development funds.
Federal Labor Standard
Provisions, including pre-
vailing wage requirements
of Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts will be enforced.
A copy of the Federal
Wage Decision applicable
to this project is included
in the Bid Documents in
Appendix “B”. This project
is a public work in the
State of California, funded
in whole or in part with
public funds. Therefore,
the higher of the two ap-
plicable prevailing wage
rates federal or state, will
be enforced. The Contract-
or’s duty to pay State pre-
vai l ing wages can be
found under Labor Code
Section 1770 et seq. Labor
Code Section 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties for failure to pay pre-
vailing wages and to em-
ploy apprentices, includ-
ing forfeitures and de-
barment. State Wage De-
cision is on file at the City
Clerk’s office and is also
a v a i l a b l e O n l i n e a t
h t tp : / /d i r . ca .gov /d is r / .
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Section 1777.5, 1777.6
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title
8, California Administra-
tion Code, Section 200 et
seq. to ensure compliance
and complete understand-
ing of the law regarding
apprentices.
Fair  Employment  Prac-
tices/Equal Opportunity
Acts:
In the performance of this
Agreement, Contractor
shall comply with all ap-
plicable provisions of the
California Fair Employ-
ment Practices Act (Cali-
fornia Government Code
Section §§ C – 32 B-3
12940 et seq.), the applic-
able equal employment
provisions of the Civi l
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000e et seq.),
and the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990 (42
U.S.C. §§ 12101, et seq.).
Labor  Standards  and
Civil  Rights:
Contractor agrees to com-
ply with the requirements
of the Secretary of Labor
and the latest amend-
ments to: Executive Or-
ders 11246 and 11375, as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(41 C.F.R. chapter 60); the
Copeland “Anti-Kickback”
Act (18 U.S.C. § 847) as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(29 C.F.R. part 3); Section
3 of the Housing and Urb-
an Development Act of
1968 (12 U.S.C. §§ 1701
et seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000); Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community Devel-
opment Act of 1974 (42
U.S.C. §§ 5301 et seq.);
the Age Discrimination Act
of 1975 (42 U.S.C. §§
6101 et seq.); and Section
504 of the Rehabilitation
Act of 1973 (29 U.S.C. §§
701 et seq.). Contractor
agrees to comply with the
requirements of all other
applicable federal, State
and local laws and regula-
tions.
State Labor Standards &
Wage Requirements:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor
and all subcontractors
agree to follow the State
Labor standards. State
Labor standards provi-
sions, including prevailing
wage requirements, will be
enforced such that the
general rate of per diem
wages (prevailing wage)
shall be paid for each
craft, classification, or type
of worker needed to ex-
ecute the contract to all
workers employed in the
execution of the contract.
All contractors and sub-
contractors must furnish
electronic certified payroll
records directly to the
Labor Commissioner (aka
Division of Labor Stand-
ards Enforcement) as fur-
ther described in Article
VIII of the Agreement. The
State General Prevailing
Wage Determination is as
established by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations (available at
http://www.dir.ca.gov/DLS
R/PWD/index.htm). The
prevailing rate of per diem
wages are on file at the
City.
Section 3 Statement:
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t a n d a l l
Bidders/Proposers must
commit to achieving estab-
lished requirements, in-
cluding benchmarks, for
Section 3 workers and
Targeted Section 3 work-
ers to be considered a re-
sponsive bidder/proposer
and eligible for a contract
award. Section 3 Require-
ments, Clause, and Pro-
gram Forms can be loc-
ated in Appendix “A” of
this document.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an  Development  Act  of
1968,  as  amended,  12
U.S.C 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low and very low-
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The parties to this con-
tract  agree  to  comply
with  HUD’s  regulations
in  24  CFR  part  135,
which  implement  Sec-
tion 3. As evidenced by
their  execution  of  this
contract,  the  parties  to
this contract certify that
they  are  under  no  con-
tractual or other impedi-
ment that would prevent
them  from  complying
with the part 135 regula-
tions.
The Contractor agrees to
send  to  each  labor  or-
ganization or represent-
ative  of  workers  with
which  the  Contractor
has a collective bargain-
ing  agreement  or  other
understanding, if any, a
notice advising the labor
organization or workers’
representative  of  the
Contractor’s  commit-
ments  under  this  Sec-
tion  3  clause,  and  will
post  copies  of  the  no-
t ice  in  conspicuous
places  at  the  work  site
where  both  employees
and applicants for train-
ing and employment po-
sitions  can  see  the  no-
tice.  The  notices  shall
describe  the  Section  3
preference,  shall  set
forth  minimum  number
and job titles subject to
hire,  availability  of  ap-
prenticeships and train-
ing positions, the quali-
fications  of  each;  and
the name and location of
person(s) taking applica-
tions for each of the pos-
itions;  and  the  anticip-
ated date the work shall
begin.
The Contractor agrees to
include  this  Section  3
clause in every sub-con-
tract  subject  to  compli-
ance with regulation sin
24  CFR  part  135,  and
agrees to take appropri-
ate  action,  as  provided
in  the  applicable  provi-
sion of the sub-contract-
or  in  this  Section  3
clause,  upon  a  finding
that  the  sub-contractor
is in violation of the reg-
ulation  in  24  CFR  part
135. The Contractor will
not  sub-contract  with
a n y  s u b - c o n t r a c t o r
where  the  Contractor
has notice or knowledge
that  the  sub-contractor
has been found in viola-
tion of the regulation in
24 CFR part 135.
The Contractor will certi-
fy  that  any  vacant  em-
ployment  positions,  in-
cluding  training  posi-
tions,  that  are  filled  (1)
after  the  Contractor  is
selected  but  before  the
contract  is  executed,
and (2) with persons oth-
er  than  those  to  whom
the  regulations  of  24
CFR part 135 require em-
ployment  opportunities
to be directed, were not
filled  to  circumvent  the
Contractor’s  obligation
under  24  CFR part  135.
Noncompl iance  wi th
HUD’s regulations in 24
CFR part 135 may result
in  sanctions,  termina-
tion of  this contract  for
default,  and  debarment
or  suspension  from fu-
ture  HUD assisted con-
tracts.
With  respect  to  work
performed  in  connec-
t ion  wi th  Sect ion  3
covered Indian Housing
Assistance, Section 7(b)
of  the  Indian  Self-De-
termination and Educa-
tion Assistance Act  (25
U.S.C.  450e)  also  ap-
plies  to  the  work  to  be
performed  under  this
contract. Section 7(b) re-
q u i r e s  t h a t  t o  t h e
greatest  extent  feasible
(i) preference and oppor-
tunities for training and
employment shall be giv-
en  to  Indians,  and  (ii)
preference is the award
of  contracts  and  sub-
contracts shall be given
to  Indian  organizations
and  Indian-owned  Eco-
n o m i c  E n t e r p r i s e s .
Parties  to  this  contract
that  are  subject  to  the
provisions of  Section 3
and section 7(b) agree to
comply with Section 3 to
the  maximum  extent
feasib le ,  but  not  in
derogation  of  compli-
ance  with  section  7(b).
Federal  Forms  to  be
Submitted  with  Bid:
The forms contained in
Appendix C, including
Section 3 forms, must be
completed, and included
with the bid submittal.
Award of Contract:
The following are condi-
tions to the award of the
contract:
i. for any bid submitted on
or after March 1, 2015,
each contractor and sub-
contractor listed on the bid
must be registered with
the Department of Industri-
al Relations pursuant to
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1725.5, subject to the lim-
ited exceptions set forth in
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1771.1(a) (regarding the
submission of a bid as au-
thorized by Business &
Professions Code Section
7029.1 or Public Contract
Code Section 10164 or
20103.5, provided the con-
tractor is registered to per-
form public work pursuant
to Section 1725.5 at the
time the contract is awar-
ded); and
ii. ii. for any contract awar-
ded on or after April 1,
2015, no contractor or
subcontractor may be
awarded this contract un-
less the contractor and
each subcontractor listed
on the bid is registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations pursu-
ant to Section 1725.5.
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Sections 1777.5, 1777.6,
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title 8
of the California Code of
Regulations, Section 200,
et seq., to ensure compli-
ance and complete under-
standing of the law regard-
ing apprentices.
Federal  Labor  Stand-
ards  Provision:
Refer to the HUD-4010
forms are located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Current  Federal  DOL
Wage  Decision:
Refer to the Federal Wage
Decision, located in Ap-
pendix “D” of this docu-
ment.
Federal EEO and Affirm-
ative  Action  Require-
ments:
Refer to the Federal Equal
Employment Opportunity
and Affirmative Action Re-
quirements located in Ap-
pendix “c” of this docu-
ment.
Contracting with Small &
Minority Firms, Women’s
Business Enterprise:
Refer to the Contracting
wi th Smal l Bus iness ,
Minority Firms, Women's
Business Enterprise, and
Labor Surplus Area Firms,
Federal Contract Provi-
sion, located in Appendix
“C” of this document.
Compliance  with  Clean
Air  and  Water  Acts:
Refer to the Compliance
with Clean Air and Water
Acts, Federal Contract
Provision, located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Conflict of Interest:
In  the  procurement  of
supplies,  equipment,
construction,  and  ser-
vice  of  sub-recipients,
the  conflict-of-interest
provision  in  24  CFR
85.36,  OMB  Circular  A-
110 and 24 CFR 570.611
shall  apply. No employ-
ee, officer or agent of the
sub-recipient shall parti-
cipate  in  the  selection,
award, or administration
of a contract supported
by  federal  funds  in  a
conflict  of  interest,  real
or apparent, would be in-
volved.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an Development  Action
of 1968, as amended, 12
U.S.C. 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall, to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low- and very-low
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The  Bidder/Proposer  is
required to complete and
submit  the  Declaration
of Intent to Comply with
Section 3 Requirements
–  Required  Contract
Forms  and  Certif ica-
tions, certifying that they
intend  to  comply  with
the  requirement  of  the
Secretary  of  Labor  and
the  latest  amendments
to:  Executive  Orders
11246 and 11375, as sup-
plemented  in  Depart-
ment  of  Labor  regula-
tions  (41  CFR  chapter
60); the Copeland “Anti-
Kickback: Act (18 U.S.C.
s847)  as  supplemented
in  Department  of  Labor
regulations (29 CFR part
3);  Sections  3  of  the
Housing and Urban De-
velopment  Act  of  1968
(12  U.S.C.  s  1701  et
seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights  Act  of  1964  (42
U.S.C.  s2000);  Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community De-
velopment  Act  of  1974
(42  U.S.C.  s  5301  et
seq.); the Age Discrimin-
ation  Act  of  1975  (42
U.S.C.  s701  et  seq.).
Contractor  agrees  to
comply with the require-
ments of all other applic-
able  federal,  state  and
local  laws  and  regula-
tions.
Prospective bidders/pro-
posers  shall  carefully
read  the  information
within  this  bid  docu-
ment including the Sec-
tion  3  Provisions  for
H o u s i n g  a n d  C o m -
munity Development As-
sistance  and  Publ ic
Housing Assistance, as
amended. Proposals that
fail  to  comply  with  the
requirement of Section 3
will  be considered non-
respons ive  and  ex -
cluded from further con-
sideration.
To comply with SB 854,
beginning January 1, 2015
the following applies:
A. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be listed
on a bid proposal for pub-
lic works project (submit-
ted on or after March 1,
2015) unless registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations (DIR)
pursuant to Labor Code
section 1725.5 [with lim-
ited exceptions from this
requirement for bid pur-
poses only under Labor
Code section 1771.1(a)].
B. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be awar-
ded a contract for public
works on a public works
project awarded on or after
April 1, 2015, unless re-
gistered with the DIR.
C. The project is subject to
compliance monitoring and
enforcement by the DIR.
D. Require the prime con-
tractor to post job site no-
tices prescribed by regula-
tion (regulation not cre-
ated yet) or the City must
post the notices itself.
The Contractor shall fill
in the Department of In-
dustrial  Relations (DIR)
Contractor  Registration
Number  Form provided
in  Appendix  “C”  and
submit it with the sealed
Bid.
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sec t ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Bids must be prepared on
the approved Proposal
forms or copies thereof in
conformance with the In-
structions to Bidders and
submitted in a sealed en-
velope plainly marked on
the outside as follows:
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
RFI’S/QUESTIONS: The
deadline to submit All
RFI’s/Questions shall be
s u b m i t t e d p r i o r t o
Thursday, November 09,
2023  at  1:30  pm  to  the
OpenGov  website. Late
submittal shall not be con-
sidered.
SUBSTITUTIONS: All re-
q u e s t e d “ o r e q u a l ”
products shall be submit-
ted prior to the bid date for
review and evaluation with
a subsequent determina-
tion by the City if the “or
equal” product is satisfact-
ory for consideration and
be allowed to submitted
with the bid. The  dead-
line to submit “or equal”
items shall be Thursday,
November  09,  2023  at
1:30 pm to the OpenGov
website.  Late  “or  equal
submittals shall be rejec-
ted.
COMPLETION OF WORK:
The City is scheduling the
award of contract for Janu-
ary 9, 2023 On January
10, 2023 the City will is-
sue the Notice to Contract
Award requesting the con-
tractor to submit contracts,
bonds and insurance certi-
ficates and submitted to
the City within fifteen (15)
calendar days.
In order to accommodate
weed abatement proced-
ures. The City will issue a
Weed Abatement Proced-
ure Notice to Proceed for a
duration of twenty-working
(20) days. When this is
complete, the City will is-
sue the construction No-
tice to Proceed for a dura-
tion of one hundred and
twenty (120) working days
(Monday – Friday), as stip-
ulated in the written No-
tice to Proceed issued by
the City Engineer. Failure
to complete the Work with-
in the time set forth herein
will result in the imposition
of liquidated damages for
each day of delay, in the
amount set forth in Sec-
tion 39 of the General Pro-
visions.
OBTAINING PLANS AND
SPECIFICATIONS: Plans,
Specifications, and any
project addenda are avail-
able for download the new
City platform OpenGov, ht-
tps://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, and on the city’s
website, www.cityoflap-
alma.org. All prospective
bidders are responsible for
registering on OpenGov
and checking the City’s
website for the issuance of
any project addenda prior
to the bid opening for in-
clusion as part of the bid
proposal. Due to the post-
ing of the documents on
the city website, OpenGov
will maintain a plan holder
list. For project informa-
tion, please contact the of-
fice of the City Engineer at
(714) 690-3310.
BONDS: Pursuant to the
Instructions to Bidders,
each proposal shall be ac-
companied by cash or by a
cashier's or certified check
or by a bid bond in the
amount of ten  percent
(10%) of the amount of the
bid price payable to the
City of La Palma as a
guarantee that the bidder,
if his or her proposal is ac-
cepted, will promptly ex-
ecute the contract, secure
payment of workers’ com-
pensation insurance and
furnish a satisfactory faith-
ful performance bond in
the amount of one  hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price and a
labor and material bond
in the amount of one hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price.
SUBSTITUTION OF SE-
CURITIES: The Contract-
or may substitute securit-
ies for any monies with-
held by the City to ensure
performance under the
contract in compliance
with the requirements of
Public Contract Code Sec-
tion 22300 and the "Sub-
stitution of Securities" pro-
visions of the General Pro-
visions.
WAGE RATES: As re-
quired by Section 1773 of
the California Labor Code,
the Director of the Depart-
ment of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia has determined the
general prevailing rates of
wages in the locality in
which Work is scheduled
to be performed. Copies of
the wage rate determina-
tions, entitled PREVAIL-
ING WAGE SCALE, are
mainta ined at the La
Palma City Hall, 7822
Walker Street, La Palma,
California, and are avail-
able to any interested
party upon request. The
Contractor shall post a
copy of this document at
each job site. The Con-
tractor and any subcon-
tractor under it shall pay
not less than the specified
prevailing rates of wages
to all workers employed in
the execution of the Con-
tract.
C O N T R A C T O R ' S L I -
CENSE: In accordance
with the provisions of Cali-
fornia Publ ic Contract
Code Section 3300, the
City requires that the bid-
der possess the following
c l a s s i f i c a t i o n o f
contractor’s license at the
time that the bid proposal
is submitted: Class A, or
Specialty. If the license
classif ication specif ied
hereinabove is that of a
“specialty contractor” as
defined in Section 7058 of
the California Business
and Professions Code, the
specialty contractor awar-
ded the Contract for this
Work shall itself construct
a majority of the Work, in
accordance with the provi-
sions of California Busi-
ness and Professions
Code Section 7059. Each
bidder shall clearly write or
type their contractor’s li-
cense number on the out-
side of the bidding envel-
ope.
CONTRACTORS REGIS-
TRATION: In accordance
with the provisions of
L a b o r C o d e s e c t i o n
1771.1, a contractor or
subcontractor shall not be
qualified to (a) bid on or be
listed in a bid proposal or
(b) engage in the perform-
ance of this Work, unless
currently registered and
qualified to perform the
Work pursuant to Labor
Code Section 1725.5.
COMPLIANCE MONITOR-
ING AND ENFORCE-
MENT: Contractor’s per-
formance of the Work de-
scribed in this Notice Invit-
ing Bids is subject to com-
pliance monitoring and en-
forcement by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations.
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY:
The City hereby notifies all
bidders that it will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of sex,
race, color, or national ori-
gin in consideration for an
award.
C ITY 'S RIGHTS RE-
SERVED: The City of La
Palma reserves the right to
reject any and all propos-
als or bids, including the
bid of a bidder who has
been delinquent or unfaith-
ful in any former contract
with the City of La Palma,
or to waive any irregularit-
ies or informalities in any
bids or in the bidding,
should it deem this neces-
sary for the public good.
No bidder may withdraw
his or her bid for a period
of sixty (60) days after the
date from the opening
thereof.
This  is  a  federally  as-
sisted construction con-
tract .  Federal  Labor
Standards  Provisions,
including  prevai l ing
wage  requirements  of
the Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts (DBRA) will be
enforced. In the event of
a conflict  between Fed-
eral  and  State  wage
rates,  the  higher  of  the
two will  prevail.
The Contractor’s duty to
pay  State  prevai l ing
wages can be found un-
der Labor Code Section
1770  et  seq.  and  Labor
Code Sections 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties  for  failure  to  pay
prevailing  wages  and
employee  apprentices
including forfeitures and
debarment.
The  current  Federal
Wage  Decision  is  con-
tained  herein,  in  Ap-
pendix “B”, and may be
updated  via  addendum
to this bid package with-
in ten (10) days prior to
bid opening and can be
f o u n d  a t
http://www.wdol.gov/wd
ol/scafiles/davisbacon/c
a/html.  The  applicable
Federal  Wage  Decision
will be incorporated into
the  contract.  The  State
wage rates are available
o n l i n e  a t
http://www/dir.ca.gov/DL
S R / P W D / i n d e x . h t m .
Lower State wage rates
for  work classifications
not specifically included
in the Federal Wage De-
cision  are  not  accept-
able.  The  Contractor
may  request  an  Addi-
tional Classification and
Rate  if  work  classifica-
tion cannot be located in
the  Federal  Wage  De-
cision.
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t  a n d  a l l
Bidder/Proposers  must
commit to achieving es-
tablished requirements,
including  benchmarks,
for  Section  3  workers
and Targeted Section 3
workers  to  be  con-
sidered  a  Section  3  re-
sponsive  bidder/pro-
poser and eligible for  a
contract  award.
Assignment:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of Part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Contractor's License:
When federal funds are
being used, at the time of
“Award of the Contract”,
the Prime Contractor must
have a valid California
State Contractor's License
with a classification of “A
or  Specialty” in accord-
ance with provisions of
Chapter 9, Division 111,
Sections 7000 through
7145 of the Business and
Professions Code of the
State of California and the
Prime Contractor shall
warrant that it and all sub-
contractors are properly li-
censed, which includes
each entity having a local
business license. When
federal funds are not be-
ing used, a bid by a con-
tractor who is not properly
l icensed must be con-
sidered nonresponsive,
will be rejected by the City,
and the unlicensed con-
tractor may be subject to
discipline by the state.
Contractor  Eligibil ity
Check:
Prior to awarding a con-
tract, the City will verify the
contractor's (1) status with
the California Department
of Industrial Relations at
http://www.cslb.ca.gov and
https://efiling.dir.ca.gov
and (2 ) e l i g ib i l i t y a t
http://www.dir.ca.gov/dlse/
debar.html and with the
online excluded parties list
at the federal System For
A w a r d M a n a g e m e n t
( S A M ) w e b s i t e
h t t ps : / /www.sam.gov .
Affirmative Action:
All bidders are on notice
that the City will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of reli-
gious creed, sex, race, col-
or, national origin in con-
sideration for an award.
Moreover, no contractor
receiving the award may
discriminate nor permit
others he may hire to en-
gage in, discrimination in
the employment of per-
sons because of their
race, religious creed, col-
or, or national origin, an-
cestry, physical disability,
mental disability, medical
condition, genetic informa-
tion, marital status, sex,
gender, gender identity,
gender expression, age,
sexual orientation, or milit-
ary or veteran status, ex-
cept as provided in Gov-
ernment Code Section
12940.
DATED: October 18, 2023
CITY OF LA PALMA,
CALIFORNIA
By:__________________
___________
Andy Ramirez
Public Works and Com-
munity Services Director

News Enterprise
10/18/2023-135860
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NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER ES-

TATE OF:
SHARON E. WEAVER
CASE NO. 30-2023-

01354077-PR-PW-CMC
To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors, contingent cred-
itors, and persons who
may otherwise be inter-
ested in the WILL or es-
tate, or both of SHARON
E. WEAVER.
A PETITION FOR PRO-
BATE has been filed by
BILLIE R. WEAVER in the
Superior Court of Califor-
nia, County of ORANGE.
THE PETIT ION FOR
PROBATE requests that
BILLIE R. WEAVER be
appointed as personal rep-
resentative to administer
the estate of the decedent.
THE PETITION requests
the decedent's WILL and
codicils, if any, be admit-
ted to probate. The WILL
and any codicils are avail-
able for examination in the
file kept by the court.
THE PETITION requests
authority to administer the
estate under the Inde-
pendent Administration of
Estates Act. (This author-
ity will allow the personal
representat ive to take
many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Be-
fore taking certain very im-
portant actions, however,
the personal representat-
ive will be required to give
notice to interested per-
sons unless they have
waived notice or consen-
ted to the p roposed
action.) The independent
administration authority
will be granted unless an
interested person files an
objection to the petition
and shows good cause
why the court should not
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the peti-
tion will be held in this
court as follows: 12/13/23
at 1:30PM in Dept. CM05
located at 3390 HARBOR
BLVD, COSTA MESA, CA
92626-1554
NOTICE IN PROBATE
CASES
The court is providing the
convenience to appear for
hearing by video using the
court's designated video
platform. This is a no cost
service to the public. Go to
the Court's website at The
Superior Court of Califor-
nia - County of Orange
(occourts.org) to appear
remotely for Probate hear-
ings and for remote hear-
ing instructions. If you
have difficulty connecting
or are unable to connect to
your remote hearing, call
657-622-8278 for assist-
ance. If you prefer to ap-
pear in-person, you can
appear in the department
on the day/time set for
your hearing.
IF YOU OBJECT to the
granting of the petition,
you should appear at the
hearing and state your ob-
jections or file written ob-
jections with the court be-
fore the hearing. Your ap-
pearance may be in per-
son or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDIT-
OR or a contingent credit-
or of the decedent, you
must file your claim with
the court and mail a copy
to the personal represent-
ative appointed by the
court within the later of
either (1) four months from
the date of first issuance of
letters to a general person-
a l representa t ive , as
defined in section 58(b) of
the Cali fornia Probate
Code, or (2) 60 days from
the date of mailing or per-
sonal delivery to you of a
notice under section 9052
of the California Probate
Code.
Other California statutes
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a credit-
or. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney know-
ledgeable in California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the
file kept by the court. If you
are a person interested in
the estate, you may file
with the court a Request
for Special Notice (form
DE-154) of the filing of an
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any pe-
t i t i on o r accoun t a s
provided in Probate Code
section 1250. A Request
for Special Notice form is
available from the court
clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
EUGENE A. GLEASON III
- SBN 096415,
GLEASON LAW OFFICES
1 5 6 5 1 E . I M P E R I A L
H W Y . , S U I T E 2 0 2 A
LA MIRADA CA 90638,
Telephone (562) 943-5566
10/18, 10/25, 11/1/23
CNS-3748611#
E v e n t  N e w s
1 0 / 1 8 , 2 5 , 1 1 / 1 / 2 0 2 3 -
1 3 5 8 0 5

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
23FL000622

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Pet i t ioner:
RONALD JAMES LOPEZ
filed for a petition with this
court for a decree chan-
ging names as follows:
RONALD JAMES LOPEZ
t o R O N A L D J A M E S
PERRY. THE COURT OR-
DERS that all persons in-
terested in this matter shall
appear before this court at
the hearing indicated be-
low to show cause, if any,
why the petition for change
of name should not be
granted. Any person ob-
j e c t i n g t o t h e n a m e
changes described above
must file a written objec-
tion that includes the reas-
ons for the objection at
least two court days be-
fore the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and must
appear at the hearing to
show cause why the peti-
tion should not be granted.
If no written objection is
timely filed, the court may
grant the petition without a
hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
01/25/2024

8:30 a.m., Dept. L74
REMOTE

Lamoreaux Justice Center
341 The City Drive South

Orange, CA 92868
(To appear remote ly ,
check in advance of the
hearing for information
about how to do so on the
court's website. To find
your court's website, go to
www.courts.ca.gov/find-
my-court.htm)
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following newspa-
per of general circulation,
printed in this county:
Event Newspapers
DATE: 10/12/2023
Judge Nancy Levin
Judge of the
Superior Court

Event News
10/18,25,11/1,8/23-

135847
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APN: 936-20-172 TS No:
CA05000085-23-1 TO No:
230101133-CA-VOI NO-
TICE OF TRUSTEE'S
SALE (The above state-
ment is made pursuant to
CA Civil Code Section
2923.3(d)(1). The Sum-
mary will be provided to
Trustor(s) and/or vested
owner(s) only, pursuant to
CA Civil Code Section
2923.3(d)(2).) YOU ARE
IN DEFAULT UNDER A
DEED OF TRUST DATED
October 28, 2016. UN-
LESS YOU TAKE AC-
T I O N T O P R O T E C T
YOUR PROPERTY, IT
MAY BE SOLD AT A PUB-
LIC SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
P R O C E E D I N G S
AGAINST YOU, YOU
SHOULD CONTACT A
LAWYER. On November
13, 2023 at 09:00 AM,
A u c t i o n . c o m R o o m ,
Doubletree by Hilton Hotel
Anaheim - Orange County,
100 The City Drive, Or-
ange, CA 92868, MTC Fin-
ancial Inc. dba Trustee
Corps, as the duly Appoin-
ted Trustee, under and
pursuant to the power of
sale contained in that cer-
tain Deed of Trust Recor-
ded on November 2, 2016
a s I n s t r u m e n t N o .
2016000543818, of offi-
cial records in the Office of
the Recorder of Orange
County, California, ex-
ecuted by JIMMY HUA, A
S I N G L E M A N , a s
Trustor(s), in favor of
MORTGAGE ELECTRON-
IC REGISTRATION SYS-
TEMS, INC., as Benefi-
ciary, as nominee for DBR
L O A N D B A D I R E C T
BANK RATE as Benefi-
ciary, WILL SELL AT PUB-
LIC AUCTION TO THE
HIGHEST BIDDER, in law-
ful money of the United
States, all payable at the
time of sale, that certain
property situated in said
County, California describ-
ing the land therein as: AS
M O R E F U L L Y D E -
SCRIBED IN SAID DEED
OF TRUST The property
heretofore described is be-
ing sold “as is”. The street
address and other com-
mon designation, if any, of
the real proper ty de-
scribed above is purpor-
ted to be: 7909 CERRI-
TOS AVE #24, STANTON,
CA 90680 The under-
signed Trustee disclaims
any liability for any incor-
rectness of the street ad-
dress and other common
designation, if any, shown
herein. Said sale will be
made without covenant or
warranty, express or im-
plied, regarding title, pos-
session, or encumbrances,
to pay the remaining prin-
cipal sum of the Note(s)
secured by said Deed of
Trust, with interest there-
on, as provided in said
Note(s), advances if any,
under the terms of the
Deed of Trust, estimated
fees, charges and ex-
penses of the Trustee and
of the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust.&emsp;
The total amount of the
unpaid balance of the ob-
ligations secured by the
property to be sold and
reasonable est imated
costs, expenses and ad-
vances at the time of the
initial publication of this
Notice of Trustee’s Sale is
e s t i m a t e d t o b e
$320,377.65 (Estimated).
However, prepayment
premiums, accrued in-
terest and advances will
increase this figure prior to
sale. Beneficiary’s bid at
said sale may include all
or part of said amount. In
addition to cash, the Trust-
ee will accept a cashier’s
check drawn on a state or
national bank, a check
drawn by a state or feder-
al credit union or a check
drawn by a state or feder-
al savings and loan asso-
ciation, savings associ-
ation or savings bank spe-
cified in Section 5102 of
the California Financial
Code and authorized to do
business in California, or
other such funds as may
be acceptable to the Trust-
ee. In the event tender
other than cash is accep-
ted, the Trustee may with-
hold the issuance of the
Trustee’s Deed Upon Sale
until funds become avail-
able to the payee or en-
dorsee as a matter of right.
The property offered for
sale excludes all funds
held on account by the
property receiver, if applic-
able. If the Trustee is un-
able to convey title for any
reason, the successful bid-
der’s sole and exclusive
remedy shall be the return
of monies paid to the
Trustee and the success-
ful bidder shall have no
further recourse. Notice to
Potential Bidders If you
are considering bidding on
this property l ien, you
should understand that
there are risks involved in
bidding at a Trustee auc-
tion. You will be bidding on
a lien, not on the property
itself. Placing the highest
bid at a Trustee auction
does not automatically en-
title you to free and clear
ownership of the property.
You should also be aware
that the lien being auc-
tioned off may be a junior
lien. If you are the highest
bidder at the auction, you
are or may be responsible
for paying off all liens seni-
or to the lien being auc-
tioned off, before you can
receive clear title to the
property. You are encour-
aged to investigate the ex-
istence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens that
may exist on this property
by contacting the county
recorder's office or a title
insurance company, either
of which may charge you a
fee for this information. If
you consult either of these
resources, you should be
aware that the same
Lender may hold more
than one mortgage or
Deed of Trust on the prop-
erty. Notice to Property
Owner The sale date
shown on this Notice of
Sale may be postponed
one or more times by the
Mortgagee, Beneficiary,
Trustee, or a court, pursu-
ant to Section 2924g of the
California Civil Code. The
law requires that informa-
tion about Trustee Sale
postponements be made
available to you and to the
public, as a courtesy to
those not present at the
sale. If you wish to learn
whether your sale date
has been postponed, and,
if applicable, the resched-
uled time and date for the
sale of this property, you
may call Auction.com at
800.280.2832 for informa-
t i o n r e g a r d i n g t h e
Trustee's Sale or visit the
Internet Website address
www.Auction.com for in-
formation regarding the
sale of this property, using
the file number assigned
to this case, CA05000085-
23-1. Information about
postponements that are
very short in duration or
that occur close in time to
the scheduled sale may
not immediately be reflec-
ted in the telephone in-
formation or on the Inter-
net Website. The best way
to verify postponement in-
formation is to attend the
scheduled sale.&emsp;
Notice to Tenant NOTICE
TO TENANT FOR FORE-
C L O S U R E S A F T E R
JANUARY 1, 2021 You
may have a right to pur-
chase this property after
the trustee auction pursu-
ant to Section 2924m of
the California Civil Code. If
you are an “eligible tenant
buyer,” you can purchase
the property if you match
the last and highest bid
placed at the trustee auc-
tion. If you are an “eligible
bidder,” you may be able
to purchase the property if
you exceed the last and
highest bid placed at the
trustee auction. There are
three steps to exercising
this right of purchase.
First, 48 hours after the
date of the trustee sale,
you can call 800.280.2832,
or visit this internet web-
site www.Auction.com, us-
ing the file number as-
s i g n e d t o t h i s c a s e
CA05000085-23-1 to find
the date on which the
trustee’s sale was held,
the amount of the last and
highest bid, and the ad-
dress of the t rus tee .
Second, you must send a
written notice of intent to
place a bid so that the
trustee receives it no more
than 15 days after the
trustee’s sale. Third, you
must submit a bid so that
the trustee receives it no
more than 45 days after
the trustee’s sale. If you
think you may qualify as
an “eligible tenant buyer”
or “eligible bidder,” you
should consider contact-
ing an attorney or appro-
priate real estate profes-
sional immediately for ad-
vice regarding this poten-
tial right to purchase. Date:
October 11, 2023 MTC
Financial Inc. dba Trustee
C o r p s T S N o .
CA05000085-23-1 17100
Gillette Ave Irvine, CA
92614 Phone: 949-252-
8 3 0 0 T D D : 7 1 1
949.252.8300 By: Loan
Quema, Authorized Sig-
natory SALE INFORMA-
T I O N C A N B E O B -
TA I N E D O N L I N E AT
www.Auction.com FOR
AUTOMATED SALES IN-
FORMATION PLEASE
CALL: Auct ion.com at
8 0 0 . 2 8 0 . 2 8 3 2
NPP0441884 To: THE
E V E N T N E W S
10/18/2023, 10/25/2023,
11/01/2023
E v e n t  N e w s
1 0 / 1 8 , 2 5 , 1 1 / 1 / 2 0 2 3 -
1 3 5 7 9 5

NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER ES-

TATE OF:
SHARON E. WEAVER
CASE NO. 30-2023-

01354077-PR-PW-CMC
To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors, contingent cred-
itors, and persons who
may otherwise be inter-
ested in the WILL or es-
tate, or both of SHARON
E. WEAVER.
A PETITION FOR PRO-
BATE has been filed by
BILLIE R. WEAVER in the
Superior Court of Califor-
nia, County of ORANGE.
THE PETIT ION FOR
PROBATE requests that
BILLIE R. WEAVER be
appointed as personal rep-
resentative to administer
the estate of the decedent.
THE PETITION requests
the decedent's WILL and
codicils, if any, be admit-
ted to probate. The WILL
and any codicils are avail-
able for examination in the
file kept by the court.
THE PETITION requests
authority to administer the
estate under the Inde-
pendent Administration of
Estates Act. (This author-
ity will allow the personal
representat ive to take
many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Be-
fore taking certain very im-
portant actions, however,
the personal representat-
ive will be required to give
notice to interested per-
sons unless they have
waived notice or consen-
ted to the p roposed
action.) The independent
administration authority
will be granted unless an
interested person files an
objection to the petition
and shows good cause
why the court should not
grant the authority.
A HEARING on the peti-
tion will be held in this
court as follows: 12/13/23
at 1:30PM in Dept. CM05
located at 3390 HARBOR
BLVD, COSTA MESA, CA
92626-1554
NOTICE IN PROBATE
CASES
The court is providing the
convenience to appear for
hearing by video using the
court's designated video
platform. This is a no cost
service to the public. Go to
the Court's website at The
Superior Court of Califor-
nia - County of Orange
(occourts.org) to appear
remotely for Probate hear-
ings and for remote hear-
ing instructions. If you
have difficulty connecting
or are unable to connect to
your remote hearing, call
657-622-8278 for assist-
ance. If you prefer to ap-
pear in-person, you can
appear in the department
on the day/time set for
your hearing.
IF YOU OBJECT to the
granting of the petition,
you should appear at the
hearing and state your ob-
jections or file written ob-
jections with the court be-
fore the hearing. Your ap-
pearance may be in per-
son or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDIT-
OR or a contingent credit-
or of the decedent, you
must file your claim with
the court and mail a copy
to the personal represent-
ative appointed by the
court within the later of
either (1) four months from
the date of first issuance of
letters to a general person-
a l representa t ive , as
defined in section 58(b) of
the Cali fornia Probate
Code, or (2) 60 days from
the date of mailing or per-
sonal delivery to you of a
notice under section 9052
of the California Probate
Code.
Other California statutes
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a credit-
or. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney know-
ledgeable in California law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the
file kept by the court. If you
are a person interested in
the estate, you may file
with the court a Request
for Special Notice (form
DE-154) of the filing of an
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any pe-
t i t i on o r accoun t as
provided in Probate Code
section 1250. A Request
for Special Notice form is
available from the court
clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
EUGENE A. GLEASON III
- SBN 096415,
GLEASON LAW OFFICES
1 5 6 5 1 E . I M P E R I A L
H W Y . , S U I T E 2 0 2 A
LA MIRADA CA 90638,
Telephone (562) 943-5566
10/18, 10/25, 11/1/23
CNS-3748611#
E v e n t  N e w s
1 0 / 1 8 , 2 5 , 1 1 / 1 / 2 0 2 3 -
1 3 5 8 0 5
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CITY OF LA PALMA
NOTICE INVITING BIDS
VARIOUS MEDIAN IS-

LANDS PROJECT
(CITY PROJECT NO. ST-

371)
NOTICE INVITING BIDS:
Sealed proposals will be
received online via the
Ci ty ’ s e -Procurement
P o r t a l ( “ P o r t a l ” ) a t
https://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, office of the City En-
gineer, Community Ser-
vices Office, La Palma,
California, until 1:30  PM
on Thursday, November
30, 2023 for furnishing of
all labor, materials and
equipment for VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No. ST-371 (the “Project”).
The  Bids  shall  be  sub-
mitted to the City Engin-
eer  through  the  Open-
Gov.com  platform. All
prospective bidders are re-
sponsible for registering
on OpenGov and check-
ing the City’s website for
the issuance of any project
addenda prior to the bid
opening for inclusion as
part of the bid proposal.
Due to the posting of the
documents on the city
website, OpenGov wil l
maintain a plan holder list.
For project information,
please contact the office of
the City Engineer at (714)
690-3310. Sealed  bids
will  NOT  be  accepted.
The  BIDS  for  VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No.  ST-371,  SHALL  BE
SUBMITTED  THROUGH
OpenGov.
D E S C R I P T I O N O F
WORK: The work in-
cludes rehabilitation of the
La Palma Avenue Median
Islands from the west city
limits to the east city limits;
Walker Avenue Median Is-
lands from Orangethorpe
Avenue southerly; and
Moody Street from Cres-
cent Ave to Houston Ave
including the removal of
existing landscaping/irriga-
tion, tree removals, hard-
scape removals and re-
placement, installation of
new drip irrigation system,
planting of new trees along
w i t h n e w
landscaping/hardscaping
in the medians islands.
Also, included are new
median islands on Moody
Street from Malaga Aven-
ue to La Luna Avenue with
complete irrigation and
landscaping per the con-
tract plans and specifica-
tions.
This project is NOT sub-
ject to a project labor, sta-
bilization, collective bar-
gaining or community work
force agreements
The City received Feder-
al Funding through HUD
for  this  project.  There-
fore,  Federal  Davis  Ba-
con  wage  rates  are  ap-
pl ied  to  the  project.
However,  If  the  State
Prevailing  Wages  are
higher than the Federal
Wage Rates,  the higher
are to be applied the that
specific classification.
A  MANDATORY  AND
SECTIO N  3  PRE-BID
MEETING,  will  be  held
on Tuesday October 24,
2023  at  2:30  pm  at  the
City  of  Palma  Com-
munity Services Offices,
7821  Walker  Street,  La
Palma, CA 90623. In or-
der to receive considera-
tion for the Section 3 bid
preference,  a  bidder
must complete, sign and
submit  the  following
forms with their bid pro-
posal: 1) Section 3 Busi-
ness Certification Form,
and (b) Section 3 Resid-
ent Certification form(s).
A  reasonable  bid  must
be with the Zone of Con-
sideration at the time of
bid  evaluation. All con-
tractors are required to
have a representative at-
tend and sign in at the pre-
bid meeting. Failure to
comply with this attend-
ance and sign in require-
ments will result in the
Contactor’s proposal be-
ing found non-responsive
to the required proced-
ures.
Prevailing  Wage  State-
ment:
This contract will be fun-
ded in whole or in part with
Federal housing and com-
munity development funds.
Federal Labor Standard
Provisions, including pre-
vailing wage requirements
of Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts will be enforced.
A copy of the Federal
Wage Decision applicable
to this project is included
in the Bid Documents in
Appendix “B”. This project
is a public work in the
State of California, funded
in whole or in part with
public funds. Therefore,
the higher of the two ap-
plicable prevailing wage
rates federal or state, will
be enforced. The Contract-
or’s duty to pay State pre-
vai l ing wages can be
found under Labor Code
Section 1770 et seq. Labor
Code Section 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties for failure to pay pre-
vailing wages and to em-
ploy apprentices, includ-
ing forfeitures and de-
barment. State Wage De-
cision is on file at the City
Clerk’s office and is also
a v a i l a b l e O n l i n e a t
h t tp : / /d i r . ca .gov /d is r / .
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Section 1777.5, 1777.6
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title
8, California Administra-
tion Code, Section 200 et
seq. to ensure compliance
and complete understand-
ing of the law regarding
apprentices.
Fair  Employment  Prac-
tices/Equal Opportunity
Acts:
In the performance of this
Agreement, Contractor
shall comply with all ap-
plicable provisions of the
California Fair Employ-
ment Practices Act (Cali-
fornia Government Code
Section §§ C – 32 B-3
12940 et seq.), the applic-
able equal employment
provisions of the Civi l
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000e et seq.),
and the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990 (42
U.S.C. §§ 12101, et seq.).
Labor  Standards  and
Civil  Rights:
Contractor agrees to com-
ply with the requirements
of the Secretary of Labor
and the latest amend-
ments to: Executive Or-
ders 11246 and 11375, as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(41 C.F.R. chapter 60); the
Copeland “Anti-Kickback”
Act (18 U.S.C. § 847) as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(29 C.F.R. part 3); Section
3 of the Housing and Urb-
an Development Act of
1968 (12 U.S.C. §§ 1701
et seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000); Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community Devel-
opment Act of 1974 (42
U.S.C. §§ 5301 et seq.);
the Age Discrimination Act
of 1975 (42 U.S.C. §§
6101 et seq.); and Section
504 of the Rehabilitation
Act of 1973 (29 U.S.C. §§
701 et seq.). Contractor
agrees to comply with the
requirements of all other
applicable federal, State
and local laws and regula-
tions.
State Labor Standards &
Wage Requirements:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor
and all subcontractors
agree to follow the State
Labor standards. State
Labor standards provi-
sions, including prevailing
wage requirements, will be
enforced such that the
general rate of per diem
wages (prevailing wage)
shall be paid for each
craft, classification, or type
of worker needed to ex-
ecute the contract to all
workers employed in the
execution of the contract.
All contractors and sub-
contractors must furnish
electronic certified payroll
records directly to the
Labor Commissioner (aka
Division of Labor Stand-
ards Enforcement) as fur-
ther described in Article
VIII of the Agreement. The
State General Prevailing
Wage Determination is as
established by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations (available at
http://www.dir.ca.gov/DLS
R/PWD/index.htm). The
prevailing rate of per diem
wages are on file at the
City.
Section 3 Statement:
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t a n d a l l
Bidders/Proposers must
commit to achieving estab-
lished requirements, in-
cluding benchmarks, for
Section 3 workers and
Targeted Section 3 work-
ers to be considered a re-
sponsive bidder/proposer
and eligible for a contract
award. Section 3 Require-
ments, Clause, and Pro-
gram Forms can be loc-
ated in Appendix “A” of
this document.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an  Development  Act  of
1968,  as  amended,  12
U.S.C 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low and very low-
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The parties to this con-
tract  agree  to  comply
with  HUD’s  regulations
in  24  CFR  part  135,
which  implement  Sec-
tion 3. As evidenced by
their  execution  of  this
contract,  the  parties  to
this contract certify that
they  are  under  no  con-
tractual or other impedi-
ment that would prevent
them  from  complying
with the part 135 regula-
tions.
The Contractor agrees to
send  to  each  labor  or-
ganization or represent-
ative  of  workers  with
which  the  Contractor
has a collective bargain-
ing  agreement  or  other
understanding, if any, a
notice advising the labor
organization or workers’
representative  of  the
Contractor’s  commit-
ments  under  this  Sec-
tion  3  clause,  and  will
post  copies  of  the  no-
t ice  in  conspicuous
places  at  the  work  site
where  both  employees
and applicants for train-
ing and employment po-
sitions  can  see  the  no-
tice.  The  notices  shall
describe  the  Section  3
preference,  shall  set
forth  minimum  number
and job titles subject to
hire,  availability  of  ap-
prenticeships and train-
ing positions, the quali-
fications  of  each;  and
the name and location of
person(s) taking applica-
tions for each of the pos-
itions;  and  the  anticip-
ated date the work shall
begin.
The Contractor agrees to
include  this  Section  3
clause in every sub-con-
tract  subject  to  compli-
ance with regulation sin
24  CFR  part  135,  and
agrees to take appropri-
ate  action,  as  provided
in  the  applicable  provi-
sion of the sub-contract-
or  in  this  Section  3
clause,  upon  a  finding
that  the  sub-contractor
is in violation of the reg-
ulation  in  24  CFR  part
135. The Contractor will
not  sub-contract  with
a n y  s u b - c o n t r a c t o r
where  the  Contractor
has notice or knowledge
that  the  sub-contractor
has been found in viola-
tion of the regulation in
24 CFR part 135.
The Contractor will certi-
fy  that  any  vacant  em-
ployment  positions,  in-
cluding  training  posi-
tions,  that  are  filled  (1)
after  the  Contractor  is
selected  but  before  the
contract  is  executed,
and (2) with persons oth-
er  than  those  to  whom
the  regulations  of  24
CFR part 135 require em-
ployment  opportunities
to be directed, were not
filled  to  circumvent  the
Contractor’s  obligation
under  24  CFR part  135.
Noncompl iance  wi th
HUD’s regulations in 24
CFR part 135 may result
in  sanctions,  termina-
tion of  this contract  for
default,  and  debarment
or  suspension  from fu-
ture  HUD assisted con-
tracts.
With  respect  to  work
performed  in  connec-
t ion  wi th  Sect ion  3
covered Indian Housing
Assistance, Section 7(b)
of  the  Indian  Self-De-
termination and Educa-
tion Assistance Act  (25
U.S.C.  450e)  also  ap-
plies  to  the  work  to  be
performed  under  this
contract. Section 7(b) re-
q u i r e s  t h a t  t o  t h e
greatest  extent  feasible
(i) preference and oppor-
tunities for training and
employment shall be giv-
en  to  Indians,  and  (ii)
preference is the award
of  contracts  and  sub-
contracts shall be given
to  Indian  organizations
and  Indian-owned  Eco-
n o m i c  E n t e r p r i s e s .
Parties  to  this  contract
that  are  subject  to  the
provisions of  Section 3
and section 7(b) agree to
comply with Section 3 to
the  maximum  extent
feasib le ,  but  not  in
derogation  of  compli-
ance  with  section  7(b).
Federal  Forms  to  be
Submitted  with  Bid:
The forms contained in
Appendix C, including
Section 3 forms, must be
completed, and included
with the bid submittal.
Award of Contract:
The following are condi-
tions to the award of the
contract:
i. for any bid submitted on
or after March 1, 2015,
each contractor and sub-
contractor listed on the bid
must be registered with
the Department of Industri-
al Relations pursuant to
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1725.5, subject to the lim-
ited exceptions set forth in
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1771.1(a) (regarding the
submission of a bid as au-
thorized by Business &
Professions Code Section
7029.1 or Public Contract
Code Section 10164 or
20103.5, provided the con-
tractor is registered to per-
form public work pursuant
to Section 1725.5 at the
time the contract is awar-
ded); and
ii. ii. for any contract awar-
ded on or after April 1,
2015, no contractor or
subcontractor may be
awarded this contract un-
less the contractor and
each subcontractor listed
on the bid is registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations pursu-
ant to Section 1725.5.
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Sections 1777.5, 1777.6,
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title 8
of the California Code of
Regulations, Section 200,
et seq., to ensure compli-
ance and complete under-
standing of the law regard-
ing apprentices.
Federal  Labor  Stand-
ards  Provision:
Refer to the HUD-4010
forms are located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Current  Federal  DOL
Wage  Decision:
Refer to the Federal Wage
Decision, located in Ap-
pendix “D” of this docu-
ment.
Federal EEO and Affirm-
ative  Action  Require-
ments:
Refer to the Federal Equal
Employment Opportunity
and Affirmative Action Re-
quirements located in Ap-
pendix “c” of this docu-
ment.
Contracting with Small &
Minority Firms, Women’s
Business Enterprise:
Refer to the Contracting
wi th Smal l Bus iness ,
Minority Firms, Women's
Business Enterprise, and
Labor Surplus Area Firms,
Federal Contract Provi-
sion, located in Appendix
“C” of this document.
Compliance  with  Clean
Air  and  Water  Acts:
Refer to the Compliance
with Clean Air and Water
Acts, Federal Contract
Provision, located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Conflict of Interest:
In  the  procurement  of
supplies,  equipment,
construction,  and  ser-
vice  of  sub-recipients,
the  conflict-of-interest
provision  in  24  CFR
85.36,  OMB  Circular  A-
110 and 24 CFR 570.611
shall  apply. No employ-
ee, officer or agent of the
sub-recipient shall parti-
cipate  in  the  selection,
award, or administration
of a contract supported
by  federal  funds  in  a
conflict  of  interest,  real
or apparent, would be in-
volved.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an Development  Action
of 1968, as amended, 12
U.S.C. 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall, to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low- and very-low
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The Bidder/Proposer  is
required to complete and
submit  the  Declaration
of Intent to Comply with
Section 3 Requirements
–  Required  Contract
Forms  and  Certif ica-
tions, certifying that they
intend  to  comply  with
the  requirement  of  the
Secretary  of  Labor  and
the  latest  amendments
to:  Executive  Orders
11246 and 11375, as sup-
plemented  in  Depart-
ment  of  Labor  regula-
tions  (41  CFR  chapter
60); the Copeland “Anti-
Kickback: Act (18 U.S.C.
s847)  as  supplemented
in  Department  of  Labor
regulations (29 CFR part
3);  Sections  3  of  the
Housing and Urban De-
velopment  Act  of  1968
(12  U.S.C.  s  1701  et
seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights  Act  of  1964  (42
U.S.C.  s2000);  Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community De-
velopment  Act  of  1974
(42  U.S.C.  s  5301  et
seq.); the Age Discrimin-
ation  Act  of  1975  (42
U.S.C.  s701  et  seq.).
Contractor  agrees  to
comply with the require-
ments of all other applic-
able  federal,  state  and
local  laws  and  regula-
tions.
Prospective bidders/pro-
posers  shall  carefully
read  the  information
within  this  bid  docu-
ment including the Sec-
tion  3  Provisions  for
H o u s i n g  a n d  C o m -
munity Development As-
sistance  and  Publ ic
Housing Assistance, as
amended. Proposals that
fail  to  comply  with  the
requirement of Section 3
will  be considered non-
respons ive  and  ex -
cluded from further con-
sideration.
To comply with SB 854,
beginning January 1, 2015
the following applies:
A. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be listed
on a bid proposal for pub-
lic works project (submit-
ted on or after March 1,
2015) unless registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations (DIR)
pursuant to Labor Code
section 1725.5 [with lim-
ited exceptions from this
requirement for bid pur-
poses only under Labor
Code section 1771.1(a)].
B. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be awar-
ded a contract for public
works on a public works
project awarded on or after
April 1, 2015, unless re-
gistered with the DIR.
C. The project is subject to
compliance monitoring and
enforcement by the DIR.
D. Require the prime con-
tractor to post job site no-
tices prescribed by regula-
tion (regulation not cre-
ated yet) or the City must
post the notices itself.
The Contractor shall fill
in the Department of In-
dustrial  Relations (DIR)
Contractor  Registration
Number  Form provided
in  Appendix  “C”  and
submit it with the sealed
Bid.
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Bids must be prepared on
the approved Proposal
forms or copies thereof in
conformance with the In-
structions to Bidders and
submitted in a sealed en-
velope plainly marked on
the outside as follows:
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
RFI’S/QUESTIONS: The
deadline to submit All
RFI’s/Questions shall be
s u b m i t t e d p r i o r t o
Thursday, November 09,
2023  at  1:30  pm  to  the
OpenGov  website. Late
submittal shall not be con-
sidered.
SUBSTITUTIONS: All re-
q u e s t e d “ o r e q u a l ”
products shall be submit-
ted prior to the bid date for
review and evaluation with
a subsequent determina-
tion by the City if the “or
equal” product is satisfact-
ory for consideration and
be allowed to submitted
with the bid. The  dead-
line to submit “or equal”
items shall be Thursday,
November  09,  2023  at
1:30 pm to the OpenGov
website.  Late  “or  equal
submittals shall be rejec-
ted.
COMPLETION OF WORK:
The City is scheduling the
award of contract for Janu-
ary 9, 2023 On January
10, 2023 the City will is-
sue the Notice to Contract
Award requesting the con-
tractor to submit contracts,
bonds and insurance certi-
ficates and submitted to
the City within fifteen (15)
calendar days.
In order to accommodate
weed abatement proced-
ures. The City will issue a
Weed Abatement Proced-
ure Notice to Proceed for a
duration of twenty-working
(20) days. When this is
complete, the City will is-
sue the construction No-
tice to Proceed for a dura-
tion of one hundred and
twenty (120) working days
(Monday – Friday), as stip-
ulated in the written No-
tice to Proceed issued by
the City Engineer. Failure
to complete the Work with-
in the time set forth herein
will result in the imposition
of liquidated damages for
each day of delay, in the
amount set forth in Sec-
tion 39 of the General Pro-
visions.
OBTAINING PLANS AND
SPECIFICATIONS: Plans,
Specifications, and any
project addenda are avail-
able for download the new
City platform OpenGov, ht-
tps://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, and on the city’s
website, www.cityoflap-
alma.org. All prospective
bidders are responsible for
registering on OpenGov
and checking the City’s
website for the issuance of
any project addenda prior
to the bid opening for in-
clusion as part of the bid
proposal. Due to the post-
ing of the documents on
the city website, OpenGov
will maintain a plan holder
list. For project informa-
tion, please contact the of-
fice of the City Engineer at
(714) 690-3310.
BONDS: Pursuant to the
Instructions to Bidders,
each proposal shall be ac-
companied by cash or by a
cashier's or certified check
or by a bid bond in the
amount of ten  percent
(10%) of the amount of the
bid price payable to the
City of La Palma as a
guarantee that the bidder,
if his or her proposal is ac-
cepted, will promptly ex-
ecute the contract, secure
payment of workers’ com-
pensation insurance and
furnish a satisfactory faith-
ful performance bond in
the amount of one  hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price and a
labor and material bond
in the amount of one hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price.
SUBSTITUTION OF SE-
CURITIES: The Contract-
or may substitute securit-
ies for any monies with-
held by the City to ensure
performance under the
contract in compliance
with the requirements of
Public Contract Code Sec-
tion 22300 and the "Sub-
stitution of Securities" pro-
visions of the General Pro-
visions.
WAGE RATES: As re-
quired by Section 1773 of
the California Labor Code,
the Director of the Depart-
ment of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia has determined the
general prevailing rates of
wages in the locality in
which Work is scheduled
to be performed. Copies of
the wage rate determina-
tions, entitled PREVAIL-
ING WAGE SCALE, are
mainta ined at the La
Palma City Hall, 7822
Walker Street, La Palma,
California, and are avail-
able to any interested
party upon request. The
Contractor shall post a
copy of this document at
each job site. The Con-
tractor and any subcon-
tractor under it shall pay
not less than the specified
prevailing rates of wages
to all workers employed in
the execution of the Con-
tract.
C O N T R A C T O R ' S L I -
CENSE: In accordance
with the provisions of Cali-
fornia Publ ic Contract
Code Section 3300, the
City requires that the bid-
der possess the following
c l a s s i f i c a t i o n o f
contractor’s license at the
time that the bid proposal
is submitted: Class A, or
Specialty. If the license
classif ication specif ied
hereinabove is that of a
“specialty contractor” as
defined in Section 7058 of
the California Business
and Professions Code, the
specialty contractor awar-
ded the Contract for this
Work shall itself construct
a majority of the Work, in
accordance with the provi-
sions of California Busi-
ness and Professions
Code Section 7059. Each
bidder shall clearly write or
type their contractor’s li-
cense number on the out-
side of the bidding envel-
ope.
CONTRACTORS REGIS-
TRATION: In accordance
with the provisions of
L a b o r C o d e s e c t i o n
1771.1, a contractor or
subcontractor shall not be
qualified to (a) bid on or be
listed in a bid proposal or
(b) engage in the perform-
ance of this Work, unless
currently registered and
qualified to perform the
Work pursuant to Labor
Code Section 1725.5.
COMPLIANCE MONITOR-
ING AND ENFORCE-
MENT: Contractor’s per-
formance of the Work de-
scribed in this Notice Invit-
ing Bids is subject to com-
pliance monitoring and en-
forcement by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations.
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY:
The City hereby notifies all
bidders that it will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of sex,
race, color, or national ori-
gin in consideration for an
award.
C ITY 'S RIGHTS RE-
SERVED: The City of La
Palma reserves the right to
reject any and all propos-
als or bids, including the
bid of a bidder who has
been delinquent or unfaith-
ful in any former contract
with the City of La Palma,
or to waive any irregularit-
ies or informalities in any
bids or in the bidding,
should it deem this neces-
sary for the public good.
No bidder may withdraw
his or her bid for a period
of sixty (60) days after the
date from the opening
thereof.
This  is  a  federally  as-
sisted construction con-
tract .  Federal  Labor
Standards  Provisions,
including  prevai l ing
wage  requirements  of
the Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts (DBRA) will be
enforced. In the event of
a conflict  between Fed-
eral  and  State  wage
rates,  the  higher  of  the
two will  prevail.
The Contractor’s duty to
pay  State  prevai l ing
wages can be found un-
der Labor Code Section
1770  et  seq.  and  Labor
Code Sections 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties  for  failure  to  pay
prevailing  wages  and
employee  apprentices
including forfeitures and
debarment.
The  current  Federal
Wage  Decision  is  con-
tained  herein,  in  Ap-
pendix “B”, and may be
updated  via  addendum
to this bid package with-
in ten (10) days prior to
bid opening and can be
f o u n d  a t
http://www.wdol.gov/wd
ol/scafiles/davisbacon/c
a/html.  The  applicable
Federal  Wage  Decision
will be incorporated into
the  contract.  The  State
wage rates are available
o n l i n e  a t
http://www/dir.ca.gov/DL
S R / P W D / i n d e x . h t m .
Lower State wage rates
for  work classifications
not specifically included
in the Federal Wage De-
cision  are  not  accept-
able.  The  Contractor
may  request  an  Addi-
tional Classification and
Rate  if  work  classifica-
tion cannot be located in
the  Federal  Wage  De-
cision.
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t  a n d  a l l
Bidder/Proposers  must
commit to achieving es-
tablished requirements,
including  benchmarks,
for  Section  3  workers
and Targeted Section 3
workers  to  be  con-
sidered  a  Section  3  re-
sponsive  bidder/pro-
poser and eligible for  a
contract  award.
Assignment:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of Part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Contractor's License:
When federal funds are
being used, at the time of
“Award of the Contract”,
the Prime Contractor must
have a valid California
State Contractor's License
with a classification of “A
or  Specialty” in accord-
ance with provisions of
Chapter 9, Division 111,
Sections 7000 through
7145 of the Business and
Professions Code of the
State of California and the
Prime Contractor shall
warrant that it and all sub-
contractors are properly li-
censed, which includes
each entity having a local
business license. When
federal funds are not be-
ing used, a bid by a con-
tractor who is not properly
l icensed must be con-
sidered nonresponsive,
will be rejected by the City,
and the unlicensed con-
tractor may be subject to
discipline by the state.
Contractor  Eligibil ity
Check:
Prior to awarding a con-
tract, the City will verify the
contractor's (1) status with
the California Department
of Industrial Relations at
http://www.cslb.ca.gov and
https://efiling.dir.ca.gov
and (2 ) e l i g ib i l i t y a t
http://www.dir.ca.gov/dlse/
debar.html and with the
online excluded parties list
at the federal System For
A w a r d M a n a g e m e n t
( S A M ) w e b s i t e
h t t ps : / /www.sam.gov .
Affirmative Action:
All bidders are on notice
that the City will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of reli-
gious creed, sex, race, col-
or, national origin in con-
sideration for an award.
Moreover, no contractor
receiving the award may
discriminate nor permit
others he may hire to en-
gage in, discrimination in
the employment of per-
sons because of their
race, religious creed, col-
or, or national origin, an-
cestry, physical disability,
mental disability, medical
condition, genetic informa-
tion, marital status, sex,
gender, gender identity,
gender expression, age,
sexual orientation, or milit-
ary or veteran status, ex-
cept as provided in Gov-
ernment Code Section
12940.
DATED: October 18, 2023
CITY OF LA PALMA,
CALIFORNIA
By:__________________
___________
Andy Ramirez
Public Works and Com-
munity Services Director

News Enterprise
10/18/2023-135860

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
23FL000899

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Pet i t ioner:
WENJIN YANG on behalf
of PEIQING YE, a minor
filed for a petition with this
court for a decree chan-
ging names as follows:
PEIQING YE to LESLEY
MOON. THE COURT OR-
DERS that all persons in-
terested in this matter shall
appear before this court at
the hearing indicated be-
low to show cause, if any,
why the petition for change
of name should not be
granted. Any person ob-
j e c t i n g t o t h e n a m e
changes described above
must file a written objec-
tion that includes the reas-
ons for the objection at
least two court days be-
fore the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and must
appear at the hearing to
show cause why the peti-
tion should not be granted.
If no written objection is
timely filed, the court may
grant the petition without a
hearing.

NOTICE OF HEARING
01/10/2024

8:30 a.m., Dept. L74
REMOTE

Lamoreaux Justice Center
341 The City Drive South

Orange, CA 92868
G O T O W W W . O C -
COURTS.ORG/DIRECT-
ORY/FAMILY FOR RE-
M O T E / I N P E R S O N
HEARING INFORMATION
(To appear remote ly ,
check in advance of the
hearing for information
about how to do so on the
court's website. To find
your court's website, go to
www.courts.ca.gov/find-
my-court.htm)
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be pub-
lished at least once each
week for four successive
weeks prior to the date set
for hearing on the petition
in the following newspa-
per of general circulation,
printed in this county:
Event Newspapers
DATE: 09/05/2023
Judge Julie A Palafox
Judge of the
Superior Court

Event News Enterprise
10/4,11,18,25/23-135341

Legals-NE

CITY OF LA PALMA
NOTICE INVITING BIDS
VARIOUS MEDIAN IS-

LANDS PROJECT
(CITY PROJECT NO. ST-

371)
NOTICE INVITING BIDS:
Sealed proposals will be
received online via the
Ci ty ’ s e -Procurement
P o r t a l ( “ P o r t a l ” ) a t
https://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, office of the City En-
gineer, Community Ser-
vices Office, La Palma,
California, until 1:30  PM
on Thursday, November
30, 2023 for furnishing of
all labor, materials and
equipment for VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No. ST-371 (the “Project”).
The  Bids  shall  be  sub-
mitted to the City Engin-
eer  through  the  Open-
Gov.com  platform. All
prospective bidders are re-
sponsible for registering
on OpenGov and check-
ing the City’s website for
the issuance of any project
addenda prior to the bid
opening for inclusion as
part of the bid proposal.
Due to the posting of the
documents on the city
website, OpenGov wil l
maintain a plan holder list.
For project information,
please contact the office of
the City Engineer at (714)
690-3310. Sealed  bids
will  NOT  be  accepted.
The  BIDS  for  VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No.  ST-371,  SHALL  BE
SUBMITTED  THROUGH
OpenGov.
D E S C R I P T I O N O F
WORK: The work in-
cludes rehabilitation of the
La Palma Avenue Median
Islands from the west city
limits to the east city limits;
Walker Avenue Median Is-
lands from Orangethorpe
Avenue southerly; and
Moody Street from Cres-
cent Ave to Houston Ave
including the removal of
existing landscaping/irriga-
tion, tree removals, hard-
scape removals and re-
placement, installation of
new drip irrigation system,
planting of new trees along
w i t h n e w
landscaping/hardscaping
in the medians islands.
Also, included are new
median islands on Moody
Street from Malaga Aven-
ue to La Luna Avenue with
complete irrigation and
landscaping per the con-
tract plans and specifica-
tions.
This project is NOT sub-
ject to a project labor, sta-
bilization, collective bar-
gaining or community work
force agreements
The City received Feder-
al Funding through HUD
for  this  project.  There-
fore,  Federal  Davis  Ba-
con  wage  rates  are  ap-
pl ied  to  the  project.
However,  If  the  State
Prevailing  Wages  are
higher than the Federal
Wage Rates,  the higher
are to be applied the that
specific classification.
A  MANDATORY  AND
SECTIO N  3  PRE-BID
MEETING,  will  be  held
on Tuesday October 24,
2023  at  2:30  pm  at  the
City  of  Palma  Com-
munity Services Offices,
7821  Walker  Street,  La
Palma, CA 90623. In or-
der to receive considera-
tion for the Section 3 bid
preference,  a  bidder
must complete, sign and
submit  the  following
forms with their bid pro-
posal: 1) Section 3 Busi-
ness Certification Form,
and (b) Section 3 Resid-
ent Certification form(s).
A  reasonable  bid  must
be with the Zone of Con-
sideration at the time of
bid  evaluation. All con-
tractors are required to
have a representative at-
tend and sign in at the pre-
bid meeting. Failure to
comply with this attend-
ance and sign in require-
ments will result in the
Contactor’s proposal be-
ing found non-responsive
to the required proced-
ures.
Prevailing  Wage  State-
ment:
This contract will be fun-
ded in whole or in part with
Federal housing and com-
munity development funds.
Federal Labor Standard
Provisions, including pre-
vailing wage requirements
of Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts will be enforced.
A copy of the Federal
Wage Decision applicable
to this project is included
in the Bid Documents in
Appendix “B”. This project
is a public work in the
State of California, funded
in whole or in part with
public funds. Therefore,
the higher of the two ap-
plicable prevailing wage
rates federal or state, will
be enforced. The Contract-
or’s duty to pay State pre-
vai l ing wages can be
found under Labor Code
Section 1770 et seq. Labor
Code Section 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties for failure to pay pre-
vailing wages and to em-
ploy apprentices, includ-
ing forfeitures and de-
barment. State Wage De-
cision is on file at the City
Clerk’s office and is also
a v a i l a b l e O n l i n e a t
h t tp : / /d i r . ca .gov /d is r / .
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Section 1777.5, 1777.6
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title
8, California Administra-
tion Code, Section 200 et
seq. to ensure compliance
and complete understand-
ing of the law regarding
apprentices.
Fair  Employment  Prac-
tices/Equal Opportunity
Acts:
In the performance of this
Agreement, Contractor
shall comply with all ap-
plicable provisions of the
California Fair Employ-
ment Practices Act (Cali-
fornia Government Code
Section §§ C – 32 B-3
12940 et seq.), the applic-
able equal employment
provisions of the Civi l
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000e et seq.),
and the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990 (42
U.S.C. §§ 12101, et seq.).
Labor  Standards  and
Civil  Rights:
Contractor agrees to com-
ply with the requirements
of the Secretary of Labor
and the latest amend-
ments to: Executive Or-
ders 11246 and 11375, as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(41 C.F.R. chapter 60); the
Copeland “Anti-Kickback”
Act (18 U.S.C. § 847) as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(29 C.F.R. part 3); Section
3 of the Housing and Urb-
an Development Act of
1968 (12 U.S.C. §§ 1701
et seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000); Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community Devel-
opment Act of 1974 (42
U.S.C. §§ 5301 et seq.);
the Age Discrimination Act
of 1975 (42 U.S.C. §§
6101 et seq.); and Section
504 of the Rehabilitation
Act of 1973 (29 U.S.C. §§
701 et seq.). Contractor
agrees to comply with the
requirements of all other
applicable federal, State
and local laws and regula-
tions.
State Labor Standards &
Wage Requirements:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor
and all subcontractors
agree to follow the State
Labor standards. State
Labor standards provi-
sions, including prevailing
wage requirements, will be
enforced such that the
general rate of per diem
wages (prevailing wage)
shall be paid for each
craft, classification, or type
of worker needed to ex-
ecute the contract to all
workers employed in the
execution of the contract.
All contractors and sub-
contractors must furnish
electronic certified payroll
records directly to the
Labor Commissioner (aka
Division of Labor Stand-
ards Enforcement) as fur-
ther described in Article
VIII of the Agreement. The
State General Prevailing
Wage Determination is as
established by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations (available at
http://www.dir.ca.gov/DLS
R/PWD/index.htm). The
prevailing rate of per diem
wages are on file at the
City.
Section 3 Statement:
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t a n d a l l
Bidders/Proposers must
commit to achieving estab-
lished requirements, in-
cluding benchmarks, for
Section 3 workers and
Targeted Section 3 work-
ers to be considered a re-
sponsive bidder/proposer
and eligible for a contract
award. Section 3 Require-
ments, Clause, and Pro-
gram Forms can be loc-
ated in Appendix “A” of
this document.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an  Development  Act  of
1968,  as  amended,  12
U.S.C 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low and very low-
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The parties to this con-
tract  agree  to  comply
with  HUD’s  regulations
in  24  CFR  part  135,
which  implement  Sec-
tion 3. As evidenced by
their  execution  of  this
contract,  the  parties  to
this contract certify that
they  are  under  no  con-
tractual or other impedi-
ment that would prevent
them  from  complying
with the part 135 regula-
tions.
The Contractor agrees to
send  to  each  labor  or-
ganization or represent-
ative  of  workers  with
which  the  Contractor
has a collective bargain-
ing  agreement  or  other
understanding, if any, a
notice advising the labor
organization or workers’
representative  of  the
Contractor’s  commit-
ments  under  this  Sec-
tion  3  clause,  and  will
post  copies  of  the  no-
t ice  in  conspicuous
places  at  the  work  site
where  both  employees
and applicants for train-
ing and employment po-
sitions  can  see  the  no-
tice.  The  notices  shall
describe  the  Section  3
preference,  shall  set
forth  minimum  number
and job titles subject to
hire,  availability  of  ap-
prenticeships and train-
ing positions, the quali-
fications  of  each;  and
the name and location of
person(s) taking applica-
tions for each of the pos-
itions;  and  the  anticip-
ated date the work shall
begin.
The Contractor agrees to
include  this  Section  3
clause in every sub-con-
tract  subject  to  compli-
ance with regulation sin
24  CFR  part  135,  and
agrees to take appropri-
ate  action,  as  provided
in  the  applicable  provi-
sion of the sub-contract-
or  in  this  Section  3
clause,  upon  a  finding
that  the  sub-contractor
is in violation of the reg-
ulation  in  24  CFR  part
135. The Contractor will
not  sub-contract  with
a n y  s u b - c o n t r a c t o r
where  the  Contractor
has notice or knowledge
that  the  sub-contractor
has been found in viola-
tion of the regulation in
24 CFR part 135.
The Contractor will certi-
fy  that  any  vacant  em-
ployment  positions,  in-
cluding  training  posi-
tions,  that  are  filled  (1)
after  the  Contractor  is
selected  but  before  the
contract  is  executed,
and (2) with persons oth-
er  than  those  to  whom
the  regulations  of  24
CFR part 135 require em-
ployment  opportunities
to be directed, were not
filled  to  circumvent  the
Contractor’s  obligation
under  24  CFR part  135.
Noncompl iance  wi th
HUD’s regulations in 24
CFR part 135 may result
in  sanctions,  termina-
tion of  this contract  for
default,  and  debarment
or  suspension  from fu-
ture  HUD assisted con-
tracts.
With  respect  to  work
performed  in  connec-
t ion  wi th  Sect ion  3
covered Indian Housing
Assistance, Section 7(b)
of  the  Indian  Self-De-
termination and Educa-
tion Assistance Act  (25
U.S.C.  450e)  also  ap-
plies  to  the  work  to  be
performed  under  this
contract. Section 7(b) re-
q u i r e s  t h a t  t o  t h e
greatest  extent  feasible
(i) preference and oppor-
tunities for training and
employment shall be giv-
en  to  Indians,  and  (ii)
preference is the award
of  contracts  and  sub-
contracts shall be given
to  Indian  organizations
and  Indian-owned  Eco-
n o m i c  E n t e r p r i s e s .
Parties  to  this  contract
that  are  subject  to  the
provisions of  Section 3
and section 7(b) agree to
comply with Section 3 to
the  maximum  extent
feasib le ,  but  not  in
derogation  of  compli-
ance  with  section  7(b).
Federal  Forms  to  be
Submitted  with  Bid:
The forms contained in
Appendix C, including
Section 3 forms, must be
completed, and included
with the bid submittal.
Award of Contract:
The following are condi-
tions to the award of the
contract:
i. for any bid submitted on
or after March 1, 2015,
each contractor and sub-
contractor listed on the bid
must be registered with
the Department of Industri-
al Relations pursuant to
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1725.5, subject to the lim-
ited exceptions set forth in
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1771.1(a) (regarding the
submission of a bid as au-
thorized by Business &
Professions Code Section
7029.1 or Public Contract
Code Section 10164 or
20103.5, provided the con-
tractor is registered to per-
form public work pursuant
to Section 1725.5 at the
time the contract is awar-
ded); and
ii. ii. for any contract awar-
ded on or after April 1,
2015, no contractor or
subcontractor may be
awarded this contract un-
less the contractor and
each subcontractor listed
on the bid is registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations pursu-
ant to Section 1725.5.
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Sections 1777.5, 1777.6,
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title 8
of the California Code of
Regulations, Section 200,
et seq., to ensure compli-
ance and complete under-
standing of the law regard-
ing apprentices.
Federal  Labor  Stand-
ards  Provision:
Refer to the HUD-4010
forms are located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Current  Federal  DOL
Wage  Decision:
Refer to the Federal Wage
Decision, located in Ap-
pendix “D” of this docu-
ment.
Federal EEO and Affirm-
ative  Action  Require-
ments:
Refer to the Federal Equal
Employment Opportunity
and Affirmative Action Re-
quirements located in Ap-
pendix “c” of this docu-
ment.
Contracting with Small &
Minority Firms, Women’s
Business Enterprise:
Refer to the Contracting
wi th Smal l Bus iness ,
Minority Firms, Women's
Business Enterprise, and
Labor Surplus Area Firms,
Federal Contract Provi-
sion, located in Appendix
“C” of this document.
Compliance  with  Clean
Air  and  Water  Acts:
Refer to the Compliance
with Clean Air and Water
Acts, Federal Contract
Provision, located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Conflict of Interest:
In  the  procurement  of
supplies,  equipment,
construction,  and  ser-
vice  of  sub-recipients,
the  conflict-of-interest
provision  in  24  CFR
85.36,  OMB  Circular  A-
110 and 24 CFR 570.611
shall  apply. No employ-
ee, officer or agent of the
sub-recipient shall parti-
cipate  in  the  selection,
award, or administration
of a contract supported
by  federal  funds  in  a
conflict  of  interest,  real
or apparent, would be in-
volved.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an Development  Action
of 1968, as amended, 12
U.S.C. 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall, to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low- and very-low
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The Bidder/Proposer  is
required to complete and
submit  the  Declaration
of Intent to Comply with
Section 3 Requirements
–  Required  Contract
Forms  and  Certif ica-
tions, certifying that they
intend  to  comply  with
the  requirement  of  the
Secretary  of  Labor  and
the  latest  amendments
to:  Executive  Orders
11246 and 11375, as sup-
plemented  in  Depart-
ment  of  Labor  regula-
tions  (41  CFR  chapter
60); the Copeland “Anti-
Kickback: Act (18 U.S.C.
s847)  as  supplemented
in  Department  of  Labor
regulations (29 CFR part
3);  Sections  3  of  the
Housing and Urban De-
velopment  Act  of  1968
(12  U.S.C.  s  1701  et
seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights  Act  of  1964  (42
U.S.C.  s2000);  Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community De-
velopment  Act  of  1974
(42  U.S.C.  s  5301  et
seq.); the Age Discrimin-
ation  Act  of  1975  (42
U.S.C.  s701  et  seq.).
Contractor  agrees  to
comply with the require-
ments of all other applic-
able  federal,  state  and
local  laws  and  regula-
tions.
Prospective bidders/pro-
posers  shall  carefully
read  the  information
within  this  bid  docu-
ment including the Sec-
tion  3  Provisions  for
H o u s i n g  a n d  C o m -
munity Development As-
sistance  and  Publ ic
Housing Assistance, as
amended. Proposals that
fail  to  comply  with  the
requirement of Section 3
will  be considered non-
respons ive  and  ex -
cluded from further con-
sideration.
To comply with SB 854,
beginning January 1, 2015
the following applies:
A. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be listed
on a bid proposal for pub-
lic works project (submit-
ted on or after March 1,
2015) unless registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations (DIR)
pursuant to Labor Code
section 1725.5 [with lim-
ited exceptions from this
requirement for bid pur-
poses only under Labor
Code section 1771.1(a)].
B. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be awar-
ded a contract for public
works on a public works
project awarded on or after
April 1, 2015, unless re-
gistered with the DIR.
C. The project is subject to
compliance monitoring and
enforcement by the DIR.
D. Require the prime con-
tractor to post job site no-
tices prescribed by regula-
tion (regulation not cre-
ated yet) or the City must
post the notices itself.
The Contractor shall fill
in the Department of In-
dustrial  Relations (DIR)
Contractor  Registration
Number  Form provided
in  Appendix  “C”  and
submit it with the sealed
Bid.
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Bids must be prepared on
the approved Proposal
forms or copies thereof in
conformance with the In-
structions to Bidders and
submitted in a sealed en-
velope plainly marked on
the outside as follows:
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
RFI’S/QUESTIONS: The
deadline to submit All
RFI’s/Questions shall be
s u b m i t t e d p r i o r t o
Thursday, November 09,
2023  at  1:30  pm  to  the
OpenGov  website. Late
submittal shall not be con-
sidered.
SUBSTITUTIONS: All re-
q u e s t e d “ o r e q u a l ”
products shall be submit-
ted prior to the bid date for
review and evaluation with
a subsequent determina-
tion by the City if the “or
equal” product is satisfact-
ory for consideration and
be allowed to submitted
with the bid. The  dead-
line to submit “or equal”
items shall be Thursday,
November  09,  2023  at
1:30 pm to the OpenGov
website.  Late  “or  equal
submittals shall be rejec-
ted.
COMPLETION OF WORK:
The City is scheduling the
award of contract for Janu-
ary 9, 2023 On January
10, 2023 the City will is-
sue the Notice to Contract
Award requesting the con-
tractor to submit contracts,
bonds and insurance certi-
ficates and submitted to
the City within fifteen (15)
calendar days.
In order to accommodate
weed abatement proced-
ures. The City will issue a
Weed Abatement Proced-
ure Notice to Proceed for a
duration of twenty-working
(20) days. When this is
complete, the City will is-
sue the construction No-
tice to Proceed for a dura-
tion of one hundred and
twenty (120) working days
(Monday – Friday), as stip-
ulated in the written No-
tice to Proceed issued by
the City Engineer. Failure
to complete the Work with-
in the time set forth herein
will result in the imposition
of liquidated damages for
each day of delay, in the
amount set forth in Sec-
tion 39 of the General Pro-
visions.
OBTAINING PLANS AND
SPECIFICATIONS: Plans,
Specifications, and any
project addenda are avail-
able for download the new
City platform OpenGov, ht-
tps://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, and on the city’s
website, www.cityoflap-
alma.org. All prospective
bidders are responsible for
registering on OpenGov
and checking the City’s
website for the issuance of
any project addenda prior
to the bid opening for in-
clusion as part of the bid
proposal. Due to the post-
ing of the documents on
the city website, OpenGov
will maintain a plan holder
list. For project informa-
tion, please contact the of-
fice of the City Engineer at
(714) 690-3310.
BONDS: Pursuant to the
Instructions to Bidders,
each proposal shall be ac-
companied by cash or by a
cashier's or certified check
or by a bid bond in the
amount of ten  percent
(10%) of the amount of the
bid price payable to the
City of La Palma as a
guarantee that the bidder,
if his or her proposal is ac-
cepted, will promptly ex-
ecute the contract, secure
payment of workers’ com-
pensation insurance and
furnish a satisfactory faith-
ful performance bond in
the amount of one  hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price and a
labor and material bond
in the amount of one hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price.
SUBSTITUTION OF SE-
CURITIES: The Contract-
or may substitute securit-
ies for any monies with-
held by the City to ensure
performance under the
contract in compliance
with the requirements of
Public Contract Code Sec-
tion 22300 and the "Sub-
stitution of Securities" pro-
visions of the General Pro-
visions.
WAGE RATES: As re-
quired by Section 1773 of
the California Labor Code,
the Director of the Depart-
ment of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia has determined the
general prevailing rates of
wages in the locality in
which Work is scheduled
to be performed. Copies of
the wage rate determina-
tions, entitled PREVAIL-
ING WAGE SCALE, are
mainta ined at the La
Palma City Hall, 7822
Walker Street, La Palma,
California, and are avail-
able to any interested
party upon request. The
Contractor shall post a
copy of this document at
each job site. The Con-
tractor and any subcon-
tractor under it shall pay
not less than the specified
prevailing rates of wages
to all workers employed in
the execution of the Con-
tract.
C O N T R A C T O R ' S L I -
CENSE: In accordance
with the provisions of Cali-
fornia Publ ic Contract
Code Section 3300, the
City requires that the bid-
der possess the following
c l a s s i f i c a t i o n o f
contractor’s license at the
time that the bid proposal
is submitted: Class A, or
Specialty. If the license
classif ication specif ied
hereinabove is that of a
“specialty contractor” as
defined in Section 7058 of
the California Business
and Professions Code, the
specialty contractor awar-
ded the Contract for this
Work shall itself construct
a majority of the Work, in
accordance with the provi-
sions of California Busi-
ness and Professions
Code Section 7059. Each
bidder shall clearly write or
type their contractor’s li-
cense number on the out-
side of the bidding envel-
ope.
CONTRACTORS REGIS-
TRATION: In accordance
with the provisions of
L a b o r C o d e s e c t i o n
1771.1, a contractor or
subcontractor shall not be
qualified to (a) bid on or be
listed in a bid proposal or
(b) engage in the perform-
ance of this Work, unless
currently registered and
qualified to perform the
Work pursuant to Labor
Code Section 1725.5.
COMPLIANCE MONITOR-
ING AND ENFORCE-
MENT: Contractor’s per-
formance of the Work de-
scribed in this Notice Invit-
ing Bids is subject to com-
pliance monitoring and en-
forcement by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations.
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY:
The City hereby notifies all
bidders that it will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of sex,
race, color, or national ori-
gin in consideration for an
award.
C ITY 'S RIGHTS RE-
SERVED: The City of La
Palma reserves the right to
reject any and all propos-
als or bids, including the
bid of a bidder who has
been delinquent or unfaith-
ful in any former contract
with the City of La Palma,
or to waive any irregularit-
ies or informalities in any
bids or in the bidding,
should it deem this neces-
sary for the public good.
No bidder may withdraw
his or her bid for a period
of sixty (60) days after the
date from the opening
thereof.
This  is  a  federally  as-
sisted construction con-
tract .  Federal  Labor
Standards  Provisions,
including  prevai l ing
wage  requirements  of
the Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts (DBRA) will be
enforced. In the event of
a conflict  between Fed-
eral  and  State  wage
rates,  the  higher  of  the
two will  prevail.
The Contractor’s duty to
pay  State  prevai l ing
wages can be found un-
der Labor Code Section
1770  et  seq.  and  Labor
Code Sections 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties  for  failure  to  pay
prevailing  wages  and
employee  apprentices
including forfeitures and
debarment.
The  current  Federal
Wage  Decision  is  con-
tained  herein,  in  Ap-
pendix “B”, and may be
updated  via  addendum
to this bid package with-
in ten (10) days prior to
bid opening and can be
f o u n d  a t
http://www.wdol.gov/wd
ol/scafiles/davisbacon/c
a/html.  The  applicable
Federal  Wage  Decision
will be incorporated into
the  contract.  The  State
wage rates are available
o n l i n e  a t
http://www/dir.ca.gov/DL
S R / P W D / i n d e x . h t m .
Lower State wage rates
for  work classifications
not specifically included
in the Federal Wage De-
cision  are  not  accept-
able.  The  Contractor
may  request  an  Addi-
tional Classification and
Rate  if  work  classifica-
tion cannot be located in
the  Federal  Wage  De-
cision.
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t  a n d  a l l
Bidder/Proposers  must
commit to achieving es-
tablished requirements,
including  benchmarks,
for  Section  3  workers
and Targeted Section 3
workers  to  be  con-
sidered  a  Section  3  re-
sponsive  bidder/pro-
poser and eligible for  a
contract  award.
Assignment:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of Part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Contractor's License:
When federal funds are
being used, at the time of
“Award of the Contract”,
the Prime Contractor must
have a valid California
State Contractor's License
with a classification of “A
or  Specialty” in accord-
ance with provisions of
Chapter 9, Division 111,
Sections 7000 through
7145 of the Business and
Professions Code of the
State of California and the
Prime Contractor shall
warrant that it and all sub-
contractors are properly li-
censed, which includes
each entity having a local
business license. When
federal funds are not be-
ing used, a bid by a con-
tractor who is not properly
l icensed must be con-
sidered nonresponsive,
will be rejected by the City,
and the unlicensed con-
tractor may be subject to
discipline by the state.
Contractor  Eligibil ity
Check:
Prior to awarding a con-
tract, the City will verify the
contractor's (1) status with
the California Department
of Industrial Relations at
http://www.cslb.ca.gov and
https://efiling.dir.ca.gov
and (2 ) e l i g ib i l i t y a t
http://www.dir.ca.gov/dlse/
debar.html and with the
online excluded parties list
at the federal System For
A w a r d M a n a g e m e n t
( S A M ) w e b s i t e
h t t ps : / /www.sam.gov .
Affirmative Action:
All bidders are on notice
that the City will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of reli-
gious creed, sex, race, col-
or, national origin in con-
sideration for an award.
Moreover, no contractor
receiving the award may
discriminate nor permit
others he may hire to en-
gage in, discrimination in
the employment of per-
sons because of their
race, religious creed, col-
or, or national origin, an-
cestry, physical disability,
mental disability, medical
condition, genetic informa-
tion, marital status, sex,
gender, gender identity,
gender expression, age,
sexual orientation, or milit-
ary or veteran status, ex-
cept as provided in Gov-
ernment Code Section
12940.
DATED: October 18, 2023
CITY OF LA PALMA,
CALIFORNIA
By:__________________
___________
Andy Ramirez
Public Works and Com-
munity Services Director

News Enterprise
10/18/2023-135860
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CITY OF LA PALMA
NOTICE INVITING BIDS
VARIOUS MEDIAN IS-

LANDS PROJECT
(CITY PROJECT NO. ST-

371)
NOTICE INVITING BIDS:
Sealed proposals will be
received online via the
Ci ty ’ s e -Procurement
P o r t a l ( “ P o r t a l ” ) a t
https://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, office of the City En-
gineer, Community Ser-
vices Office, La Palma,
California, until 1:30  PM
on Thursday, November
30, 2023 for furnishing of
all labor, materials and
equipment for VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No. ST-371 (the “Project”).
The  Bids  shall  be  sub-
mitted to the City Engin-
eer  through  the  Open-
Gov.com  platform. All
prospective bidders are re-
sponsible for registering
on OpenGov and check-
ing the City’s website for
the issuance of any project
addenda prior to the bid
opening for inclusion as
part of the bid proposal.
Due to the posting of the
documents on the city
website, OpenGov wil l
maintain a plan holder list.
For project information,
please contact the office of
the City Engineer at (714)
690-3310. Sealed  bids
will  NOT  be  accepted.
The  BIDS  for  VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No.  ST-371,  SHALL  BE
SUBMITTED  THROUGH
OpenGov.
D E S C R I P T I O N O F
WORK: The work in-
cludes rehabilitation of the
La Palma Avenue Median
Islands from the west city
limits to the east city limits;
Walker Avenue Median Is-
lands from Orangethorpe
Avenue southerly; and
Moody Street from Cres-
cent Ave to Houston Ave
including the removal of
existing landscaping/irriga-
tion, tree removals, hard-
scape removals and re-
placement, installation of
new drip irrigation system,
planting of new trees along
w i t h n e w
landscaping/hardscaping
in the medians islands.
Also, included are new
median islands on Moody
Street from Malaga Aven-
ue to La Luna Avenue with
complete irrigation and
landscaping per the con-
tract plans and specifica-
tions.
This project is NOT sub-
ject to a project labor, sta-
bilization, collective bar-
gaining or community work
force agreements
The City received Feder-
al Funding through HUD
for  this  project.  There-
fore,  Federal  Davis  Ba-
con  wage  rates  are  ap-
pl ied  to  the  project.
However,  If  the  State
Prevailing  Wages  are
higher than the Federal
Wage Rates,  the higher
are to be applied the that
specific classification.
A  MANDATORY  AND
SECTIO N  3  PRE-BID
MEETING,  will  be  held
on Tuesday October 24,
2023  at  2:30  pm  at  the
City  of  Palma  Com-
munity Services Offices,
7821  Walker  Street,  La
Palma, CA 90623. In or-
der to receive considera-
tion for the Section 3 bid
preference,  a  bidder
must complete, sign and
submit  the  following
forms with their bid pro-
posal: 1) Section 3 Busi-
ness Certification Form,
and (b) Section 3 Resid-
ent Certification form(s).
A  reasonable  bid  must
be with the Zone of Con-
sideration at the time of
bid  evaluation. All con-
tractors are required to
have a representative at-
tend and sign in at the pre-
bid meeting. Failure to
comply with this attend-
ance and sign in require-
ments will result in the
Contactor’s proposal be-
ing found non-responsive
to the required proced-
ures.
Prevailing  Wage  State-
ment:
This contract will be fun-
ded in whole or in part with
Federal housing and com-
munity development funds.
Federal Labor Standard
Provisions, including pre-
vailing wage requirements
of Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts will be enforced.
A copy of the Federal
Wage Decision applicable
to this project is included
in the Bid Documents in
Appendix “B”. This project
is a public work in the
State of California, funded
in whole or in part with
public funds. Therefore,
the higher of the two ap-
plicable prevailing wage
rates federal or state, will
be enforced. The Contract-
or’s duty to pay State pre-
vai l ing wages can be
found under Labor Code
Section 1770 et seq. Labor
Code Section 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties for failure to pay pre-
vailing wages and to em-
ploy apprentices, includ-
ing forfeitures and de-
barment. State Wage De-
cision is on file at the City
Clerk’s office and is also
a v a i l a b l e O n l i n e a t
h t tp : / /d i r . ca .gov /d is r / .
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Section 1777.5, 1777.6
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title
8, California Administra-
tion Code, Section 200 et
seq. to ensure compliance
and complete understand-
ing of the law regarding
apprentices.
Fair  Employment  Prac-
tices/Equal Opportunity
Acts:
In the performance of this
Agreement, Contractor
shall comply with all ap-
plicable provisions of the
California Fair Employ-
ment Practices Act (Cali-
fornia Government Code
Section §§ C – 32 B-3
12940 et seq.), the applic-
able equal employment
provisions of the Civi l
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000e et seq.),
and the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990 (42
U.S.C. §§ 12101, et seq.).
Labor  Standards  and
Civil  Rights:
Contractor agrees to com-
ply with the requirements
of the Secretary of Labor
and the latest amend-
ments to: Executive Or-
ders 11246 and 11375, as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(41 C.F.R. chapter 60); the
Copeland “Anti-Kickback”
Act (18 U.S.C. § 847) as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(29 C.F.R. part 3); Section
3 of the Housing and Urb-
an Development Act of
1968 (12 U.S.C. §§ 1701
et seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000); Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community Devel-
opment Act of 1974 (42
U.S.C. §§ 5301 et seq.);
the Age Discrimination Act
of 1975 (42 U.S.C. §§
6101 et seq.); and Section
504 of the Rehabilitation
Act of 1973 (29 U.S.C. §§
701 et seq.). Contractor
agrees to comply with the
requirements of all other
applicable federal, State
and local laws and regula-
tions.
State Labor Standards &
Wage Requirements:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor
and all subcontractors
agree to follow the State
Labor standards. State
Labor standards provi-
sions, including prevailing
wage requirements, will be
enforced such that the
general rate of per diem
wages (prevailing wage)
shall be paid for each
craft, classification, or type
of worker needed to ex-
ecute the contract to all
workers employed in the
execution of the contract.
All contractors and sub-
contractors must furnish
electronic certified payroll
records directly to the
Labor Commissioner (aka
Division of Labor Stand-
ards Enforcement) as fur-
ther described in Article
VIII of the Agreement. The
State General Prevailing
Wage Determination is as
established by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations (available at
http://www.dir.ca.gov/DLS
R/PWD/index.htm). The
prevailing rate of per diem
wages are on file at the
City.
Section 3 Statement:
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t a n d a l l
Bidders/Proposers must
commit to achieving estab-
lished requirements, in-
cluding benchmarks, for
Section 3 workers and
Targeted Section 3 work-
ers to be considered a re-
sponsive bidder/proposer
and eligible for a contract
award. Section 3 Require-
ments, Clause, and Pro-
gram Forms can be loc-
ated in Appendix “A” of
this document.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an  Development  Act  of
1968,  as  amended,  12
U.S.C 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low and very low-
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The parties to this con-
tract  agree  to  comply
with  HUD’s  regulations
in  24  CFR  part  135,
which  implement  Sec-
tion 3. As evidenced by
their  execution  of  this
contract,  the  parties  to
this contract certify that
they  are  under  no  con-
tractual or other impedi-
ment that would prevent
them  from  complying
with the part 135 regula-
tions.
The Contractor agrees to
send  to  each  labor  or-
ganization or represent-
ative  of  workers  with
which  the  Contractor
has a collective bargain-
ing  agreement  or  other
understanding, if any, a
notice advising the labor
organization or workers’
representative  of  the
Contractor’s  commit-
ments  under  this  Sec-
tion  3  clause,  and  will
post  copies  of  the  no-
t ice  in  conspicuous
places  at  the  work  site
where  both  employees
and applicants for train-
ing and employment po-
sitions  can  see  the  no-
tice.  The  notices  shall
describe  the  Section  3
preference,  shall  set
forth  minimum  number
and job titles subject to
hire,  availability  of  ap-
prenticeships and train-
ing positions, the quali-
fications  of  each;  and
the name and location of
person(s) taking applica-
tions for each of the pos-
itions;  and  the  anticip-
ated date the work shall
begin.
The Contractor agrees to
include  this  Section  3
clause in every sub-con-
tract  subject  to  compli-
ance with regulation sin
24  CFR  part  135,  and
agrees to take appropri-
ate  action,  as  provided
in  the  applicable  provi-
sion of the sub-contract-
or  in  this  Section  3
clause,  upon  a  finding
that  the  sub-contractor
is in violation of the reg-
ulation  in  24  CFR  part
135. The Contractor will
not  sub-contract  with
a n y  s u b - c o n t r a c t o r
where  the  Contractor
has notice or knowledge
that  the  sub-contractor
has been found in viola-
tion of the regulation in
24 CFR part 135.
The Contractor will certi-
fy  that  any  vacant  em-
ployment  positions,  in-
cluding  training  posi-
tions,  that  are  filled  (1)
after  the  Contractor  is
selected  but  before  the
contract  is  executed,
and (2) with persons oth-
er  than  those  to  whom
the  regulations  of  24
CFR part 135 require em-
ployment  opportunities
to be directed, were not
filled  to  circumvent  the
Contractor’s  obligation
under  24  CFR part  135.
Noncompl iance  wi th
HUD’s regulations in 24
CFR part 135 may result
in  sanctions,  termina-
tion of  this contract  for
default,  and  debarment
or  suspension  from fu-
ture  HUD assisted con-
tracts.
With  respect  to  work
performed  in  connec-
t ion  wi th  Sect ion  3
covered Indian Housing
Assistance, Section 7(b)
of  the  Indian  Self-De-
termination and Educa-
tion Assistance Act  (25
U.S.C.  450e)  also  ap-
plies  to  the  work  to  be
performed  under  this
contract. Section 7(b) re-
q u i r e s  t h a t  t o  t h e
greatest  extent  feasible
(i) preference and oppor-
tunities for training and
employment shall be giv-
en  to  Indians,  and  (ii)
preference is the award
of  contracts  and  sub-
contracts shall be given
to  Indian  organizations
and  Indian-owned  Eco-
n o m i c  E n t e r p r i s e s .
Parties  to  this  contract
that  are  subject  to  the
provisions of  Section 3
and section 7(b) agree to
comply with Section 3 to
the  maximum  extent
feasib le ,  but  not  in
derogation  of  compli-
ance  with  section  7(b).
Federal  Forms  to  be
Submitted  with  Bid:
The forms contained in
Appendix C, including
Section 3 forms, must be
completed, and included
with the bid submittal.
Award of Contract:
The following are condi-
tions to the award of the
contract:
i. for any bid submitted on
or after March 1, 2015,
each contractor and sub-
contractor listed on the bid
must be registered with
the Department of Industri-
al Relations pursuant to
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1725.5, subject to the lim-
ited exceptions set forth in
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1771.1(a) (regarding the
submission of a bid as au-
thorized by Business &
Professions Code Section
7029.1 or Public Contract
Code Section 10164 or
20103.5, provided the con-
tractor is registered to per-
form public work pursuant
to Section 1725.5 at the
time the contract is awar-
ded); and
ii. ii. for any contract awar-
ded on or after April 1,
2015, no contractor or
subcontractor may be
awarded this contract un-
less the contractor and
each subcontractor listed
on the bid is registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations pursu-
ant to Section 1725.5.
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Sections 1777.5, 1777.6,
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title 8
of the California Code of
Regulations, Section 200,
et seq., to ensure compli-
ance and complete under-
standing of the law regard-
ing apprentices.
Federal  Labor  Stand-
ards  Provision:
Refer to the HUD-4010
forms are located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Current  Federal  DOL
Wage  Decision:
Refer to the Federal Wage
Decision, located in Ap-
pendix “D” of this docu-
ment.
Federal EEO and Affirm-
ative  Action  Require-
ments:
Refer to the Federal Equal
Employment Opportunity
and Affirmative Action Re-
quirements located in Ap-
pendix “c” of this docu-
ment.
Contracting with Small &
Minority Firms, Women’s
Business Enterprise:
Refer to the Contracting
wi th Smal l Bus iness ,
Minority Firms, Women's
Business Enterprise, and
Labor Surplus Area Firms,
Federal Contract Provi-
sion, located in Appendix
“C” of this document.
Compliance  with  Clean
Air  and  Water  Acts:
Refer to the Compliance
with Clean Air and Water
Acts, Federal Contract
Provision, located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Conflict of Interest:
In  the  procurement  of
supplies,  equipment,
construction,  and  ser-
vice  of  sub-recipients,
the  conflict-of-interest
provision  in  24  CFR
85.36,  OMB  Circular  A-
110 and 24 CFR 570.611
shall  apply. No employ-
ee, officer or agent of the
sub-recipient shall parti-
cipate  in  the  selection,
award, or administration
of a contract supported
by  federal  funds  in  a
conflict  of  interest,  real
or apparent, would be in-
volved.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an Development  Action
of 1968, as amended, 12
U.S.C. 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall, to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low- and very-low
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The Bidder/Proposer  is
required to complete and
submit  the  Declaration
of Intent to Comply with
Section 3 Requirements
–  Required  Contract
Forms  and  Certif ica-
tions, certifying that they
intend  to  comply  with
the  requirement  of  the
Secretary  of  Labor  and
the  latest  amendments
to:  Executive  Orders
11246 and 11375, as sup-
plemented  in  Depart-
ment  of  Labor  regula-
tions  (41  CFR  chapter
60); the Copeland “Anti-
Kickback: Act (18 U.S.C.
s847)  as  supplemented
in  Department  of  Labor
regulations (29 CFR part
3);  Sections  3  of  the
Housing and Urban De-
velopment  Act  of  1968
(12  U.S.C.  s  1701  et
seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights  Act  of  1964  (42
U.S.C.  s2000);  Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community De-
velopment  Act  of  1974
(42  U.S.C.  s  5301  et
seq.); the Age Discrimin-
ation  Act  of  1975  (42
U.S.C.  s701  et  seq.).
Contractor  agrees  to
comply with the require-
ments of all other applic-
able  federal,  state  and
local  laws  and  regula-
tions.
Prospective bidders/pro-
posers  shall  carefully
read  the  information
within  this  bid  docu-
ment including the Sec-
tion  3  Provisions  for
H o u s i n g  a n d  C o m -
munity Development As-
sistance  and  Publ ic
Housing Assistance, as
amended. Proposals that
fail  to  comply  with  the
requirement of Section 3
will  be considered non-
respons ive  and  ex -
cluded from further con-
sideration.
To comply with SB 854,
beginning January 1, 2015
the following applies:
A. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be listed
on a bid proposal for pub-
lic works project (submit-
ted on or after March 1,
2015) unless registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations (DIR)
pursuant to Labor Code
section 1725.5 [with lim-
ited exceptions from this
requirement for bid pur-
poses only under Labor
Code section 1771.1(a)].
B. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be awar-
ded a contract for public
works on a public works
project awarded on or after
April 1, 2015, unless re-
gistered with the DIR.
C. The project is subject to
compliance monitoring and
enforcement by the DIR.
D. Require the prime con-
tractor to post job site no-
tices prescribed by regula-
tion (regulation not cre-
ated yet) or the City must
post the notices itself.
The Contractor shall fill
in the Department of In-
dustrial  Relations (DIR)
Contractor  Registration
Number  Form provided
in  Appendix  “C”  and
submit it with the sealed
Bid.
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Bids must be prepared on
the approved Proposal
forms or copies thereof in
conformance with the In-
structions to Bidders and
submitted in a sealed en-
velope plainly marked on
the outside as follows:
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
RFI’S/QUESTIONS: The
deadline to submit All
RFI’s/Questions shall be
s u b m i t t e d p r i o r t o
Thursday, November 09,
2023  at  1:30  pm  to  the
OpenGov  website. Late
submittal shall not be con-
sidered.
SUBSTITUTIONS: All re-
q u e s t e d “ o r e q u a l ”
products shall be submit-
ted prior to the bid date for
review and evaluation with
a subsequent determina-
tion by the City if the “or
equal” product is satisfact-
ory for consideration and
be allowed to submitted
with the bid. The  dead-
line to submit “or equal”
items shall be Thursday,
November  09,  2023  at
1:30 pm to the OpenGov
website.  Late  “or  equal
submittals shall be rejec-
ted.
COMPLETION OF WORK:
The City is scheduling the
award of contract for Janu-
ary 9, 2023 On January
10, 2023 the City will is-
sue the Notice to Contract
Award requesting the con-
tractor to submit contracts,
bonds and insurance certi-
ficates and submitted to
the City within fifteen (15)
calendar days.
In order to accommodate
weed abatement proced-
ures. The City will issue a
Weed Abatement Proced-
ure Notice to Proceed for a
duration of twenty-working
(20) days. When this is
complete, the City will is-
sue the construction No-
tice to Proceed for a dura-
tion of one hundred and
twenty (120) working days
(Monday – Friday), as stip-
ulated in the written No-
tice to Proceed issued by
the City Engineer. Failure
to complete the Work with-
in the time set forth herein
will result in the imposition
of liquidated damages for
each day of delay, in the
amount set forth in Sec-
tion 39 of the General Pro-
visions.
OBTAINING PLANS AND
SPECIFICATIONS: Plans,
Specifications, and any
project addenda are avail-
able for download the new
City platform OpenGov, ht-
tps://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, and on the city’s
website, www.cityoflap-
alma.org. All prospective
bidders are responsible for
registering on OpenGov
and checking the City’s
website for the issuance of
any project addenda prior
to the bid opening for in-
clusion as part of the bid
proposal. Due to the post-
ing of the documents on
the city website, OpenGov
will maintain a plan holder
list. For project informa-
tion, please contact the of-
fice of the City Engineer at
(714) 690-3310.
BONDS: Pursuant to the
Instructions to Bidders,
each proposal shall be ac-
companied by cash or by a
cashier's or certified check
or by a bid bond in the
amount of ten  percent
(10%) of the amount of the
bid price payable to the
City of La Palma as a
guarantee that the bidder,
if his or her proposal is ac-
cepted, will promptly ex-
ecute the contract, secure
payment of workers’ com-
pensation insurance and
furnish a satisfactory faith-
ful performance bond in
the amount of one  hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price and a
labor and material bond
in the amount of one hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price.
SUBSTITUTION OF SE-
CURITIES: The Contract-
or may substitute securit-
ies for any monies with-
held by the City to ensure
performance under the
contract in compliance
with the requirements of
Public Contract Code Sec-
tion 22300 and the "Sub-
stitution of Securities" pro-
visions of the General Pro-
visions.
WAGE RATES: As re-
quired by Section 1773 of
the California Labor Code,
the Director of the Depart-
ment of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia has determined the
general prevailing rates of
wages in the locality in
which Work is scheduled
to be performed. Copies of
the wage rate determina-
tions, entitled PREVAIL-
ING WAGE SCALE, are
mainta ined at the La
Palma City Hall, 7822
Walker Street, La Palma,
California, and are avail-
able to any interested
party upon request. The
Contractor shall post a
copy of this document at
each job site. The Con-
tractor and any subcon-
tractor under it shall pay
not less than the specified
prevailing rates of wages
to all workers employed in
the execution of the Con-
tract.
C O N T R A C T O R ' S L I -
CENSE: In accordance
with the provisions of Cali-
fornia Publ ic Contract
Code Section 3300, the
City requires that the bid-
der possess the following
c l a s s i f i c a t i o n o f
contractor’s license at the
time that the bid proposal
is submitted: Class A, or
Specialty. If the license
classif ication specif ied
hereinabove is that of a
“specialty contractor” as
defined in Section 7058 of
the California Business
and Professions Code, the
specialty contractor awar-
ded the Contract for this
Work shall itself construct
a majority of the Work, in
accordance with the provi-
sions of California Busi-
ness and Professions
Code Section 7059. Each
bidder shall clearly write or
type their contractor’s li-
cense number on the out-
side of the bidding envel-
ope.
CONTRACTORS REGIS-
TRATION: In accordance
with the provisions of
L a b o r C o d e s e c t i o n
1771.1, a contractor or
subcontractor shall not be
qualified to (a) bid on or be
listed in a bid proposal or
(b) engage in the perform-
ance of this Work, unless
currently registered and
qualified to perform the
Work pursuant to Labor
Code Section 1725.5.
COMPLIANCE MONITOR-
ING AND ENFORCE-
MENT: Contractor’s per-
formance of the Work de-
scribed in this Notice Invit-
ing Bids is subject to com-
pliance monitoring and en-
forcement by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations.
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY:
The City hereby notifies all
bidders that it will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of sex,
race, color, or national ori-
gin in consideration for an
award.
C ITY 'S RIGHTS RE-
SERVED: The City of La
Palma reserves the right to
reject any and all propos-
als or bids, including the
bid of a bidder who has
been delinquent or unfaith-
ful in any former contract
with the City of La Palma,
or to waive any irregularit-
ies or informalities in any
bids or in the bidding,
should it deem this neces-
sary for the public good.
No bidder may withdraw
his or her bid for a period
of sixty (60) days after the
date from the opening
thereof.
This  is  a  federally  as-
sisted construction con-
tract .  Federal  Labor
Standards  Provisions,
including  prevai l ing
wage  requirements  of
the Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts (DBRA) will be
enforced. In the event of
a conflict  between Fed-
eral  and  State  wage
rates,  the  higher  of  the
two will  prevail.
The Contractor’s duty to
pay  State  prevai l ing
wages can be found un-
der Labor Code Section
1770  et  seq.  and  Labor
Code Sections 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties  for  failure  to  pay
prevailing  wages  and
employee  apprentices
including forfeitures and
debarment.
The  current  Federal
Wage  Decision  is  con-
tained  herein,  in  Ap-
pendix “B”, and may be
updated  via  addendum
to this bid package with-
in ten (10) days prior to
bid opening and can be
f o u n d  a t
http://www.wdol.gov/wd
ol/scafiles/davisbacon/c
a/html.  The  applicable
Federal  Wage  Decision
will be incorporated into
the  contract.  The  State
wage rates are available
o n l i n e  a t
http://www/dir.ca.gov/DL
S R / P W D / i n d e x . h t m .
Lower State wage rates
for  work classifications
not specifically included
in the Federal Wage De-
cision  are  not  accept-
able.  The  Contractor
may  request  an  Addi-
tional Classification and
Rate  if  work  classifica-
tion cannot be located in
the  Federal  Wage  De-
cision.
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t  a n d  a l l
Bidder/Proposers  must
commit to achieving es-
tablished requirements,
including  benchmarks,
for  Section  3  workers
and Targeted Section 3
workers  to  be  con-
sidered  a  Section  3  re-
sponsive  bidder/pro-
poser and eligible for  a
contract  award.
Assignment:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of Part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Contractor's License:
When federal funds are
being used, at the time of
“Award of the Contract”,
the Prime Contractor must
have a valid California
State Contractor's License
with a classification of “A
or  Specialty” in accord-
ance with provisions of
Chapter 9, Division 111,
Sections 7000 through
7145 of the Business and
Professions Code of the
State of California and the
Prime Contractor shall
warrant that it and all sub-
contractors are properly li-
censed, which includes
each entity having a local
business license. When
federal funds are not be-
ing used, a bid by a con-
tractor who is not properly
l icensed must be con-
sidered nonresponsive,
will be rejected by the City,
and the unlicensed con-
tractor may be subject to
discipline by the state.
Contractor  Eligibil ity
Check:
Prior to awarding a con-
tract, the City will verify the
contractor's (1) status with
the California Department
of Industrial Relations at
http://www.cslb.ca.gov and
https://efiling.dir.ca.gov
and (2 ) e l i g ib i l i t y a t
http://www.dir.ca.gov/dlse/
debar.html and with the
online excluded parties list
at the federal System For
A w a r d M a n a g e m e n t
( S A M ) w e b s i t e
h t t ps : / /www.sam.gov .
Affirmative Action:
All bidders are on notice
that the City will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of reli-
gious creed, sex, race, col-
or, national origin in con-
sideration for an award.
Moreover, no contractor
receiving the award may
discriminate nor permit
others he may hire to en-
gage in, discrimination in
the employment of per-
sons because of their
race, religious creed, col-
or, or national origin, an-
cestry, physical disability,
mental disability, medical
condition, genetic informa-
tion, marital status, sex,
gender, gender identity,
gender expression, age,
sexual orientation, or milit-
ary or veteran status, ex-
cept as provided in Gov-
ernment Code Section
12940.
DATED: October 18, 2023
CITY OF LA PALMA,
CALIFORNIA
By:__________________
___________
Andy Ramirez
Public Works and Com-
munity Services Director

News Enterprise
10/18/2023-135860

Legals-NE

CITY OF LA PALMA
NOTICE INVITING BIDS
VARIOUS MEDIAN IS-

LANDS PROJECT
(CITY PROJECT NO. ST-

371)
NOTICE INVITING BIDS:
Sealed proposals will be
received online via the
Ci ty ’ s e -Procurement
P o r t a l ( “ P o r t a l ” ) a t
https://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, office of the City En-
gineer, Community Ser-
vices Office, La Palma,
California, until 1:30  PM
on Thursday, November
30, 2023 for furnishing of
all labor, materials and
equipment for VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No. ST-371 (the “Project”).
The  Bids  shall  be  sub-
mitted to the City Engin-
eer  through  the  Open-
Gov.com  platform. All
prospective bidders are re-
sponsible for registering
on OpenGov and check-
ing the City’s website for
the issuance of any project
addenda prior to the bid
opening for inclusion as
part of the bid proposal.
Due to the posting of the
documents on the city
website, OpenGov wil l
maintain a plan holder list.
For project information,
please contact the office of
the City Engineer at (714)
690-3310. Sealed  bids
will  NOT  be  accepted.
The  BIDS  for  VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No.  ST-371,  SHALL  BE
SUBMITTED  THROUGH
OpenGov.
D E S C R I P T I O N O F
WORK: The work in-
cludes rehabilitation of the
La Palma Avenue Median
Islands from the west city
limits to the east city limits;
Walker Avenue Median Is-
lands from Orangethorpe
Avenue southerly; and
Moody Street from Cres-
cent Ave to Houston Ave
including the removal of
existing landscaping/irriga-
tion, tree removals, hard-
scape removals and re-
placement, installation of
new drip irrigation system,
planting of new trees along
w i t h n e w
landscaping/hardscaping
in the medians islands.
Also, included are new
median islands on Moody
Street from Malaga Aven-
ue to La Luna Avenue with
complete irrigation and
landscaping per the con-
tract plans and specifica-
tions.
This project is NOT sub-
ject to a project labor, sta-
bilization, collective bar-
gaining or community work
force agreements
The City received Feder-
al Funding through HUD
for  this  project.  There-
fore,  Federal  Davis  Ba-
con  wage  rates  are  ap-
pl ied  to  the  project.
However,  If  the  State
Prevailing  Wages  are
higher than the Federal
Wage Rates,  the higher
are to be applied the that
specific classification.
A  MANDATORY  AND
SECTIO N  3  PRE-BID
MEETING,  will  be  held
on Tuesday October 24,
2023  at  2:30  pm  at  the
City  of  Palma  Com-
munity Services Offices,
7821  Walker  Street,  La
Palma, CA 90623. In or-
der to receive considera-
tion for the Section 3 bid
preference,  a  bidder
must complete, sign and
submit  the  following
forms with their bid pro-
posal: 1) Section 3 Busi-
ness Certification Form,
and (b) Section 3 Resid-
ent Certification form(s).
A  reasonable  bid  must
be with the Zone of Con-
sideration at the time of
bid  evaluation. All con-
tractors are required to
have a representative at-
tend and sign in at the pre-
bid meeting. Failure to
comply with this attend-
ance and sign in require-
ments will result in the
Contactor’s proposal be-
ing found non-responsive
to the required proced-
ures.
Prevailing  Wage  State-
ment:
This contract will be fun-
ded in whole or in part with
Federal housing and com-
munity development funds.
Federal Labor Standard
Provisions, including pre-
vailing wage requirements
of Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts will be enforced.
A copy of the Federal
Wage Decision applicable
to this project is included
in the Bid Documents in
Appendix “B”. This project
is a public work in the
State of California, funded
in whole or in part with
public funds. Therefore,
the higher of the two ap-
plicable prevailing wage
rates federal or state, will
be enforced. The Contract-
or’s duty to pay State pre-
vai l ing wages can be
found under Labor Code
Section 1770 et seq. Labor
Code Section 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties for failure to pay pre-
vailing wages and to em-
ploy apprentices, includ-
ing forfeitures and de-
barment. State Wage De-
cision is on file at the City
Clerk’s office and is also
a v a i l a b l e O n l i n e a t
h t tp : / /d i r . ca .gov /d is r / .
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Section 1777.5, 1777.6
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title
8, California Administra-
tion Code, Section 200 et
seq. to ensure compliance
and complete understand-
ing of the law regarding
apprentices.
Fair  Employment  Prac-
tices/Equal Opportunity
Acts:
In the performance of this
Agreement, Contractor
shall comply with all ap-
plicable provisions of the
California Fair Employ-
ment Practices Act (Cali-
fornia Government Code
Section §§ C – 32 B-3
12940 et seq.), the applic-
able equal employment
provisions of the Civi l
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000e et seq.),
and the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990 (42
U.S.C. §§ 12101, et seq.).
Labor  Standards  and
Civil  Rights:
Contractor agrees to com-
ply with the requirements
of the Secretary of Labor
and the latest amend-
ments to: Executive Or-
ders 11246 and 11375, as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(41 C.F.R. chapter 60); the
Copeland “Anti-Kickback”
Act (18 U.S.C. § 847) as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(29 C.F.R. part 3); Section
3 of the Housing and Urb-
an Development Act of
1968 (12 U.S.C. §§ 1701
et seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000); Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community Devel-
opment Act of 1974 (42
U.S.C. §§ 5301 et seq.);
the Age Discrimination Act
of 1975 (42 U.S.C. §§
6101 et seq.); and Section
504 of the Rehabilitation
Act of 1973 (29 U.S.C. §§
701 et seq.). Contractor
agrees to comply with the
requirements of all other
applicable federal, State
and local laws and regula-
tions.
State Labor Standards &
Wage Requirements:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor
and all subcontractors
agree to follow the State
Labor standards. State
Labor standards provi-
sions, including prevailing
wage requirements, will be
enforced such that the
general rate of per diem
wages (prevailing wage)
shall be paid for each
craft, classification, or type
of worker needed to ex-
ecute the contract to all
workers employed in the
execution of the contract.
All contractors and sub-
contractors must furnish
electronic certified payroll
records directly to the
Labor Commissioner (aka
Division of Labor Stand-
ards Enforcement) as fur-
ther described in Article
VIII of the Agreement. The
State General Prevailing
Wage Determination is as
established by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations (available at
http://www.dir.ca.gov/DLS
R/PWD/index.htm). The
prevailing rate of per diem
wages are on file at the
City.
Section 3 Statement:
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t a n d a l l
Bidders/Proposers must
commit to achieving estab-
lished requirements, in-
cluding benchmarks, for
Section 3 workers and
Targeted Section 3 work-
ers to be considered a re-
sponsive bidder/proposer
and eligible for a contract
award. Section 3 Require-
ments, Clause, and Pro-
gram Forms can be loc-
ated in Appendix “A” of
this document.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an  Development  Act  of
1968,  as  amended,  12
U.S.C 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low and very low-
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The parties to this con-
tract  agree  to  comply
with  HUD’s  regulations
in  24  CFR  part  135,
which  implement  Sec-
tion 3. As evidenced by
their  execution  of  this
contract,  the  parties  to
this contract certify that
they  are  under  no  con-
tractual or other impedi-
ment that would prevent
them  from  complying
with the part 135 regula-
tions.
The Contractor agrees to
send  to  each  labor  or-
ganization or represent-
ative  of  workers  with
which  the  Contractor
has a collective bargain-
ing  agreement  or  other
understanding, if any, a
notice advising the labor
organization or workers’
representative  of  the
Contractor’s  commit-
ments  under  this  Sec-
tion  3  clause,  and  will
post  copies  of  the  no-
t ice  in  conspicuous
places  at  the  work  site
where  both  employees
and applicants for train-
ing and employment po-
sitions  can  see  the  no-
tice.  The  notices  shall
describe  the  Section  3
preference,  shall  set
forth  minimum  number
and job titles subject to
hire,  availability  of  ap-
prenticeships and train-
ing positions, the quali-
fications  of  each;  and
the name and location of
person(s) taking applica-
tions for each of the pos-
itions;  and  the  anticip-
ated date the work shall
begin.
The Contractor agrees to
include  this  Section  3
clause in every sub-con-
tract  subject  to  compli-
ance with regulation sin
24  CFR  part  135,  and
agrees to take appropri-
ate  action,  as  provided
in  the  applicable  provi-
sion of the sub-contract-
or  in  this  Section  3
clause,  upon  a  finding
that  the  sub-contractor
is in violation of the reg-
ulation  in  24  CFR  part
135. The Contractor will
not  sub-contract  with
a n y  s u b - c o n t r a c t o r
where  the  Contractor
has notice or knowledge
that  the  sub-contractor
has been found in viola-
tion of the regulation in
24 CFR part 135.
The Contractor will certi-
fy  that  any  vacant  em-
ployment  positions,  in-
cluding  training  posi-
tions,  that  are  filled  (1)
after  the  Contractor  is
selected  but  before  the
contract  is  executed,
and (2) with persons oth-
er  than  those  to  whom
the  regulations  of  24
CFR part 135 require em-
ployment  opportunities
to be directed, were not
filled  to  circumvent  the
Contractor’s  obligation
under  24  CFR part  135.
Noncompl iance  wi th
HUD’s regulations in 24
CFR part 135 may result
in  sanctions,  termina-
tion of  this contract  for
default,  and  debarment
or  suspension  from fu-
ture  HUD assisted con-
tracts.
With  respect  to  work
performed  in  connec-
t ion  wi th  Sect ion  3
covered Indian Housing
Assistance, Section 7(b)
of  the  Indian  Self-De-
termination and Educa-
tion Assistance Act  (25
U.S.C.  450e)  also  ap-
plies  to  the  work  to  be
performed  under  this
contract. Section 7(b) re-
q u i r e s  t h a t  t o  t h e
greatest  extent  feasible
(i) preference and oppor-
tunities for training and
employment shall be giv-
en  to  Indians,  and  (ii)
preference is the award
of  contracts  and  sub-
contracts shall be given
to  Indian  organizations
and  Indian-owned  Eco-
n o m i c  E n t e r p r i s e s .
Parties  to  this  contract
that  are  subject  to  the
provisions of  Section 3
and section 7(b) agree to
comply with Section 3 to
the  maximum  extent
feasib le ,  but  not  in
derogation  of  compli-
ance  with  section  7(b).
Federal  Forms  to  be
Submitted  with  Bid:
The forms contained in
Appendix C, including
Section 3 forms, must be
completed, and included
with the bid submittal.
Award of Contract:
The following are condi-
tions to the award of the
contract:
i. for any bid submitted on
or after March 1, 2015,
each contractor and sub-
contractor listed on the bid
must be registered with
the Department of Industri-
al Relations pursuant to
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1725.5, subject to the lim-
ited exceptions set forth in
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1771.1(a) (regarding the
submission of a bid as au-
thorized by Business &
Professions Code Section
7029.1 or Public Contract
Code Section 10164 or
20103.5, provided the con-
tractor is registered to per-
form public work pursuant
to Section 1725.5 at the
time the contract is awar-
ded); and
ii. ii. for any contract awar-
ded on or after April 1,
2015, no contractor or
subcontractor may be
awarded this contract un-
less the contractor and
each subcontractor listed
on the bid is registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations pursu-
ant to Section 1725.5.
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Sections 1777.5, 1777.6,
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title 8
of the California Code of
Regulations, Section 200,
et seq., to ensure compli-
ance and complete under-
standing of the law regard-
ing apprentices.
Federal  Labor  Stand-
ards  Provision:
Refer to the HUD-4010
forms are located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Current  Federal  DOL
Wage  Decision:
Refer to the Federal Wage
Decision, located in Ap-
pendix “D” of this docu-
ment.
Federal EEO and Affirm-
ative  Action  Require-
ments:
Refer to the Federal Equal
Employment Opportunity
and Affirmative Action Re-
quirements located in Ap-
pendix “c” of this docu-
ment.
Contracting with Small &
Minority Firms, Women’s
Business Enterprise:
Refer to the Contracting
wi th Smal l Bus iness ,
Minority Firms, Women's
Business Enterprise, and
Labor Surplus Area Firms,
Federal Contract Provi-
sion, located in Appendix
“C” of this document.
Compliance  with  Clean
Air  and  Water  Acts:
Refer to the Compliance
with Clean Air and Water
Acts, Federal Contract
Provision, located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Conflict of Interest:
In  the  procurement  of
supplies,  equipment,
construction,  and  ser-
vice  of  sub-recipients,
the  conflict-of-interest
provision  in  24  CFR
85.36,  OMB  Circular  A-
110 and 24 CFR 570.611
shall  apply. No employ-
ee, officer or agent of the
sub-recipient shall parti-
cipate  in  the  selection,
award, or administration
of a contract supported
by  federal  funds  in  a
conflict  of  interest,  real
or apparent, would be in-
volved.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an Development  Action
of 1968, as amended, 12
U.S.C. 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall, to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low- and very-low
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The Bidder/Proposer  is
required to complete and
submit  the  Declaration
of Intent to Comply with
Section 3 Requirements
–  Required  Contract
Forms  and  Certif ica-
tions, certifying that they
intend  to  comply  with
the  requirement  of  the
Secretary  of  Labor  and
the  latest  amendments
to:  Executive  Orders
11246 and 11375, as sup-
plemented  in  Depart-
ment  of  Labor  regula-
tions  (41  CFR  chapter
60); the Copeland “Anti-
Kickback: Act (18 U.S.C.
s847)  as  supplemented
in  Department  of  Labor
regulations (29 CFR part
3);  Sections  3  of  the
Housing and Urban De-
velopment  Act  of  1968
(12  U.S.C.  s  1701  et
seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights  Act  of  1964  (42
U.S.C.  s2000);  Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community De-
velopment  Act  of  1974
(42  U.S.C.  s  5301  et
seq.); the Age Discrimin-
ation  Act  of  1975  (42
U.S.C.  s701  et  seq.).
Contractor  agrees  to
comply with the require-
ments of all other applic-
able  federal,  state  and
local  laws  and  regula-
tions.
Prospective bidders/pro-
posers  shall  carefully
read  the  information
within  this  bid  docu-
ment including the Sec-
tion  3  Provisions  for
H o u s i n g  a n d  C o m -
munity Development As-
sistance  and  Publ ic
Housing Assistance, as
amended. Proposals that
fail  to  comply  with  the
requirement of Section 3
will  be considered non-
respons ive  and  ex -
cluded from further con-
sideration.
To comply with SB 854,
beginning January 1, 2015
the following applies:
A. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be listed
on a bid proposal for pub-
lic works project (submit-
ted on or after March 1,
2015) unless registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations (DIR)
pursuant to Labor Code
section 1725.5 [with lim-
ited exceptions from this
requirement for bid pur-
poses only under Labor
Code section 1771.1(a)].
B. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be awar-
ded a contract for public
works on a public works
project awarded on or after
April 1, 2015, unless re-
gistered with the DIR.
C. The project is subject to
compliance monitoring and
enforcement by the DIR.
D. Require the prime con-
tractor to post job site no-
tices prescribed by regula-
tion (regulation not cre-
ated yet) or the City must
post the notices itself.
The Contractor shall fill
in the Department of In-
dustrial  Relations (DIR)
Contractor  Registration
Number  Form provided
in  Appendix  “C”  and
submit it with the sealed
Bid.
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Bids must be prepared on
the approved Proposal
forms or copies thereof in
conformance with the In-
structions to Bidders and
submitted in a sealed en-
velope plainly marked on
the outside as follows:
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
RFI’S/QUESTIONS: The
deadline to submit All
RFI’s/Questions shall be
s u b m i t t e d p r i o r t o
Thursday, November 09,
2023  at  1:30  pm  to  the
OpenGov  website. Late
submittal shall not be con-
sidered.
SUBSTITUTIONS: All re-
q u e s t e d “ o r e q u a l ”
products shall be submit-
ted prior to the bid date for
review and evaluation with
a subsequent determina-
tion by the City if the “or
equal” product is satisfact-
ory for consideration and
be allowed to submitted
with the bid. The  dead-
line to submit “or equal”
items shall be Thursday,
November  09,  2023  at
1:30 pm to the OpenGov
website.  Late  “or  equal
submittals shall be rejec-
ted.
COMPLETION OF WORK:
The City is scheduling the
award of contract for Janu-
ary 9, 2023 On January
10, 2023 the City will is-
sue the Notice to Contract
Award requesting the con-
tractor to submit contracts,
bonds and insurance certi-
ficates and submitted to
the City within fifteen (15)
calendar days.
In order to accommodate
weed abatement proced-
ures. The City will issue a
Weed Abatement Proced-
ure Notice to Proceed for a
duration of twenty-working
(20) days. When this is
complete, the City will is-
sue the construction No-
tice to Proceed for a dura-
tion of one hundred and
twenty (120) working days
(Monday – Friday), as stip-
ulated in the written No-
tice to Proceed issued by
the City Engineer. Failure
to complete the Work with-
in the time set forth herein
will result in the imposition
of liquidated damages for
each day of delay, in the
amount set forth in Sec-
tion 39 of the General Pro-
visions.
OBTAINING PLANS AND
SPECIFICATIONS: Plans,
Specifications, and any
project addenda are avail-
able for download the new
City platform OpenGov, ht-
tps://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, and on the city’s
website, www.cityoflap-
alma.org. All prospective
bidders are responsible for
registering on OpenGov
and checking the City’s
website for the issuance of
any project addenda prior
to the bid opening for in-
clusion as part of the bid
proposal. Due to the post-
ing of the documents on
the city website, OpenGov
will maintain a plan holder
list. For project informa-
tion, please contact the of-
fice of the City Engineer at
(714) 690-3310.
BONDS: Pursuant to the
Instructions to Bidders,
each proposal shall be ac-
companied by cash or by a
cashier's or certified check
or by a bid bond in the
amount of ten  percent
(10%) of the amount of the
bid price payable to the
City of La Palma as a
guarantee that the bidder,
if his or her proposal is ac-
cepted, will promptly ex-
ecute the contract, secure
payment of workers’ com-
pensation insurance and
furnish a satisfactory faith-
ful performance bond in
the amount of one  hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price and a
labor and material bond
in the amount of one hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price.
SUBSTITUTION OF SE-
CURITIES: The Contract-
or may substitute securit-
ies for any monies with-
held by the City to ensure
performance under the
contract in compliance
with the requirements of
Public Contract Code Sec-
tion 22300 and the "Sub-
stitution of Securities" pro-
visions of the General Pro-
visions.
WAGE RATES: As re-
quired by Section 1773 of
the California Labor Code,
the Director of the Depart-
ment of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia has determined the
general prevailing rates of
wages in the locality in
which Work is scheduled
to be performed. Copies of
the wage rate determina-
tions, entitled PREVAIL-
ING WAGE SCALE, are
mainta ined at the La
Palma City Hall, 7822
Walker Street, La Palma,
California, and are avail-
able to any interested
party upon request. The
Contractor shall post a
copy of this document at
each job site. The Con-
tractor and any subcon-
tractor under it shall pay
not less than the specified
prevailing rates of wages
to all workers employed in
the execution of the Con-
tract.
C O N T R A C T O R ' S L I -
CENSE: In accordance
with the provisions of Cali-
fornia Publ ic Contract
Code Section 3300, the
City requires that the bid-
der possess the following
c l a s s i f i c a t i o n o f
contractor’s license at the
time that the bid proposal
is submitted: Class A, or
Specialty. If the license
classif ication specif ied
hereinabove is that of a
“specialty contractor” as
defined in Section 7058 of
the California Business
and Professions Code, the
specialty contractor awar-
ded the Contract for this
Work shall itself construct
a majority of the Work, in
accordance with the provi-
sions of California Busi-
ness and Professions
Code Section 7059. Each
bidder shall clearly write or
type their contractor’s li-
cense number on the out-
side of the bidding envel-
ope.
CONTRACTORS REGIS-
TRATION: In accordance
with the provisions of
L a b o r C o d e s e c t i o n
1771.1, a contractor or
subcontractor shall not be
qualified to (a) bid on or be
listed in a bid proposal or
(b) engage in the perform-
ance of this Work, unless
currently registered and
qualified to perform the
Work pursuant to Labor
Code Section 1725.5.
COMPLIANCE MONITOR-
ING AND ENFORCE-
MENT: Contractor’s per-
formance of the Work de-
scribed in this Notice Invit-
ing Bids is subject to com-
pliance monitoring and en-
forcement by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations.
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY:
The City hereby notifies all
bidders that it will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of sex,
race, color, or national ori-
gin in consideration for an
award.
C ITY 'S RIGHTS RE-
SERVED: The City of La
Palma reserves the right to
reject any and all propos-
als or bids, including the
bid of a bidder who has
been delinquent or unfaith-
ful in any former contract
with the City of La Palma,
or to waive any irregularit-
ies or informalities in any
bids or in the bidding,
should it deem this neces-
sary for the public good.
No bidder may withdraw
his or her bid for a period
of sixty (60) days after the
date from the opening
thereof.
This  is  a  federally  as-
sisted construction con-
tract .  Federal  Labor
Standards  Provisions,
including  prevai l ing
wage  requirements  of
the Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts (DBRA) will be
enforced. In the event of
a conflict  between Fed-
eral  and  State  wage
rates,  the  higher  of  the
two will  prevail.
The Contractor’s duty to
pay  State  prevai l ing
wages can be found un-
der Labor Code Section
1770  et  seq.  and  Labor
Code Sections 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties  for  failure  to  pay
prevailing  wages  and
employee  apprentices
including forfeitures and
debarment.
The  current  Federal
Wage  Decision  is  con-
tained  herein,  in  Ap-
pendix “B”, and may be
updated  via  addendum
to this bid package with-
in ten (10) days prior to
bid opening and can be
f o u n d  a t
http://www.wdol.gov/wd
ol/scafiles/davisbacon/c
a/html.  The  applicable
Federal  Wage  Decision
will be incorporated into
the  contract.  The  State
wage rates are available
o n l i n e  a t
http://www/dir.ca.gov/DL
S R / P W D / i n d e x . h t m .
Lower State wage rates
for  work classifications
not specifically included
in the Federal Wage De-
cision  are  not  accept-
able.  The  Contractor
may  request  an  Addi-
tional Classification and
Rate  if  work  classifica-
tion cannot be located in
the  Federal  Wage  De-
cision.
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t  a n d  a l l
Bidder/Proposers  must
commit to achieving es-
tablished requirements,
including  benchmarks,
for  Section  3  workers
and Targeted Section 3
workers  to  be  con-
sidered  a  Section  3  re-
sponsive  bidder/pro-
poser and eligible for  a
contract  award.
Assignment:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of Part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Contractor's License:
When federal funds are
being used, at the time of
“Award of the Contract”,
the Prime Contractor must
have a valid California
State Contractor's License
with a classification of “A
or  Specialty” in accord-
ance with provisions of
Chapter 9, Division 111,
Sections 7000 through
7145 of the Business and
Professions Code of the
State of California and the
Prime Contractor shall
warrant that it and all sub-
contractors are properly li-
censed, which includes
each entity having a local
business license. When
federal funds are not be-
ing used, a bid by a con-
tractor who is not properly
l icensed must be con-
sidered nonresponsive,
will be rejected by the City,
and the unlicensed con-
tractor may be subject to
discipline by the state.
Contractor  Eligibil ity
Check:
Prior to awarding a con-
tract, the City will verify the
contractor's (1) status with
the California Department
of Industrial Relations at
http://www.cslb.ca.gov and
https://efiling.dir.ca.gov
and (2 ) e l i g ib i l i t y a t
http://www.dir.ca.gov/dlse/
debar.html and with the
online excluded parties list
at the federal System For
A w a r d M a n a g e m e n t
( S A M ) w e b s i t e
h t t ps : / /www.sam.gov .
Affirmative Action:
All bidders are on notice
that the City will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of reli-
gious creed, sex, race, col-
or, national origin in con-
sideration for an award.
Moreover, no contractor
receiving the award may
discriminate nor permit
others he may hire to en-
gage in, discrimination in
the employment of per-
sons because of their
race, religious creed, col-
or, or national origin, an-
cestry, physical disability,
mental disability, medical
condition, genetic informa-
tion, marital status, sex,
gender, gender identity,
gender expression, age,
sexual orientation, or milit-
ary or veteran status, ex-
cept as provided in Gov-
ernment Code Sect ion
12940.
DATED: October 18, 2023
CITY OF LA PALMA,
CALIFORNIA
By:__________________
___________
Andy Ramirez
Public Works and Com-
munity Services Director

News Enterprise
10/18/2023-135860
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CITY OF LA PALMA
NOTICE INVITING BIDS
VARIOUS MEDIAN IS-

LANDS PROJECT
(CITY PROJECT NO. ST-

371)
NOTICE INVITING BIDS:
Sealed proposals will be
received online via the
Ci ty ’ s e -Procurement
P o r t a l ( “ P o r t a l ” ) a t
https://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, office of the City En-
gineer, Community Ser-
vices Office, La Palma,
California, until 1:30  PM
on Thursday, November
30, 2023 for furnishing of
all labor, materials and
equipment for VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No. ST-371 (the “Project”).
The  Bids  shall  be  sub-
mitted to the City Engin-
eer  through  the  Open-
Gov.com  platform. All
prospective bidders are re-
sponsible for registering
on OpenGov and check-
ing the City’s website for
the issuance of any project
addenda prior to the bid
opening for inclusion as
part of the bid proposal.
Due to the posting of the
documents on the city
website, OpenGov wil l
maintain a plan holder list.
For project information,
please contact the office of
the City Engineer at (714)
690-3310. Sealed  bids
will  NOT  be  accepted.
The  BIDS  for  VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No.  ST-371,  SHALL  BE
SUBMITTED  THROUGH
OpenGov.
D E S C R I P T I O N O F
WORK: The work in-
cludes rehabilitation of the
La Palma Avenue Median
Islands from the west city
limits to the east city limits;
Walker Avenue Median Is-
lands from Orangethorpe
Avenue southerly; and
Moody Street from Cres-
cent Ave to Houston Ave
including the removal of
existing landscaping/irriga-
tion, tree removals, hard-
scape removals and re-
placement, installation of
new drip irrigation system,
planting of new trees along
w i t h n e w
landscaping/hardscaping
in the medians islands.
Also, included are new
median islands on Moody
Street from Malaga Aven-
ue to La Luna Avenue with
complete irrigation and
landscaping per the con-
tract plans and specifica-
tions.
This project is NOT sub-
ject to a project labor, sta-
bilization, collective bar-
gaining or community work
force agreements
The City received Feder-
al Funding through HUD
for  this  project.  There-
fore,  Federal  Davis  Ba-
con  wage  rates  are  ap-
pl ied  to  the  project.
However,  If  the  State
Prevailing  Wages  are
higher than the Federal
Wage Rates,  the higher
are to be applied the that
specific classification.
A  MANDATORY  AND
SECTIO N  3  PRE-BID
MEETING,  will  be  held
on Tuesday October 24,
2023  at  2:30  pm  at  the
City  of  Palma  Com-
munity Services Offices,
7821  Walker  Street,  La
Palma, CA 90623. In or-
der to receive considera-
tion for the Section 3 bid
preference,  a  bidder
must complete, sign and
submit  the  following
forms with their bid pro-
posal: 1) Section 3 Busi-
ness Certification Form,
and (b) Section 3 Resid-
ent Certification form(s).
A  reasonable  bid  must
be with the Zone of Con-
sideration at the time of
bid  evaluation. All con-
tractors are required to
have a representative at-
tend and sign in at the pre-
bid meeting. Failure to
comply with this attend-
ance and sign in require-
ments will result in the
Contactor’s proposal be-
ing found non-responsive
to the required proced-
ures.
Prevailing  Wage  State-
ment:
This contract will be fun-
ded in whole or in part with
Federal housing and com-
munity development funds.
Federal Labor Standard
Provisions, including pre-
vailing wage requirements
of Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts will be enforced.
A copy of the Federal
Wage Decision applicable
to this project is included
in the Bid Documents in
Appendix “B”. This project
is a public work in the
State of California, funded
in whole or in part with
public funds. Therefore,
the higher of the two ap-
plicable prevailing wage
rates federal or state, will
be enforced. The Contract-
or’s duty to pay State pre-
vai l ing wages can be
found under Labor Code
Section 1770 et seq. Labor
Code Section 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties for failure to pay pre-
vailing wages and to em-
ploy apprentices, includ-
ing forfeitures and de-
barment. State Wage De-
cision is on file at the City
Clerk’s office and is also
a v a i l a b l e O n l i n e a t
h t tp : / /d i r . ca .gov /d is r / .
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Section 1777.5, 1777.6
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title
8, California Administra-
tion Code, Section 200 et
seq. to ensure compliance
and complete understand-
ing of the law regarding
apprentices.
Fair  Employment  Prac-
tices/Equal Opportunity
Acts:
In the performance of this
Agreement, Contractor
shall comply with all ap-
plicable provisions of the
California Fair Employ-
ment Practices Act (Cali-
fornia Government Code
Section §§ C – 32 B-3
12940 et seq.), the applic-
able equal employment
provisions of the Civi l
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000e et seq.),
and the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990 (42
U.S.C. §§ 12101, et seq.).
Labor  Standards  and
Civil  Rights:
Contractor agrees to com-
ply with the requirements
of the Secretary of Labor
and the latest amend-
ments to: Executive Or-
ders 11246 and 11375, as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(41 C.F.R. chapter 60); the
Copeland “Anti-Kickback”
Act (18 U.S.C. § 847) as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(29 C.F.R. part 3); Section
3 of the Housing and Urb-
an Development Act of
1968 (12 U.S.C. §§ 1701
et seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000); Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community Devel-
opment Act of 1974 (42
U.S.C. §§ 5301 et seq.);
the Age Discrimination Act
of 1975 (42 U.S.C. §§
6101 et seq.); and Section
504 of the Rehabilitation
Act of 1973 (29 U.S.C. §§
701 et seq.). Contractor
agrees to comply with the
requirements of all other
applicable federal, State
and local laws and regula-
tions.
State Labor Standards &
Wage Requirements:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor
and all subcontractors
agree to follow the State
Labor standards. State
Labor standards provi-
sions, including prevailing
wage requirements, will be
enforced such that the
general rate of per diem
wages (prevailing wage)
shall be paid for each
craft, classification, or type
of worker needed to ex-
ecute the contract to all
workers employed in the
execution of the contract.
All contractors and sub-
contractors must furnish
electronic certified payroll
records directly to the
Labor Commissioner (aka
Division of Labor Stand-
ards Enforcement) as fur-
ther described in Article
VIII of the Agreement. The
State General Prevailing
Wage Determination is as
established by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations (available at
http://www.dir.ca.gov/DLS
R/PWD/index.htm). The
prevailing rate of per diem
wages are on file at the
City.
Section 3 Statement:
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t a n d a l l
Bidders/Proposers must
commit to achieving estab-
lished requirements, in-
cluding benchmarks, for
Section 3 workers and
Targeted Section 3 work-
ers to be considered a re-
sponsive bidder/proposer
and eligible for a contract
award. Section 3 Require-
ments, Clause, and Pro-
gram Forms can be loc-
ated in Appendix “A” of
this document.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an  Development  Act  of
1968,  as  amended,  12
U.S.C 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low and very low-
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The parties to this con-
tract  agree  to  comply
with  HUD’s  regulations
in  24  CFR  part  135,
which  implement  Sec-
tion 3. As evidenced by
their  execution  of  this
contract,  the  parties  to
this contract certify that
they  are  under  no  con-
tractual or other impedi-
ment that would prevent
them  from  complying
with the part 135 regula-
tions.
The Contractor agrees to
send  to  each  labor  or-
ganization or represent-
ative  of  workers  with
which  the  Contractor
has a collective bargain-
ing  agreement  or  other
understanding, if any, a
notice advising the labor
organization or workers’
representative  of  the
Contractor’s  commit-
ments  under  this  Sec-
tion  3  clause,  and  will
post  copies  of  the  no-
t ice  in  conspicuous
places  at  the  work  site
where  both  employees
and applicants for train-
ing and employment po-
sitions  can  see  the  no-
tice.  The  notices  shall
describe  the  Section  3
preference,  shall  set
forth  minimum  number
and job titles subject to
hire,  availability  of  ap-
prenticeships and train-
ing positions, the quali-
fications  of  each;  and
the name and location of
person(s) taking applica-
tions for each of the pos-
itions;  and  the  anticip-
ated date the work shall
begin.
The Contractor agrees to
include  this  Section  3
clause in every sub-con-
tract  subject  to  compli-
ance with regulation sin
24  CFR  part  135,  and
agrees to take appropri-
ate  action,  as  provided
in  the  applicable  provi-
sion of the sub-contract-
or  in  this  Section  3
clause,  upon  a  finding
that  the  sub-contractor
is in violation of the reg-
ulation  in  24  CFR  part
135. The Contractor will
not  sub-contract  with
a n y  s u b - c o n t r a c t o r
where  the  Contractor
has notice or knowledge
that  the  sub-contractor
has been found in viola-
tion of the regulation in
24 CFR part 135.
The Contractor will certi-
fy  that  any  vacant  em-
ployment  positions,  in-
cluding  training  posi-
tions,  that  are  filled  (1)
after  the  Contractor  is
selected  but  before  the
contract  is  executed,
and (2) with persons oth-
er  than  those  to  whom
the  regulations  of  24
CFR part 135 require em-
ployment  opportunities
to be directed, were not
filled  to  circumvent  the
Contractor’s  obligation
under  24  CFR part  135.
Noncompl iance  wi th
HUD’s regulations in 24
CFR part 135 may result
in  sanctions,  termina-
tion of  this contract  for
default,  and  debarment
or  suspension  from fu-
ture  HUD assisted con-
tracts.
With  respect  to  work
performed  in  connec-
t ion  wi th  Sect ion  3
covered Indian Housing
Assistance, Section 7(b)
of  the  Indian  Self-De-
termination and Educa-
tion Assistance Act  (25
U.S.C.  450e)  also  ap-
plies  to  the  work  to  be
performed  under  this
contract. Section 7(b) re-
q u i r e s  t h a t  t o  t h e
greatest  extent  feasible
(i) preference and oppor-
tunities for training and
employment shall be giv-
en  to  Indians,  and  (ii)
preference is the award
of  contracts  and  sub-
contracts shall be given
to  Indian  organizations
and  Indian-owned  Eco-
n o m i c  E n t e r p r i s e s .
Parties  to  this  contract
that  are  subject  to  the
provisions of  Section 3
and section 7(b) agree to
comply with Section 3 to
the  maximum  extent
feasib le ,  but  not  in
derogation  of  compli-
ance  with  section  7(b).
Federal  Forms  to  be
Submitted  with  Bid:
The forms contained in
Appendix C, including
Section 3 forms, must be
completed, and included
with the bid submittal.
Award of Contract:
The following are condi-
tions to the award of the
contract:
i. for any bid submitted on
or after March 1, 2015,
each contractor and sub-
contractor listed on the bid
must be registered with
the Department of Industri-
al Relations pursuant to
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1725.5, subject to the lim-
ited exceptions set forth in
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1771.1(a) (regarding the
submission of a bid as au-
thorized by Business &
Professions Code Section
7029.1 or Public Contract
Code Section 10164 or
20103.5, provided the con-
tractor is registered to per-
form public work pursuant
to Section 1725.5 at the
time the contract is awar-
ded); and
ii. ii. for any contract awar-
ded on or after April 1,
2015, no contractor or
subcontractor may be
awarded this contract un-
less the contractor and
each subcontractor listed
on the bid is registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations pursu-
ant to Section 1725.5.
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Sections 1777.5, 1777.6,
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title 8
of the California Code of
Regulations, Section 200,
et seq., to ensure compli-
ance and complete under-
standing of the law regard-
ing apprentices.
Federal  Labor  Stand-
ards  Provision:
Refer to the HUD-4010
forms are located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Current  Federal  DOL
Wage  Decision:
Refer to the Federal Wage
Decision, located in Ap-
pendix “D” of this docu-
ment.
Federal EEO and Affirm-
ative  Action  Require-
ments:
Refer to the Federal Equal
Employment Opportunity
and Affirmative Action Re-
quirements located in Ap-
pendix “c” of this docu-
ment.
Contracting with Small &
Minority Firms, Women’s
Business Enterprise:
Refer to the Contracting
wi th Smal l Bus iness ,
Minority Firms, Women's
Business Enterprise, and
Labor Surplus Area Firms,
Federal Contract Provi-
sion, located in Appendix
“C” of this document.
Compliance  with  Clean
Air  and  Water  Acts:
Refer to the Compliance
with Clean Air and Water
Acts, Federal Contract
Provision, located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Conflict of Interest:
In  the  procurement  of
supplies,  equipment,
construction,  and  ser-
vice  of  sub-recipients,
the  conflict-of-interest
provision  in  24  CFR
85.36,  OMB  Circular  A-
110 and 24 CFR 570.611
shall  apply. No employ-
ee, officer or agent of the
sub-recipient shall parti-
cipate  in  the  selection,
award, or administration
of a contract supported
by  federal  funds  in  a
conflict  of  interest,  real
or apparent, would be in-
volved.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an Development  Action
of 1968, as amended, 12
U.S.C. 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall, to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low- and very-low
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The Bidder/Proposer  is
required to complete and
submit  the  Declaration
of Intent to Comply with
Section 3 Requirements
–  Required  Contract
Forms  and  Certif ica-
tions, certifying that they
intend  to  comply  with
the  requirement  of  the
Secretary  of  Labor  and
the  latest  amendments
to:  Executive  Orders
11246 and 11375, as sup-
plemented  in  Depart-
ment  of  Labor  regula-
tions  (41  CFR  chapter
60); the Copeland “Anti-
Kickback: Act (18 U.S.C.
s847)  as  supplemented
in  Department  of  Labor
regulations (29 CFR part
3);  Sections  3  of  the
Housing and Urban De-
velopment  Act  of  1968
(12  U.S.C.  s  1701  et
seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights  Act  of  1964  (42
U.S.C.  s2000);  Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community De-
velopment  Act  of  1974
(42  U.S.C.  s  5301  et
seq.); the Age Discrimin-
ation  Act  of  1975  (42
U.S.C.  s701  et  seq.).
Contractor  agrees  to
comply with the require-
ments of all other applic-
able  federal,  state  and
local  laws  and  regula-
tions.
Prospective bidders/pro-
posers  shall  carefully
read  the  information
within  this  bid  docu-
ment including the Sec-
tion  3  Provisions  for
H o u s i n g  a n d  C o m -
munity Development As-
sistance  and  Publ ic
Housing Assistance, as
amended. Proposals that
fail  to  comply  with  the
requirement of Section 3
will  be considered non-
respons ive  and  ex -
cluded from further con-
sideration.
To comply with SB 854,
beginning January 1, 2015
the following applies:
A. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be listed
on a bid proposal for pub-
lic works project (submit-
ted on or after March 1,
2015) unless registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations (DIR)
pursuant to Labor Code
section 1725.5 [with lim-
ited exceptions from this
requirement for bid pur-
poses only under Labor
Code section 1771.1(a)].
B. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be awar-
ded a contract for public
works on a public works
project awarded on or after
April 1, 2015, unless re-
gistered with the DIR.
C. The project is subject to
compliance monitoring and
enforcement by the DIR.
D. Require the prime con-
tractor to post job site no-
tices prescribed by regula-
tion (regulation not cre-
ated yet) or the City must
post the notices itself.
The Contractor shall fill
in the Department of In-
dustrial  Relations (DIR)
Contractor  Registration
Number  Form provided
in  Appendix  “C”  and
submit it with the sealed
Bid.
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Bids must be prepared on
the approved Proposal
forms or copies thereof in
conformance with the In-
structions to Bidders and
submitted in a sealed en-
velope plainly marked on
the outside as follows:
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
RFI’S/QUESTIONS: The
deadline to submit All
RFI’s/Questions shall be
s u b m i t t e d p r i o r t o
Thursday, November 09,
2023  at  1:30  pm  to  the
OpenGov  website. Late
submittal shall not be con-
sidered.
SUBSTITUTIONS: All re-
q u e s t e d “ o r e q u a l ”
products shall be submit-
ted prior to the bid date for
review and evaluation with
a subsequent determina-
tion by the City if the “or
equal” product is satisfact-
ory for consideration and
be allowed to submitted
with the bid. The  dead-
line to submit “or equal”
items shall be Thursday,
November  09,  2023  at
1:30 pm to the OpenGov
website.  Late  “or  equal
submittals shall be rejec-
ted.
COMPLETION OF WORK:
The City is scheduling the
award of contract for Janu-
ary 9, 2023 On January
10, 2023 the City will is-
sue the Notice to Contract
Award requesting the con-
tractor to submit contracts,
bonds and insurance certi-
ficates and submitted to
the City within fifteen (15)
calendar days.
In order to accommodate
weed abatement proced-
ures. The City will issue a
Weed Abatement Proced-
ure Notice to Proceed for a
duration of twenty-working
(20) days. When this is
complete, the City will is-
sue the construction No-
tice to Proceed for a dura-
tion of one hundred and
twenty (120) working days
(Monday – Friday), as stip-
ulated in the written No-
tice to Proceed issued by
the City Engineer. Failure
to complete the Work with-
in the time set forth herein
will result in the imposition
of liquidated damages for
each day of delay, in the
amount set forth in Sec-
tion 39 of the General Pro-
visions.
OBTAINING PLANS AND
SPECIFICATIONS: Plans,
Specifications, and any
project addenda are avail-
able for download the new
City platform OpenGov, ht-
tps://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, and on the city’s
website, www.cityoflap-
alma.org. All prospective
bidders are responsible for
registering on OpenGov
and checking the City’s
website for the issuance of
any project addenda prior
to the bid opening for in-
clusion as part of the bid
proposal. Due to the post-
ing of the documents on
the city website, OpenGov
will maintain a plan holder
list. For project informa-
tion, please contact the of-
fice of the City Engineer at
(714) 690-3310.
BONDS: Pursuant to the
Instructions to Bidders,
each proposal shall be ac-
companied by cash or by a
cashier's or certified check
or by a bid bond in the
amount of ten  percent
(10%) of the amount of the
bid price payable to the
City of La Palma as a
guarantee that the bidder,
if his or her proposal is ac-
cepted, will promptly ex-
ecute the contract, secure
payment of workers’ com-
pensation insurance and
furnish a satisfactory faith-
ful performance bond in
the amount of one  hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price and a
labor and material bond
in the amount of one hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price.
SUBSTITUTION OF SE-
CURITIES: The Contract-
or may substitute securit-
ies for any monies with-
held by the City to ensure
performance under the
contract in compliance
with the requirements of
Public Contract Code Sec-
tion 22300 and the "Sub-
stitution of Securities" pro-
visions of the General Pro-
visions.
WAGE RATES: As re-
quired by Section 1773 of
the California Labor Code,
the Director of the Depart-
ment of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia has determined the
general prevailing rates of
wages in the locality in
which Work is scheduled
to be performed. Copies of
the wage rate determina-
tions, entitled PREVAIL-
ING WAGE SCALE, are
mainta ined at the La
Palma City Hall, 7822
Walker Street, La Palma,
California, and are avail-
able to any interested
party upon request. The
Contractor shall post a
copy of this document at
each job site. The Con-
tractor and any subcon-
tractor under it shall pay
not less than the specified
prevailing rates of wages
to all workers employed in
the execution of the Con-
tract.
C O N T R A C T O R ' S L I -
CENSE: In accordance
with the provisions of Cali-
fornia Publ ic Contract
Code Section 3300, the
City requires that the bid-
der possess the following
c l a s s i f i c a t i o n o f
contractor’s license at the
time that the bid proposal
is submitted: Class A, or
Specialty. If the license
classif ication specif ied
hereinabove is that of a
“specialty contractor” as
defined in Section 7058 of
the California Business
and Professions Code, the
specialty contractor awar-
ded the Contract for this
Work shall itself construct
a majority of the Work, in
accordance with the provi-
sions of California Busi-
ness and Professions
Code Section 7059. Each
bidder shall clearly write or
type their contractor’s li-
cense number on the out-
side of the bidding envel-
ope.
CONTRACTORS REGIS-
TRATION: In accordance
with the provisions of
L a b o r C o d e s e c t i o n
1771.1, a contractor or
subcontractor shall not be
qualified to (a) bid on or be
listed in a bid proposal or
(b) engage in the perform-
ance of this Work, unless
currently registered and
qualified to perform the
Work pursuant to Labor
Code Section 1725.5.
COMPLIANCE MONITOR-
ING AND ENFORCE-
MENT: Contractor’s per-
formance of the Work de-
scribed in this Notice Invit-
ing Bids is subject to com-
pliance monitoring and en-
forcement by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations.
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY:
The City hereby notifies all
bidders that it will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of sex,
race, color, or national ori-
gin in consideration for an
award.
C ITY 'S RIGHTS RE-
SERVED: The City of La
Palma reserves the right to
reject any and all propos-
als or bids, including the
bid of a bidder who has
been delinquent or unfaith-
ful in any former contract
with the City of La Palma,
or to waive any irregularit-
ies or informalities in any
bids or in the bidding,
should it deem this neces-
sary for the public good.
No bidder may withdraw
his or her bid for a period
of sixty (60) days after the
date from the opening
thereof.
This  is  a  federally  as-
sisted construction con-
tract .  Federal  Labor
Standards  Provisions,
including  prevai l ing
wage  requirements  of
the Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts (DBRA) will be
enforced. In the event of
a conflict  between Fed-
eral  and  State  wage
rates,  the  higher  of  the
two will  prevail.
The Contractor’s duty to
pay  State  prevai l ing
wages can be found un-
der Labor Code Section
1770  et  seq.  and  Labor
Code Sections 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties  for  failure  to  pay
prevailing  wages  and
employee  apprentices
including forfeitures and
debarment.
The  current  Federal
Wage  Decision  is  con-
tained  herein,  in  Ap-
pendix “B”, and may be
updated  via  addendum
to this bid package with-
in ten (10) days prior to
bid opening and can be
f o u n d  a t
http://www.wdol.gov/wd
ol/scafiles/davisbacon/c
a/html.  The  applicable
Federal  Wage  Decision
will be incorporated into
the  contract.  The  State
wage rates are available
o n l i n e  a t
http://www/dir.ca.gov/DL
S R / P W D / i n d e x . h t m .
Lower State wage rates
for  work classifications
not specifically included
in the Federal Wage De-
cision  are  not  accept-
able.  The  Contractor
may  request  an  Addi-
tional Classification and
Rate  if  work  classifica-
tion cannot be located in
the  Federal  Wage  De-
cision.
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t  a n d  a l l
Bidder/Proposers  must
commit to achieving es-
tablished requirements,
including  benchmarks,
for  Section  3  workers
and Targeted Section 3
workers  to  be  con-
sidered  a  Section  3  re-
sponsive  bidder/pro-
poser and eligible for  a
contract  award.
Assignment:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of Part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Contractor's License:
When federal funds are
being used, at the time of
“Award of the Contract”,
the Prime Contractor must
have a valid California
State Contractor's License
with a classification of “A
or  Specialty” in accord-
ance with provisions of
Chapter 9, Division 111,
Sections 7000 through
7145 of the Business and
Professions Code of the
State of California and the
Prime Contractor shall
warrant that it and all sub-
contractors are properly li-
censed, which includes
each entity having a local
business license. When
federal funds are not be-
ing used, a bid by a con-
tractor who is not properly
l icensed must be con-
sidered nonresponsive,
will be rejected by the City,
and the unlicensed con-
tractor may be subject to
discipline by the state.
Contractor  Eligibil ity
Check:
Prior to awarding a con-
tract, the City will verify the
contractor's (1) status with
the California Department
of Industrial Relations at
http://www.cslb.ca.gov and
https://efiling.dir.ca.gov
and (2 ) e l i g ib i l i t y a t
http://www.dir.ca.gov/dlse/
debar.html and with the
online excluded parties list
at the federal System For
A w a r d M a n a g e m e n t
( S A M ) w e b s i t e
h t t ps : / /www.sam.gov .
Affirmative Action:
All bidders are on notice
that the City will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of reli-
gious creed, sex, race, col-
or, national origin in con-
sideration for an award.
Moreover, no contractor
receiving the award may
discriminate nor permit
others he may hire to en-
gage in, discrimination in
the employment of per-
sons because of their
race, religious creed, col-
or, or national origin, an-
cestry, physical disability,
mental disability, medical
condition, genetic informa-
tion, marital status, sex,
gender, gender identity,
gender expression, age,
sexual orientation, or milit-
ary or veteran status, ex-
cept as provided in Gov-
ernment Code Section
12940.
DATED: October 18, 2023
CITY OF LA PALMA,
CALIFORNIA
By:__________________
___________
Andy Ramirez
Public Works and Com-
munity Services Director

News Enterprise
10/18/2023-135860
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CITY OF LA PALMA
NOTICE INVITING BIDS
VARIOUS MEDIAN IS-

LANDS PROJECT
(CITY PROJECT NO. ST-

371)
NOTICE INVITING BIDS:
Sealed proposals will be
received online via the
Ci ty ’ s e -Procurement
P o r t a l ( “ P o r t a l ” ) a t
https://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, office of the City En-
gineer, Community Ser-
vices Office, La Palma,
California, until 1:30  PM
on Thursday, November
30, 2023 for furnishing of
all labor, materials and
equipment for VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No. ST-371 (the “Project”).
The  Bids  shall  be  sub-
mitted to the City Engin-
eer  through  the  Open-
Gov.com  platform. All
prospective bidders are re-
sponsible for registering
on OpenGov and check-
ing the City’s website for
the issuance of any project
addenda prior to the bid
opening for inclusion as
part of the bid proposal.
Due to the posting of the
documents on the city
website, OpenGov wil l
maintain a plan holder list.
For project information,
please contact the office of
the City Engineer at (714)
690-3310. Sealed  bids
will  NOT  be  accepted.
The  BIDS  for  VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No.  ST-371,  SHALL  BE
SUBMITTED  THROUGH
OpenGov.
D E S C R I P T I O N O F
WORK: The work in-
cludes rehabilitation of the
La Palma Avenue Median
Islands from the west city
limits to the east city limits;
Walker Avenue Median Is-
lands from Orangethorpe
Avenue southerly; and
Moody Street from Cres-
cent Ave to Houston Ave
including the removal of
existing landscaping/irriga-
tion, tree removals, hard-
scape removals and re-
placement, installation of
new drip irrigation system,
planting of new trees along
w i t h n e w
landscaping/hardscaping
in the medians islands.
Also, included are new
median islands on Moody
Street from Malaga Aven-
ue to La Luna Avenue with
complete irrigation and
landscaping per the con-
tract plans and specifica-
tions.
This project is NOT sub-
ject to a project labor, sta-
bilization, collective bar-
gaining or community work
force agreements
The City received Feder-
al Funding through HUD
for  this  project.  There-
fore,  Federal  Davis  Ba-
con  wage  rates  are  ap-
pl ied  to  the  project.
However,  If  the  State
Prevailing  Wages  are
higher than the Federal
Wage Rates,  the higher
are to be applied the that
specific classification.
A  MANDATORY  AND
SECTIO N  3  PRE-BID
MEETING,  will  be  held
on Tuesday October 24,
2023  at  2:30  pm  at  the
City  of  Palma  Com-
munity Services Offices,
7821  Walker  Street,  La
Palma, CA 90623. In or-
der to receive considera-
tion for the Section 3 bid
preference,  a  bidder
must complete, sign and
submit  the  following
forms with their bid pro-
posal: 1) Section 3 Busi-
ness Certification Form,
and (b) Section 3 Resid-
ent Certification form(s).
A  reasonable  bid  must
be with the Zone of Con-
sideration at the time of
bid  evaluation. All con-
tractors are required to
have a representative at-
tend and sign in at the pre-
bid meeting. Failure to
comply with this attend-
ance and sign in require-
ments will result in the
Contactor’s proposal be-
ing found non-responsive
to the required proced-
ures.
Prevailing  Wage  State-
ment:
This contract will be fun-
ded in whole or in part with
Federal housing and com-
munity development funds.
Federal Labor Standard
Provisions, including pre-
vailing wage requirements
of Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts will be enforced.
A copy of the Federal
Wage Decision applicable
to this project is included
in the Bid Documents in
Appendix “B”. This project
is a public work in the
State of California, funded
in whole or in part with
public funds. Therefore,
the higher of the two ap-
plicable prevailing wage
rates federal or state, will
be enforced. The Contract-
or’s duty to pay State pre-
vai l ing wages can be
found under Labor Code
Section 1770 et seq. Labor
Code Section 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties for failure to pay pre-
vailing wages and to em-
ploy apprentices, includ-
ing forfeitures and de-
barment. State Wage De-
cision is on file at the City
Clerk’s office and is also
a v a i l a b l e O n l i n e a t
h t tp : / /d i r . ca .gov /d is r / .
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Section 1777.5, 1777.6
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title
8, California Administra-
tion Code, Section 200 et
seq. to ensure compliance
and complete understand-
ing of the law regarding
apprentices.
Fair  Employment  Prac-
tices/Equal Opportunity
Acts:
In the performance of this
Agreement, Contractor
shall comply with all ap-
plicable provisions of the
California Fair Employ-
ment Practices Act (Cali-
fornia Government Code
Section §§ C – 32 B-3
12940 et seq.), the applic-
able equal employment
provisions of the Civi l
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000e et seq.),
and the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990 (42
U.S.C. §§ 12101, et seq.).
Labor  Standards  and
Civil  Rights:
Contractor agrees to com-
ply with the requirements
of the Secretary of Labor
and the latest amend-
ments to: Executive Or-
ders 11246 and 11375, as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(41 C.F.R. chapter 60); the
Copeland “Anti-Kickback”
Act (18 U.S.C. § 847) as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(29 C.F.R. part 3); Section
3 of the Housing and Urb-
an Development Act of
1968 (12 U.S.C. §§ 1701
et seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000); Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community Devel-
opment Act of 1974 (42
U.S.C. §§ 5301 et seq.);
the Age Discrimination Act
of 1975 (42 U.S.C. §§
6101 et seq.); and Section
504 of the Rehabilitation
Act of 1973 (29 U.S.C. §§
701 et seq.). Contractor
agrees to comply with the
requirements of all other
applicable federal, State
and local laws and regula-
tions.
State Labor Standards &
Wage Requirements:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor
and all subcontractors
agree to follow the State
Labor standards. State
Labor standards provi-
sions, including prevailing
wage requirements, will be
enforced such that the
general rate of per diem
wages (prevailing wage)
shall be paid for each
craft, classification, or type
of worker needed to ex-
ecute the contract to all
workers employed in the
execution of the contract.
All contractors and sub-
contractors must furnish
electronic certified payroll
records directly to the
Labor Commissioner (aka
Division of Labor Stand-
ards Enforcement) as fur-
ther described in Article
VIII of the Agreement. The
State General Prevailing
Wage Determination is as
established by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations (available at
http://www.dir.ca.gov/DLS
R/PWD/index.htm). The
prevailing rate of per diem
wages are on file at the
City.
Section 3 Statement:
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t a n d a l l
Bidders/Proposers must
commit to achieving estab-
lished requirements, in-
cluding benchmarks, for
Section 3 workers and
Targeted Section 3 work-
ers to be considered a re-
sponsive bidder/proposer
and eligible for a contract
award. Section 3 Require-
ments, Clause, and Pro-
gram Forms can be loc-
ated in Appendix “A” of
this document.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an  Development  Act  of
1968,  as  amended,  12
U.S.C 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low and very low-
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The parties to this con-
tract  agree  to  comply
with  HUD’s  regulations
in  24  CFR  part  135,
which  implement  Sec-
tion 3. As evidenced by
their  execution  of  this
contract,  the  parties  to
this contract certify that
they  are  under  no  con-
tractual or other impedi-
ment that would prevent
them  from  complying
with the part 135 regula-
tions.
The Contractor agrees to
send  to  each  labor  or-
ganization or represent-
ative  of  workers  with
which  the  Contractor
has a collective bargain-
ing  agreement  or  other
understanding, if any, a
notice advising the labor
organization or workers’
representative  of  the
Contractor’s  commit-
ments  under  this  Sec-
tion  3  clause,  and  will
post  copies  of  the  no-
t ice  in  conspicuous
places  at  the  work  site
where  both  employees
and applicants for train-
ing and employment po-
sitions  can  see  the  no-
tice.  The  notices  shall
describe  the  Section  3
preference,  shall  set
forth  minimum  number
and job titles subject to
hire,  availability  of  ap-
prenticeships and train-
ing positions, the quali-
fications  of  each;  and
the name and location of
person(s) taking applica-
tions for each of the pos-
itions;  and  the  anticip-
ated date the work shall
begin.
The Contractor agrees to
include  this  Section  3
clause in every sub-con-
tract  subject  to  compli-
ance with regulation sin
24  CFR  part  135,  and
agrees to take appropri-
ate  action,  as  provided
in  the  applicable  provi-
sion of the sub-contract-
or  in  this  Section  3
clause,  upon  a  finding
that  the  sub-contractor
is in violation of the reg-
ulation  in  24  CFR  part
135. The Contractor will
not  sub-contract  with
a n y  s u b - c o n t r a c t o r
where  the  Contractor
has notice or knowledge
that  the  sub-contractor
has been found in viola-
tion of the regulation in
24 CFR part 135.
The Contractor will certi-
fy  that  any  vacant  em-
ployment  positions,  in-
cluding  training  posi-
tions,  that  are  filled  (1)
after  the  Contractor  is
selected  but  before  the
contract  is  executed,
and (2) with persons oth-
er  than  those  to  whom
the  regulations  of  24
CFR part 135 require em-
ployment  opportunities
to be directed, were not
filled  to  circumvent  the
Contractor’s  obligation
under  24  CFR part  135.
Noncompl iance  wi th
HUD’s regulations in 24
CFR part 135 may result
in  sanctions,  termina-
tion of  this contract  for
default,  and  debarment
or  suspension  from fu-
ture  HUD assisted con-
tracts.
With  respect  to  work
performed  in  connec-
t ion  wi th  Sect ion  3
covered Indian Housing
Assistance, Section 7(b)
of  the  Indian  Self-De-
termination and Educa-
tion Assistance Act  (25
U.S.C.  450e)  also  ap-
plies  to  the  work  to  be
performed  under  this
contract. Section 7(b) re-
q u i r e s  t h a t  t o  t h e
greatest  extent  feasible
(i) preference and oppor-
tunities for training and
employment shall be giv-
en  to  Indians,  and  (ii)
preference is the award
of  contracts  and  sub-
contracts shall be given
to  Indian  organizations
and  Indian-owned  Eco-
n o m i c  E n t e r p r i s e s .
Parties  to  this  contract
that  are  subject  to  the
provisions of  Section 3
and section 7(b) agree to
comply with Section 3 to
the  maximum  extent
feasib le ,  but  not  in
derogation  of  compli-
ance  with  section  7(b).
Federal  Forms  to  be
Submitted  with  Bid:
The forms contained in
Appendix C, including
Section 3 forms, must be
completed, and included
with the bid submittal.
Award of Contract:
The following are condi-
tions to the award of the
contract:
i. for any bid submitted on
or after March 1, 2015,
each contractor and sub-
contractor listed on the bid
must be registered with
the Department of Industri-
al Relations pursuant to
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1725.5, subject to the lim-
ited exceptions set forth in
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1771.1(a) (regarding the
submission of a bid as au-
thorized by Business &
Professions Code Section
7029.1 or Public Contract
Code Section 10164 or
20103.5, provided the con-
tractor is registered to per-
form public work pursuant
to Section 1725.5 at the
time the contract is awar-
ded); and
ii. ii. for any contract awar-
ded on or after April 1,
2015, no contractor or
subcontractor may be
awarded this contract un-
less the contractor and
each subcontractor listed
on the bid is registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations pursu-
ant to Section 1725.5.
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Sections 1777.5, 1777.6,
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title 8
of the California Code of
Regulations, Section 200,
et seq., to ensure compli-
ance and complete under-
standing of the law regard-
ing apprentices.
Federal  Labor  Stand-
ards  Provision:
Refer to the HUD-4010
forms are located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Current  Federal  DOL
Wage  Decision:
Refer to the Federal Wage
Decision, located in Ap-
pendix “D” of this docu-
ment.
Federal EEO and Affirm-
ative  Action  Require-
ments:
Refer to the Federal Equal
Employment Opportunity
and Affirmative Action Re-
quirements located in Ap-
pendix “c” of this docu-
ment.
Contracting with Small &
Minority Firms, Women’s
Business Enterprise:
Refer to the Contracting
wi th Smal l Bus iness ,
Minority Firms, Women's
Business Enterprise, and
Labor Surplus Area Firms,
Federal Contract Provi-
sion, located in Appendix
“C” of this document.
Compliance  with  Clean
Air  and  Water  Acts:
Refer to the Compliance
with Clean Air and Water
Acts, Federal Contract
Provision, located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Conflict of Interest:
In  the  procurement  of
supplies,  equipment,
construction,  and  ser-
vice  of  sub-recipients,
the  conflict-of-interest
provision  in  24  CFR
85.36,  OMB  Circular  A-
110 and 24 CFR 570.611
shall  apply. No employ-
ee, officer or agent of the
sub-recipient shall parti-
cipate  in  the  selection,
award, or administration
of a contract supported
by  federal  funds  in  a
conflict  of  interest,  real
or apparent, would be in-
volved.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an Development  Action
of 1968, as amended, 12
U.S.C. 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall, to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low- and very-low
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The Bidder/Proposer  is
required to complete and
submit  the  Declaration
of Intent to Comply with
Section 3 Requirements
–  Required  Contract
Forms  and  Certif ica-
tions, certifying that they
intend  to  comply  with
the  requirement  of  the
Secretary  of  Labor  and
the  latest  amendments
to:  Executive  Orders
11246 and 11375, as sup-
plemented  in  Depart-
ment  of  Labor  regula-
tions  (41  CFR  chapter
60); the Copeland “Anti-
Kickback: Act (18 U.S.C.
s847)  as  supplemented
in  Department  of  Labor
regulations (29 CFR part
3);  Sections  3  of  the
Housing and Urban De-
velopment  Act  of  1968
(12  U.S.C.  s  1701  et
seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights  Act  of  1964  (42
U.S.C.  s2000);  Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community De-
velopment  Act  of  1974
(42  U.S.C.  s  5301  et
seq.); the Age Discrimin-
ation  Act  of  1975  (42
U.S.C.  s701  et  seq.).
Contractor  agrees  to
comply with the require-
ments of all other applic-
able  federal,  state  and
local  laws  and  regula-
tions.
Prospective bidders/pro-
posers  shall  carefully
read  the  information
within  this  bid  docu-
ment including the Sec-
tion  3  Provisions  for
H o u s i n g  a n d  C o m -
munity Development As-
sistance  and  Publ ic
Housing Assistance, as
amended. Proposals that
fail  to  comply  with  the
requirement of Section 3
will  be considered non-
respons ive  and  ex -
cluded from further con-
sideration.
To comply with SB 854,
beginning January 1, 2015
the following applies:
A. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be listed
on a bid proposal for pub-
lic works project (submit-
ted on or after March 1,
2015) unless registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations (DIR)
pursuant to Labor Code
section 1725.5 [with lim-
ited exceptions from this
requirement for bid pur-
poses only under Labor
Code section 1771.1(a)].
B. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be awar-
ded a contract for public
works on a public works
project awarded on or after
April 1, 2015, unless re-
gistered with the DIR.
C. The project is subject to
compliance monitoring and
enforcement by the DIR.
D. Require the prime con-
tractor to post job site no-
tices prescribed by regula-
tion (regulation not cre-
ated yet) or the City must
post the notices itself.
The Contractor shall fill
in the Department of In-
dustrial  Relations (DIR)
Contractor  Registration
Number  Form provided
in  Appendix  “C”  and
submit it with the sealed
Bid.
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Bids must be prepared on
the approved Proposal
forms or copies thereof in
conformance with the In-
structions to Bidders and
submitted in a sealed en-
velope plainly marked on
the outside as follows:
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
p rovide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
RFI’S/QUESTIONS: The
deadline to submit All
RFI’s/Questions shall be
s u b m i t t e d p r i o r t o
Thursday, November 09,
2023  at  1:30  pm  to  the
OpenGov  website. Late
submittal shall not be con-
sidered.
SUBSTITUTIONS: All re-
q u e s t e d “ o r e q u a l ”
products shall be submit-
ted prior to the bid date for
review and evaluation with
a subsequent determina-
tion by the City if the “or
equal” product is satisfact-
ory for consideration and
be allowed to submitted
with the bid. The  dead-
line to submit “or equal”
items shall be Thursday,
November  09,  2023  at
1:30 pm to the OpenGov
website.  Late  “or  equal
submittals shall be rejec-
ted.
COMPLETION OF WORK:
The City is scheduling the
award of contract for Janu-
ary 9, 2023 On January
10, 2023 the City will is-
sue the Notice to Contract
Award requesting the con-
tractor to submit contracts,
bonds and insurance certi-
ficates and submitted to
the City within fifteen (15)
calendar days.
In order to accommodate
weed abatement proced-
ures. The City will issue a
Weed Abatement Proced-
ure Notice to Proceed for a
duration of twenty-working
(20) days. When this is
complete, the City will is-
sue the construction No-
tice to Proceed for a dura-
tion of one hundred and
twenty (120) working days
(Monday – Friday), as stip-
ulated in the written No-
tice to Proceed issued by
the City Engineer. Failure
to complete the Work with-
in the time set forth herein
will result in the imposition
of liquidated damages for
each day of delay, in the
amount set forth in Sec-
tion 39 of the General Pro-
visions.
OBTAINING PLANS AND
SPECIFICATIONS: Plans,
Specifications, and any
project addenda are avail-
able for download the new
City platform OpenGov, ht-
tps://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, and on the city’s
website, www.cityoflap-
alma.org. All prospective
bidders are responsible for
registering on OpenGov
and checking the City’s
website for the issuance of
any project addenda prior
to the bid opening for in-
clusion as part of the bid
proposal. Due to the post-
ing of the documents on
the city website, OpenGov
will maintain a plan holder
list. For project informa-
tion, please contact the of-
fice of the City Engineer at
(714) 690-3310.
BONDS: Pursuant to the
Instructions to Bidders,
each proposal shall be ac-
companied by cash or by a
cashier's or certified check
or by a bid bond in the
amount of ten  percent
(10%) of the amount of the
bid price payable to the
City of La Palma as a
guarantee that the bidder,
if his or her proposal is ac-
cepted, will promptly ex-
ecute the contract, secure
payment of workers’ com-
pensation insurance and
furnish a satisfactory faith-
ful performance bond in
the amount of one  hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price and a
labor and material bond
in the amount of one hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price.
SUBSTITUTION OF SE-
CURITIES: The Contract-
or may substitute securit-
ies for any monies with-
held by the City to ensure
performance under the
contract in compliance
with the requirements of
Public Contract Code Sec-
tion 22300 and the "Sub-
stitution of Securities" pro-
visions of the General Pro-
visions.
WAGE RATES: As re-
quired by Section 1773 of
the California Labor Code,
the Director of the Depart-
ment of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia has determined the
general prevailing rates of
wages in the locality in
which Work is scheduled
to be performed. Copies of
the wage rate determina-
tions, entitled PREVAIL-
ING WAGE SCALE, are
mainta ined at the La
Palma City Hall, 7822
Walker Street, La Palma,
California, and are avail-
able to any interested
party upon request. The
Contractor shall post a
copy of this document at
each job site. The Con-
tractor and any subcon-
tractor under it shall pay
not less than the specified
prevailing rates of wages
to all workers employed in
the execution of the Con-
tract.
C O N T R A C T O R ' S L I -
CENSE: In accordance
with the provisions of Cali-
fornia Publ ic Contract
Code Section 3300, the
City requires that the bid-
der possess the following
c l a s s i f i c a t i o n o f
contractor’s license at the
time that the bid proposal
is submitted: Class A, or
Specialty. If the license
classif ication specif ied
hereinabove is that of a
“specialty contractor” as
defined in Section 7058 of
the California Business
and Professions Code, the
specialty contractor awar-
ded the Contract for this
Work shall itself construct
a majority of the Work, in
accordance with the provi-
sions of California Busi-
ness and Professions
Code Section 7059. Each
bidder shall clearly write or
type their contractor’s li-
cense number on the out-
side of the bidding envel-
ope.
CONTRACTORS REGIS-
TRATION: In accordance
with the provisions of
L a b o r C o d e s e c t i o n
1771.1, a contractor or
subcontractor shall not be
qualified to (a) bid on or be
listed in a bid proposal or
(b) engage in the perform-
ance of this Work, unless
currently registered and
qualified to perform the
Work pursuant to Labor
Code Section 1725.5.
COMPLIANCE MONITOR-
ING AND ENFORCE-
MENT: Contractor’s per-
formance of the Work de-
scribed in this Notice Invit-
ing Bids is subject to com-
pliance monitoring and en-
forcement by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations.
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY:
The City hereby notifies all
bidders that it will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of sex,
race, color, or national ori-
gin in consideration for an
award.
C ITY 'S RIGHTS RE-
SERVED: The City of La
Palma reserves the right to
reject any and all propos-
als or bids, including the
bid of a bidder who has
been delinquent or unfaith-
ful in any former contract
with the City of La Palma,
or to waive any irregularit-
ies or informalities in any
bids or in the bidding,
should it deem this neces-
sary for the public good.
No bidder may withdraw
his or her bid for a period
of sixty (60) days after the
date from the opening
thereof.
This  is  a  federally  as-
sisted construction con-
tract .  Federal  Labor
Standards  Provisions,
including  prevai l ing
wage  requirements  of
the Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts (DBRA) will be
enforced. In the event of
a conflict  between Fed-
eral  and  State  wage
rates,  the  higher  of  the
two will  prevail.
The Contractor’s duty to
pay  State  prevai l ing
wages can be found un-
der Labor Code Section
1770  et  seq.  and  Labor
Code Sections 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties  for  failure  to  pay
prevailing  wages  and
employee  apprentices
including forfeitures and
debarment.
The  current  Federal
Wage  Decision  is  con-
tained  herein,  in  Ap-
pendix “B”, and may be
updated  via  addendum
to this bid package with-
in ten (10) days prior to
bid opening and can be
f o u n d  a t
http://www.wdol.gov/wd
ol/scafiles/davisbacon/c
a/html.  The  applicable
Federal  Wage  Decision
will be incorporated into
the  contract.  The  State
wage rates are available
o n l i n e  a t
http://www/dir.ca.gov/DL
S R / P W D / i n d e x . h t m .
Lower State wage rates
for  work classifications
not specifically included
in the Federal Wage De-
cision  are  not  accept-
able.  The  Contractor
may  request  an  Addi-
tional Classification and
Rate  if  work  classifica-
tion cannot be located in
the  Federal  Wage  De-
cision.
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t  a n d  a l l
Bidder/Proposers  must
commit to achieving es-
tablished requirements,
including  benchmarks,
for  Section  3  workers
and Targeted Section 3
workers  to  be  con-
sidered  a  Section  3  re-
sponsive  bidder/pro-
poser and eligible for  a
contract  award.
Assignment:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of Part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Contractor's License:
When federal funds are
being used, at the time of
“Award of the Contract”,
the Prime Contractor must
have a valid California
State Contractor's License
with a classification of “A
or  Specialty” in accord-
ance with provisions of
Chapter 9, Division 111,
Sections 7000 through
7145 of the Business and
Professions Code of the
State of California and the
Prime Contractor shall
warrant that it and all sub-
contractors are properly li-
censed, which includes
each entity having a local
business license. When
federal funds are not be-
ing used, a bid by a con-
tractor who is not properly
l icensed must be con-
sidered nonresponsive,
will be rejected by the City,
and the unlicensed con-
tractor may be subject to
discipline by the state.
Contractor  Eligibil ity
Check:
Prior to awarding a con-
tract, the City will verify the
contractor's (1) status with
the California Department
of Industrial Relations at
http://www.cslb.ca.gov and
https://efiling.dir.ca.gov
and (2 ) e l i g ib i l i t y a t
http://www.dir.ca.gov/dlse/
debar.html and with the
online excluded parties list
at the federal System For
A w a r d M a n a g e m e n t
( S A M ) w e b s i t e
h t t ps : / /www.sam.gov .
Affirmative Action:
All bidders are on notice
that the City will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of reli-
gious creed, sex, race, col-
or, national origin in con-
sideration for an award.
Moreover, no contractor
receiving the award may
discriminate nor permit
others he may hire to en-
gage in, discrimination in
the employment of per-
sons because of their
race, religious creed, col-
or, or national origin, an-
cestry, physical disability,
mental disability, medical
condition, genetic informa-
tion, marital status, sex,
gender, gender identity,
gender expression, age,
sexual orientation, or milit-
ary or veteran status, ex-
cept as provided in Gov-
ernment Code Section
12940.
DATED: October 18, 2023
CITY OF LA PALMA,
CALIFORNIA
By:__________________
___________
Andy Ramirez
Public Works and Com-
munity Services Director

News Enterprise
10/18/2023-135860

Legals-NE

CITY OF LA PALMA
NOTICE INVITING BIDS
VARIOUS MEDIAN IS-

LANDS PROJECT
(CITY PROJECT NO. ST-

371)
NOTICE INVITING BIDS:
Sealed proposals will be
received online via the
Ci ty ’ s e -Procurement
P o r t a l ( “ P o r t a l ” ) a t
https://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, office of the City En-
gineer, Community Ser-
vices Office, La Palma,
California, until 1:30  PM
on Thursday, November
30, 2023 for furnishing of
all labor, materials and
equipment for VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No. ST-371 (the “Project”).
The  Bids  shall  be  sub-
mitted to the City Engin-
eer  through  the  Open-
Gov.com  platform. All
prospective bidders are re-
sponsible for registering
on OpenGov and check-
ing the City’s website for
the issuance of any project
addenda prior to the bid
opening for inclusion as
part of the bid proposal.
Due to the posting of the
documents on the city
website, OpenGov wil l
maintain a plan holder list.
For project information,
please contact the office of
the City Engineer at (714)
690-3310. Sealed  bids
will  NOT  be  accepted.
The  BIDS  for  VARIOUS
M E D I A N  I S L A N D S
PROJECT,  City  Project
No.  ST-371,  SHALL  BE
SUBMITTED  THROUGH
OpenGov.
D E S C R I P T I O N O F
WORK: The work in-
cludes rehabilitation of the
La Palma Avenue Median
Islands from the west city
limits to the east city limits;
Walker Avenue Median Is-
lands from Orangethorpe
Avenue southerly; and
Moody Street from Cres-
cent Ave to Houston Ave
including the removal of
existing landscaping/irriga-
tion, tree removals, hard-
scape removals and re-
placement, installation of
new drip irrigation system,
planting of new trees along
w i t h n e w
landscaping/hardscaping
in the medians islands.
Also, included are new
median islands on Moody
Street from Malaga Aven-
ue to La Luna Avenue with
complete irrigation and
landscaping per the con-
tract plans and specifica-
tions.
This project is NOT sub-
ject to a project labor, sta-
bilization, collective bar-
gaining or community work
force agreements
The City received Feder-
al Funding through HUD
for  this  project.  There-
fore,  Federal  Davis  Ba-
con  wage  rates  are  ap-
pl ied  to  the  project.
However,  If  the  State
Prevailing  Wages  are
higher than the Federal
Wage Rates,  the higher
are to be applied the that
specific classification.
A  MANDATORY  AND
SECTIO N  3  PRE-BID
MEETING,  will  be  held
on Tuesday October 24,
2023  at  2:30  pm  at  the
City  of  Palma  Com-
munity Services Offices,
7821  Walker  Street,  La
Palma, CA 90623. In or-
der to receive considera-
tion for the Section 3 bid
preference,  a  bidder
must complete, sign and
submit  the  following
forms with their bid pro-
posal: 1) Section 3 Busi-
ness Certification Form,
and (b) Section 3 Resid-
ent Certification form(s).
A  reasonable  bid  must
be with the Zone of Con-
sideration at the time of
bid  evaluation. All con-
tractors are required to
have a representative at-
tend and sign in at the pre-
bid meeting. Failure to
comply with this attend-
ance and sign in require-
ments will result in the
Contactor’s proposal be-
ing found non-responsive
to the required proced-
ures.
Prevailing  Wage  State-
ment:
This contract will be fun-
ded in whole or in part with
Federal housing and com-
munity development funds.
Federal Labor Standard
Provisions, including pre-
vailing wage requirements
of Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts will be enforced.
A copy of the Federal
Wage Decision applicable
to this project is included
in the Bid Documents in
Appendix “B”. This project
is a public work in the
State of California, funded
in whole or in part with
public funds. Therefore,
the higher of the two ap-
plicable prevailing wage
rates federal or state, will
be enforced. The Contract-
or’s duty to pay State pre-
vai l ing wages can be
found under Labor Code
Section 1770 et seq. Labor
Code Section 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties for failure to pay pre-
vailing wages and to em-
ploy apprentices, includ-
ing forfeitures and de-
barment. State Wage De-
cision is on file at the City
Clerk’s office and is also
a v a i l a b l e O n l i n e a t
h t tp : / /d i r . ca .gov /d is r / .
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Section 1777.5, 1777.6
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title
8, California Administra-
tion Code, Section 200 et
seq. to ensure compliance
and complete understand-
ing of the law regarding
apprentices.
Fair  Employment  Prac-
tices/Equal Opportunity
Acts:
In the performance of this
Agreement, Contractor
shall comply with all ap-
plicable provisions of the
California Fair Employ-
ment Practices Act (Cali-
fornia Government Code
Section §§ C – 32 B-3
12940 et seq.), the applic-
able equal employment
provisions of the Civi l
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000e et seq.),
and the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990 (42
U.S.C. §§ 12101, et seq.).
Labor  Standards  and
Civil  Rights:
Contractor agrees to com-
ply with the requirements
of the Secretary of Labor
and the latest amend-
ments to: Executive Or-
ders 11246 and 11375, as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(41 C.F.R. chapter 60); the
Copeland “Anti-Kickback”
Act (18 U.S.C. § 847) as
supplemented in Depart-
ment of Labor regulations
(29 C.F.R. part 3); Section
3 of the Housing and Urb-
an Development Act of
1968 (12 U.S.C. §§ 1701
et seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights Act of 1964 (42
U.S.C. §§ 2000); Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community Devel-
opment Act of 1974 (42
U.S.C. §§ 5301 et seq.);
the Age Discrimination Act
of 1975 (42 U.S.C. §§
6101 et seq.); and Section
504 of the Rehabilitation
Act of 1973 (29 U.S.C. §§
701 et seq.). Contractor
agrees to comply with the
requirements of all other
applicable federal, State
and local laws and regula-
tions.
State Labor Standards &
Wage Requirements:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor
and all subcontractors
agree to follow the State
Labor standards. State
Labor standards provi-
sions, including prevailing
wage requirements, will be
enforced such that the
general rate of per diem
wages (prevailing wage)
shall be paid for each
craft, classification, or type
of worker needed to ex-
ecute the contract to all
workers employed in the
execution of the contract.
All contractors and sub-
contractors must furnish
electronic certified payroll
records directly to the
Labor Commissioner (aka
Division of Labor Stand-
ards Enforcement) as fur-
ther described in Article
VIII of the Agreement. The
State General Prevailing
Wage Determination is as
established by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations (available at
http://www.dir.ca.gov/DLS
R/PWD/index.htm). The
prevailing rate of per diem
wages are on file at the
City.
Section 3 Statement:
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t a n d a l l
Bidders/Proposers must
commit to achieving estab-
lished requirements, in-
cluding benchmarks, for
Section 3 workers and
Targeted Section 3 work-
ers to be considered a re-
sponsive bidder/proposer
and eligible for a contract
award. Section 3 Require-
ments, Clause, and Pro-
gram Forms can be loc-
ated in Appendix “A” of
this document.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an  Development  Act  of
1968,  as  amended,  12
U.S.C 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low and very low-
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The parties to this con-
tract  agree  to  comply
with  HUD’s  regulations
in  24  CFR  part  135,
which  implement  Sec-
tion 3. As evidenced by
their  execution  of  this
contract,  the  parties  to
this contract certify that
they  are  under  no  con-
tractual or other impedi-
ment that would prevent
them  from  complying
with the part 135 regula-
tions.
The Contractor agrees to
send  to  each  labor  or-
ganization or represent-
ative  of  workers  with
which  the  Contractor
has a collective bargain-
ing  agreement  or  other
understanding, if any, a
notice advising the labor
organization or workers’
representative  of  the
Contractor’s  commit-
ments  under  this  Sec-
tion  3  clause,  and  will
post  copies  of  the  no-
t ice  in  conspicuous
places  at  the  work  site
where  both  employees
and applicants for train-
ing and employment po-
sitions  can  see  the  no-
tice.  The  notices  shall
describe  the  Section  3
preference,  shall  set
forth  minimum  number
and job titles subject to
hire,  availability  of  ap-
prenticeships and train-
ing positions, the quali-
fications  of  each;  and
the name and location of
person(s) taking applica-
tions for each of the pos-
itions;  and  the  anticip-
ated date the work shall
begin.
The Contractor agrees to
include  this  Section  3
clause in every sub-con-
tract  subject  to  compli-
ance with regulation sin
24  CFR  part  135,  and
agrees to take appropri-
ate  action,  as  provided
in  the  applicable  provi-
sion of the sub-contract-
or  in  this  Section  3
clause,  upon  a  finding
that  the  sub-contractor
is in violation of the reg-
ulation  in  24  CFR  part
135. The Contractor will
not  sub-contract  with
a n y  s u b - c o n t r a c t o r
where  the  Contractor
has notice or knowledge
that  the  sub-contractor
has been found in viola-
tion of the regulation in
24 CFR part 135.
The Contractor will certi-
fy  that  any  vacant  em-
ployment  positions,  in-
cluding  training  posi-
tions,  that  are  filled  (1)
after  the  Contractor  is
selected  but  before  the
contract  is  executed,
and (2) with persons oth-
er  than  those  to  whom
the  regulations  of  24
CFR part 135 require em-
ployment  opportunities
to be directed, were not
filled  to  circumvent  the
Contractor’s  obligation
under  24  CFR part  135.
Noncompl iance  wi th
HUD’s regulations in 24
CFR part 135 may result
in  sanctions,  termina-
tion of  this contract  for
default,  and  debarment
or  suspension  from fu-
ture  HUD assisted con-
tracts.
With  respect  to  work
performed  in  connec-
t ion  wi th  Sect ion  3
covered Indian Housing
Assistance, Section 7(b)
of  the  Indian  Self-De-
termination and Educa-
tion Assistance Act  (25
U.S.C.  450e)  also  ap-
plies  to  the  work  to  be
performed  under  this
contract. Section 7(b) re-
q u i r e s  t h a t  t o  t h e
greatest  extent  feasible
(i) preference and oppor-
tunities for training and
employment shall be giv-
en  to  Indians,  and  (ii)
preference is the award
of  contracts  and  sub-
contracts shall be given
to  Indian  organizations
and  Indian-owned  Eco-
n o m i c  E n t e r p r i s e s .
Parties  to  this  contract
that  are  subject  to  the
provisions of  Section 3
and section 7(b) agree to
comply with Section 3 to
the  maximum  extent
feasib le ,  but  not  in
derogation  of  compli-
ance  with  section  7(b).
Federal  Forms  to  be
Submitted  with  Bid:
The forms contained in
Appendix C, including
Section 3 forms, must be
completed, and included
with the bid submittal.
Award of Contract:
The following are condi-
tions to the award of the
contract:
i. for any bid submitted on
or after March 1, 2015,
each contractor and sub-
contractor listed on the bid
must be registered with
the Department of Industri-
al Relations pursuant to
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1725.5, subject to the lim-
ited exceptions set forth in
L a b o r C o d e S e c t i o n
1771.1(a) (regarding the
submission of a bid as au-
thorized by Business &
Professions Code Section
7029.1 or Public Contract
Code Section 10164 or
20103.5, provided the con-
tractor is registered to per-
form public work pursuant
to Section 1725.5 at the
time the contract is awar-
ded); and
ii. ii. for any contract awar-
ded on or after April 1,
2015, no contractor or
subcontractor may be
awarded this contract un-
less the contractor and
each subcontractor listed
on the bid is registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations pursu-
ant to Section 1725.5.
Apprent iceship  Pro-
gram:
Attention is directed to
Sections 1777.5, 1777.6,
and 1777.7 of the Califor-
nia Labor Code and Title 8
of the California Code of
Regulations, Section 200,
et seq., to ensure compli-
ance and complete under-
standing of the law regard-
ing apprentices.
Federal  Labor  Stand-
ards  Provision:
Refer to the HUD-4010
forms are located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Current  Federal  DOL
Wage  Decision:
Refer to the Federal Wage
Decision, located in Ap-
pendix “D” of this docu-
ment.
Federal EEO and Affirm-
ative  Action  Require-
ments:
Refer to the Federal Equal
Employment Opportunity
and Affirmative Action Re-
quirements located in Ap-
pendix “c” of this docu-
ment.
Contracting with Small &
Minority Firms, Women’s
Business Enterprise:
Refer to the Contracting
wi th Smal l Bus iness ,
Minority Firms, Women's
Business Enterprise, and
Labor Surplus Area Firms,
Federal Contract Provi-
sion, located in Appendix
“C” of this document.
Compliance  with  Clean
Air  and  Water  Acts:
Refer to the Compliance
with Clean Air and Water
Acts, Federal Contract
Provision, located in Ap-
pendix “C” of this docu-
ment.
Conflict of Interest:
In  the  procurement  of
supplies,  equipment,
construction,  and  ser-
vice  of  sub-recipients,
the  conflict-of-interest
provision  in  24  CFR
85.36,  OMB  Circular  A-
110 and 24 CFR 570.611
shall  apply. No employ-
ee, officer or agent of the
sub-recipient shall parti-
cipate  in  the  selection,
award, or administration
of a contract supported
by  federal  funds  in  a
conflict  of  interest,  real
or apparent, would be in-
volved.
The  work  to  be  per-
formed  under  this  con-
tract is subject to the re-
quirements of Section 3
of the Housing and Urb-
an Development  Action
of 1968, as amended, 12
U.S.C. 1701u (Section 3).
The purpose of Section 3
is to ensure that employ-
ment and other econom-
ic  opportunities  gener-
ated by HUD assistance
or HUD-assisted projects
covered  by  Section  3,
shall, to the greatest ex-
tent  feasible,  be  direc-
ted to low- and very-low
income persons, particu-
larly persons who are re-
cipients  of  HUD assist-
ance  for  housing.
The  Bidder/Proposer  is
required to complete and
submit  the  Declaration
of Intent to Comply with
Section 3 Requirements
–  Required  Contract
Forms  and  Certif ica-
tions, certifying that they
intend  to  comply  with
the  requirement  of  the
Secretary  of  Labor  and
the  latest  amendments
to:  Executive  Orders
11246 and 11375, as sup-
plemented  in  Depart-
ment  of  Labor  regula-
tions  (41  CFR  chapter
60); the Copeland “Anti-
Kickback: Act (18 U.S.C.
s847)  as  supplemented
in  Department  of  Labor
regulations (29 CFR part
3);  Sections  3  of  the
Housing and Urban De-
velopment  Act  of  1968
(12  U.S.C.  s  1701  et
seq.); Title VI of the Civil
Rights  Act  of  1964  (42
U.S.C.  s2000);  Section
109 of Title I of the Hous-
ing and Community De-
velopment  Act  of  1974
(42  U.S.C.  s  5301  et
seq.); the Age Discrimin-
ation  Act  of  1975  (42
U.S.C.  s701  et  seq.).
Contractor  agrees  to
comply with the require-
ments of all other applic-
able  federal,  state  and
local  laws  and  regula-
tions.
Prospective bidders/pro-
posers  shall  carefully
read  the  information
within  this  bid  docu-
ment including the Sec-
tion  3  Provisions  for
H o u s i n g  a n d  C o m -
munity Development As-
sistance  and  Publ ic
Housing Assistance, as
amended. Proposals that
fail  to  comply  with  the
requirement of Section 3
will  be considered non-
respons ive  and  ex -
cluded from further con-
sideration.
To comply with SB 854,
beginning January 1, 2015
the following applies:
A. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be listed
on a bid proposal for pub-
lic works project (submit-
ted on or after March 1,
2015) unless registered
with the Department of In-
dustrial Relations (DIR)
pursuant to Labor Code
section 1725.5 [with lim-
ited exceptions from this
requirement for bid pur-
poses only under Labor
Code section 1771.1(a)].
B. No contractor or sub-
contractor may be awar-
ded a contract for public
works on a public works
project awarded on or after
April 1, 2015, unless re-
gistered with the DIR.
C. The project is subject to
compliance monitoring and
enforcement by the DIR.
D. Require the prime con-
tractor to post job site no-
tices prescribed by regula-
tion (regulation not cre-
ated yet) or the City must
post the notices itself.
The Contractor shall fill
in the Department of In-
dustrial  Relations (DIR)
Contractor  Registration
Number  Form provided
in  Appendix  “C”  and
submit it with the sealed
Bid.
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Bids must be prepared on
the approved Proposal
forms or copies thereof in
conformance with the In-
structions to Bidders and
submitted in a sealed en-
velope plainly marked on
the outside as follows:
Any contract entered into
pursuant to this notice will
incorporate the provisions
of the State Labor Code.
Pursuant to the provisions
of Section 1773.2 of the
Labor Code of the State of
California, the minimum
prevai l ing rate of per
hourly wages for each
craft, classification or type
of workman needed to ex-
ecute the contract shall be
those determined by the
Director of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia, which are on file at
the City Hall, City of Bell
Gardens, 7100 South Gar-
field Avenue, Bell Gar-
dens, California 90201,
and are available to any
interested party on re-
quest.
Attention is directed to the
prov is ions of Sect ion
1777.5 (Chapter 1141,
Statutes of 1968) and
1777.5 of the Labor Code
concerning the employ-
ment of apprentices by the
Contractor or any such
subcontractor under him.
Affirmative action to en-
sure against discrimina-
tion in employment prac-
tices on the basis of race,
color, national origin, age,
marital status, ancestry,
sex, religion, or handicap
will also be required.
The AGENCY will deduct
5 percent retention from all
progress payments as
specified in Section 9-3.2
of these specifications.
The Contractor may sub-
stitute an escrow holder
surety of equal value to
the retention. The Con-
tractor shall be beneficial
owner of the surety and
shall receive any interest
thereon. Contractor shall
provide AGENCY with
weekly payroll reports.
The AGENCY hereby af-
firmatively ensures that
minority business enter-
prises will be afforded full
opportunity to submit bids
in response to this notice
and will not be discrimin-
ated against on the basis
of race, color, national ori-
gin, age, marital status,
ancestry, sex, religion,
sexual orientation or han-
dicap in any consideration
leading to the award of
contract.
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or material pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
RFI’S/QUESTIONS: The
deadline to submit All
RFI’s/Questions shall be
s u b m i t t e d p r i o r t o
Thursday, November 09,
2023  at  1:30  pm  to  the
OpenGov  website. Late
submittal shall not be con-
sidered.
SUBSTITUTIONS: All re-
q u e s t e d “ o r e q u a l ”
products shall be submit-
ted prior to the bid date for
review and evaluation with
a subsequent determina-
tion by the City if the “or
equal” product is satisfact-
ory for consideration and
be allowed to submitted
with the bid. The  dead-
line to submit “or equal”
items shall be Thursday,
November  09,  2023  at
1:30 pm to the OpenGov
website.  Late  “or  equal
submittals shall be rejec-
ted.
COMPLETION OF WORK:
The City is scheduling the
award of contract for Janu-
ary 9, 2023 On January
10, 2023 the City will is-
sue the Notice to Contract
Award requesting the con-
tractor to submit contracts,
bonds and insurance certi-
ficates and submitted to
the City within fifteen (15)
calendar days.
In order to accommodate
weed abatement proced-
ures. The City will issue a
Weed Abatement Proced-
ure Notice to Proceed for a
duration of twenty-working
(20) days. When this is
complete, the City will is-
sue the construction No-
tice to Proceed for a dura-
tion of one hundred and
twenty (120) working days
(Monday – Friday), as stip-
ulated in the written No-
tice to Proceed issued by
the City Engineer. Failure
to complete the Work with-
in the time set forth herein
will result in the imposition
of liquidated damages for
each day of delay, in the
amount set forth in Sec-
tion 39 of the General Pro-
visions.
OBTAINING PLANS AND
SPECIFICATIONS: Plans,
Specifications, and any
project addenda are avail-
able for download the new
City platform OpenGov, ht-
tps://procurement.open-
gov.com/portal/cityoflap-
alma, and on the city’s
website, www.cityoflap-
alma.org. All prospective
bidders are responsible for
registering on OpenGov
and checking the City’s
website for the issuance of
any project addenda prior
to the bid opening for in-
clusion as part of the bid
proposal. Due to the post-
ing of the documents on
the city website, OpenGov
will maintain a plan holder
list. For project informa-
tion, please contact the of-
fice of the City Engineer at
(714) 690-3310.
BONDS: Pursuant to the
Instructions to Bidders,
each proposal shall be ac-
companied by cash or by a
cashier's or certified check
or by a bid bond in the
amount of ten  percent
(10%) of the amount of the
bid price payable to the
City of La Palma as a
guarantee that the bidder,
if his or her proposal is ac-
cepted, will promptly ex-
ecute the contract, secure
payment of workers’ com-
pensation insurance and
furnish a satisfactory faith-
ful performance bond in
the amount of one  hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price and a
labor and material bond
in the amount of one hun-
dred  percent  (100%) of
the total bid price.
SUBSTITUTION OF SE-
CURITIES: The Contract-
or may substitute securit-
ies for any monies with-
held by the City to ensure
performance under the
contract in compliance
with the requirements of
Public Contract Code Sec-
tion 22300 and the "Sub-
stitution of Securities" pro-
visions of the General Pro-
visions.
WAGE RATES: As re-
quired by Section 1773 of
the California Labor Code,
the Director of the Depart-
ment of Industrial Rela-
tions of the State of Cali-
fornia has determined the
general prevailing rates of
wages in the locality in
which Work is scheduled
to be performed. Copies of
the wage rate determina-
tions, entitled PREVAIL-
ING WAGE SCALE, are
mainta ined at the La
Palma City Hall, 7822
Walker Street, La Palma,
California, and are avail-
able to any interested
party upon request. The
Contractor shall post a
copy of this document at
each job site. The Con-
tractor and any subcon-
tractor under it shall pay
not less than the specified
prevailing rates of wages
to all workers employed in
the execution of the Con-
tract.
C O N T R A C T O R ' S L I -
CENSE: In accordance
with the provisions of Cali-
fornia Publ ic Contract
Code Section 3300, the
City requires that the bid-
der possess the following
c l a s s i f i c a t i o n o f
contractor’s license at the
time that the bid proposal
is submitted: Class A, or
Specialty. If the license
classif ication specif ied
hereinabove is that of a
“specialty contractor” as
defined in Section 7058 of
the California Business
and Professions Code, the
specialty contractor awar-
ded the Contract for this
Work shall itself construct
a majority of the Work, in
accordance with the provi-
sions of California Busi-
ness and Professions
Code Section 7059. Each
bidder shall clearly write or
type their contractor’s li-
cense number on the out-
side of the bidding envel-
ope.
CONTRACTORS REGIS-
TRATION: In accordance
with the provisions of
L a b o r C o d e s e c t i o n
1771.1, a contractor or
subcontractor shall not be
qualified to (a) bid on or be
listed in a bid proposal or
(b) engage in the perform-
ance of this Work, unless
currently registered and
qualified to perform the
Work pursuant to Labor
Code Section 1725.5.
COMPLIANCE MONITOR-
ING AND ENFORCE-
MENT: Contractor’s per-
formance of the Work de-
scribed in this Notice Invit-
ing Bids is subject to com-
pliance monitoring and en-
forcement by the Califor-
nia Department of Industri-
al Relations.
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY:
The City hereby notifies all
bidders that it will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of sex,
race, color, or national ori-
gin in consideration for an
award.
C ITY 'S RIGHTS RE-
SERVED: The City of La
Palma reserves the right to
reject any and all propos-
als or bids, including the
bid of a bidder who has
been delinquent or unfaith-
ful in any former contract
with the City of La Palma,
or to waive any irregularit-
ies or informalities in any
bids or in the bidding,
should it deem this neces-
sary for the public good.
No bidder may withdraw
his or her bid for a period
of sixty (60) days after the
date from the opening
thereof.
This  is  a  federally  as-
sisted construction con-
tract .  Federal  Labor
Standards  Provisions,
including  prevai l ing
wage  requirements  of
the Davis-Bacon and Re-
lated Acts (DBRA) will be
enforced. In the event of
a conflict  between Fed-
eral  and  State  wage
rates,  the  higher  of  the
two will  prevail.
The Contractor’s duty to
pay  State  prevai l ing
wages can be found un-
der Labor Code Section
1770  et  seq.  and  Labor
Code Sections 1775 and
1777.7 outline the penal-
ties  for  failure  to  pay
prevailing  wages  and
employee  apprentices
including forfeitures and
debarment.
The  current  Federal
Wage  Decision  is  con-
tained  herein,  in  Ap-
pendix “B”, and may be
updated  via  addendum
to this bid package with-
in ten (10) days prior to
bid opening and can be
f o u n d  a t
http://www.wdol.gov/wd
ol/scafiles/davisbacon/c
a/html.  The  applicable
Federal  Wage  Decision
will be incorporated into
the  contract.  The  State
wage rates are available
o n l i n e  a t
http://www/dir.ca.gov/DL
S R / P W D / i n d e x . h t m .
Lower State wage rates
for  work classifications
not specifically included
in the Federal Wage De-
cision  are  not  accept-
able.  The  Contractor
may  request  an  Addi-
tional Classification and
Rate  if  work  classifica-
tion cannot be located in
the  Federal  Wage  De-
cision.
This is a HUD Section 3
C o n t r a c t  a n d  a l l
Bidder/Proposers  must
commit to achieving es-
tablished requirements,
including  benchmarks,
for  Section  3  workers
and Targeted Section 3
workers  to  be  con-
sidered  a  Section  3  re-
sponsive  bidder/pro-
poser and eligible for  a
contract  award.
Assignment:
In entering into a public
works contract, or a sub-
contract, to supply goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to a public works
contract, the Contractor, or
subcontractor, offers and
agrees to assign to the
awarding body all rights,
title and interest in, and to,
all causes of action it may
have under Section 4 of
the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C.
Section 15) or under the
Cartwright Act (Chapter 2
[commencing with Section
16700] of Part 2 of Divi-
sion 7 of the Business and
Professions Code), arising
from purchases of goods,
services, or materials pur-
suant to the public works
contract or the subcon-
tract. This assignment
shall be made and be-
come effective at the time
the awarding body tenders
final payment to the Con-
tractor, without further ac-
knowledgment by the
par t ies .
Contractor's License:
When federal funds are
being used, at the time of
“Award of the Contract”,
the Prime Contractor must
have a valid California
State Contractor's License
with a classification of “A
or  Specialty” in accord-
ance with provisions of
Chapter 9, Division 111,
Sections 7000 through
7145 of the Business and
Professions Code of the
State of California and the
Prime Contractor shall
warrant that it and all sub-
contractors are properly li-
censed, which includes
each entity having a local
business license. When
federal funds are not be-
ing used, a bid by a con-
tractor who is not properly
l icensed must be con-
sidered nonresponsive,
will be rejected by the City,
and the unlicensed con-
tractor may be subject to
discipline by the state.
Contractor  Eligibil ity
Check:
Prior to awarding a con-
tract, the City will verify the
contractor's (1) status with
the California Department
of Industrial Relations at
http://www.cslb.ca.gov and
https://efiling.dir.ca.gov
and (2 ) e l i g ib i l i t y a t
http://www.dir.ca.gov/dlse/
debar.html and with the
online excluded parties list
at the federal System For
A w a r d M a n a g e m e n t
( S A M ) w e b s i t e
h t t ps : / /www.sam.gov .
Affirmative Action:
All bidders are on notice
that the City will affirmat-
ively insure that in any
contract entered into pur-
suant to this advertise-
ment, minority business
enterprises wil l be af-
forded full opportunity to
submit bids in response to
this invitation and will not
be discriminated against
on the grounds of reli-
gious creed, sex, race, col-
or, national origin in con-
sideration for an award.
Moreover, no contractor
receiving the award may
discriminate nor permit
others he may hire to en-
gage in, discrimination in
the employment of per-
sons because of their
race, religious creed, col-
or, or national origin, an-
cestry, physical disability,
mental disability, medical
condition, genetic informa-
tion, marital status, sex,
gender, gender identity,
gender expression, age,
sexual orientation, or milit-
ary or veteran status, ex-
cept as provided in Gov-
ernment Code Section
12940.
DATED: October 18, 2023
CITY OF LA PALMA,
CALIFORNIA
By:__________________
___________
Andy Ramirez
Public Works and Com-
munity Services Director

News Enterprise
10/18/2023-135860


